New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Contract No. P100.423

Bid Date: 11/17/16

Base Line Item Detail

South State, Inc.

Earle Asphalt Company

Richard E. Pierson Construction Co., Inc.

Agate Construction Co., Inc.

Midlantic Construction LLC

IEW Construction Group Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,725.00 $1,725.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $19,646.56 $19,646.56
2 1D10MOB 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $310,000.00 $310,000.00 $649,495.79 $649,495.79 $700,000.00 $700,000.00 $398,000.00 $398,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $552,209.08 $552,209.08
3 5Q01FOB 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $34,000.00 $34,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $26,687.33 $26,687.33
4 5Q02MFB 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $3,450.00 $48,300.00 $3,000.00 $42,000.00 $2,645.00 $37,030.00 $4,450.00 $62,300.00 $2,827.47 $39,584.58
5 1DO1LAY 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $84,000.00 $84,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $156,385.39 $156,385.39
6 158003M 1,340.00 L.F. Caution Fence $3.00 $4,020.00 $2.80 $3,752.00 $2.05 $2,747.00 $5.00 $6,700.00 $14.00 $18,760.00 $5.63 $7,544.20
7 158006M 1,340.00 L.F. Silt Fence $6.00 $8,040.00 $3.25 $4,355.00 $4.10 $5,494.00 $3.70 $4,958.00 $14.00 $18,760.00 $6.21 $8,321.40
8 158030M 12.00 Unit Inlet Filter Type 2, 2'x4" $50.00 $600.00 $194.00 $2,328.00 $123.00 $1,476.00 $156.00 $1,872.00 $200.00 $2,400.00 $307.58 $3,690.96
9 158063P 1.00 L.S. Concrete Washout System $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $1,370.55 $1,370.55 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,728.33 $4,728.33
10 158072M 2.00 Unit Qil Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $500.00 $1,000.00 $1,015.00 $2,030.00 $570.00 $1,140.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,125.00 $2,250.00 $1,372.35 $2,744.70
11 158095M 63.00 C.Y. Basin Sand Layer $75.00 $4,725.00 $109.00 $6,867.00 $49.20 $3,099.60 $80.00 $5,040.00 $56.00 $3,528.00 $121.69 $7,666.47
12 159003M 37.00 Unit Breakaway Barricade $1.00 $37.00 $1.00 $37.00 $13.15 $486.55 $100.00 $3,700.00 $117.00 $4,329.00 $114.85 $4,249.45
13 159006M 225.00 Unit Drum $1.00 $225.00 $1.00 $225.00 $6.85 $1,541.25 $55.00 $12,375.00 $80.00 $18,000.00 $57.72 $12,987.00
14 159012M 1,784.00 S.F. Construction Signs $9.00 $16,056.00 $1.00 $1,784.00 $10.35 $18,464.40 $10.00 $17,840.00 $14.00 $24,976.00 $20.40 $36,393.60
15 159015M 2 Unit Construction Identification Sign, 4' x 8' $500.00 $1,000.00 $862.00 $1,724.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $1,863.22 $3,726.44
16 159021P 6,760.00 L.F. Construction Barrier Curb $50.00 $338,000.00 $37.78 $255,392.80 $26.30 $177,788.00 $30.00 $202,800.00 $70.00 $473,200.00 $24.26 $163,997.60
17 159027M 5 Unit Flashing Arrow Board, 4' x 8' $500.00 $2,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $0.01 $0.05 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $2,495.17 $12,475.85
18 159030M 6 Unit Portable Variable Message Sign $2,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,940.00 $95,640.00 $6,700.00 $40,200.00 $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $20,000.00 $120,000.00 $12,475.86 $74,855.16
19 159054M 3.00 Unit Temporary Crash Cushion, Inertial Barrier System, 14 Modules $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $16,350.00 $49,050.00 $1,560.00 $4,680.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $32,500.00 $97,500.00 $16,913.67 $50,741.01
20 159108M 2.00 Unit Traffic Control Truck with Mounted Crash Cushion $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $35,420.00 $70,840.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $0.01 $0.02 $24,951.72 $49,903.44
21 159126M 35,000.00 L.F. Temporary Traffic Stripes, 4" $0.25 $8,750.00 $0.25 $8,750.00 $0.30 $10,500.00 $0.29 $10,150.00 $0.30 $10,500.00 $0.28 $9,800.00
22 1HFPOB 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00
23 160007M 1.00 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00
24 201003P 1.00 L.S. Clearing Site $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $223,609.74 $223,609.74
25 203021P 2,225.00 C.Y. 1-14 Soil Aggregate $45.00 $100,125.00 $1.00 $2,225.00 $31.00 $68,975.00 $30.00 $66,750.00 $48.00 $106,800.00 $64.63 $143,801.75
26 302039P 874.00 S.Y. Dense-Graded Aggregate Base Course, 7" Thick $16.00 $13,984.00 $17.33 $15,146.42 $25.00 $21,850.00 $15.00 $13,110.00 $26.00 $22,724.00 $16.34 $14,281.16
27 401009P 25,347.00 S.Y. HMA Milling, 3" Or Less $4.00 $101,388.00 $1.56 $39,541.32 $3.00 $76,041.00 $3.00 $76,041.00 $4.00 $101,388.00 $2.33 $59,058.51
28 401012P 5520 S.Y. HMA Milling, More Than 3" To 6" $9.00 $49,680.00 $1.56 $8,611.20 $5.00 $27,600.00 $5.00 $27,600.00 $7.00 $38,640.00 $4.66 $25,723.20
29 401030M 3650 GAL Tack Coat $0.01 $36.50 $0.01 $36.50 $0.01 $36.50 $3.00 $10,950.00 $4.00 $14,600.00 $0.01 $36.50
30 401054M 3,514.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5 M 64 Surface Course $81.00 $284,634.00 $81.00 $284,634.00 $50.00 $175,700.00 $70.00 $245,980.00 $87.00 $305,718.00 $122.43 $430,219.02
31 401084M 447.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Intermediate Course $115.00 $51,405.00 $94.88 $42,411.36 $95.00 $42,465.00 $75.00 $33,525.00 $94.00 $42,018.00 $151.58 $67,756.26
32 401096M 368.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course $130.00 $47,840.00 $88.00 $32,384.00 $75.30 $27,710.40 $85.00 $31,280.00 $107.00 $39,376.00 $151.58 $55,781.44
33 401108M 5.00 Unit Core Samples, Hot Mix Asphalt $150.00 $750.00 $52.50 $262.50 $134.00 $670.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $312.00 $1,560.00 $174.90 $874.50
34 507059P 2,910.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, HPC $85.00 $247,350.00 $103.35 $300,748.50 $180.00 $523,800.00 $89.00 $258,990.00 $257.00 $747,870.00 $203.81 $593,087.10
35 514021P 1.00 L.S. Construction Access $100.00 $100.00 $9,500.00 $9,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $23,641.60 $23,641.60
36 601248P 695.00 L.F. 15" High Density Polyethylene Pipe $100.00 $69,500.00 $47.20 $32,804.00 $65.00 $45,175.00 $45.00 $31,275.00 $106.00 $73,670.00 $82.42 $57,281.90
37 601370M 3.00 Unit 15" Reinforced Concrete End Section $1,800.00 $5,400.00 $2,114.40 $6,343.20 $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $1,300.00 $3,900.00 $625.00 $1,875.00 $2,159.09 $6,477.27
38 602012M 7.00 Unit Inlet, Type B $5,500.00 $38,500.00 $5,758.00 $40,306.00 $6,000.00 $42,000.00 $5,000.00 $35,000.00 $3,900.00 $27,300.00 $3,892.74 $27,249.18
39 602099M 5.00 Unit Reset Existing Casting $450.00 $2,250.00 $440.00 $2,200.00 $530.00 $2,650.00 $540.00 $2,700.00 $823.00 $4,115.00 $707.64 $3,538.20
40 602171M 22 Unit Reconstructed Inlet, Type D-2, Using New Casting $2,500.00 $55,000.00 $1,500.00 $33,000.00 $1,860.00 $40,920.00 $2,600.00 $57,200.00 $2,100.00 $46,200.00 $2,196.47 $48,322.34
41 602210M 7.00 Unit Bicycle Safe Grate $550.00 $3,850.00 $270.25 $1,891.75 $314.00 $2,198.00 $250.00 $1,750.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $274.00 $1,918.00
42 602216M 12.00 Unit Cleaning Drainage Structure $750.00 $9,000.00 $350.28 $4,203.36 $309.00 $3,708.00 $300.00 $3,600.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $291.49 $3,497.88
43 602223M 1 Unit Outlet Control Structure $5,300.00 $5,300.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00 $14,000.00 $14,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $7,213.66 $7,213.66
44 603035P 77.00 S.Y. Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 48" Thick (D50=24") $300.00 $23,100.00 $297.60 $22,915.20 $182.00 $14,014.00 $200.00 $15,400.00 $176.00 $13,552.00 $124.96 $9,621.92
45 603036P 5.00 S.Y. Riprap Stone Channel Protection, 12" Thick (D50=6") $185.00 $925.00 $1,364.20 $6,821.00 $120.00 $600.00 $450.00 $2,250.00 $400.00 $2,000.00 $256.24 $1,281.20
46 607018P 1,129.00 L.F. 9" X 16" Concrete Vertical Curb $30.00 $33,870.00 $19.33 $21,823.57 $68.90 $77,788.10 $31.00 $34,999.00 $37.00 $41,773.00 $36.73 $41,468.17
47 608003P 688 S.Y. Nonvegetative Surface, Hot Mix Asphalt $35.00 $24,080.00 $43.16 $29,694.08 $24.75 $17,028.00 $31.00 $21,328.00 $45.00 $30,960.00 $34.40 $23,667.20
48 609003M 1500 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $17.00 $25,500.00 $21.00 $31,500.00 $18.05 $27,075.00 $25.00 $37,500.00 $24.00 $36,000.00 $23.32 $34,980.00
49 609027M 1 Unit Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $2,730.00 $2,730.00 $2,840.00 $2,840.00 $2,800.00 $2,800.00 $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $3,031.52 $3,031.52
50 609042M 5.00 Unit Beam Guide Rail Post $70.00 $350.00 $46.20 $231.00 $67.00 $335.00 $95.00 $475.00 $94.00 $470.00 $51.30 $256.50
51 609051M 11.00 Unit Beam Guide Rail Post, 10' Long $75.00 $825.00 $63.00 $693.00 $87.60 $963.60 $130.00 $1,430.00 $107.00 $1,177.00 $69.96 $769.56
52 610006M 28,350.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, 6" $0.40 $11,340.00 $0.41 $11,623.50 $0.50 $14,175.00 $0.47 $13,324.50 $0.30 $8,505.00 $0.45 $12,757.50
53 610009M 1295 S.F. Traffic Markings $2.25 $2,913.75 $2.42 $3,133.90 $3.20 $4,144.00 $3.10 $4,014.50 $3.00 $3,885.00 $2.68 $3,470.60
54 610012M 278 Unit RPM, Mono-Directional, White Lens $25.00 $6,950.00 $27.25 $7,575.50 $26.75 $7,436.50 $26.00 $7,228.00 $33.00 $9,174.00 $30.26 $8,412.28
55 610018M 94 Unit RPM, Mono-Directional, Amber Lens $25.00 $2,350.00 $27.25 $2,561.50 $26.75 $2,514.50 $26.00 $2,444.00 $33.00 $3,102.00 $30.26 $2,844.44
56 610024M 315 Unit Removal Of RPM $1.00 $315.00 $10.90 $3,433.50 $12.79 $4,028.85 $20.00 $6,300.00 $11.00 $3,465.00 $27.30 $8,599.50
57 610033M 1,495.00 L.F. Rumble Strip $2.50 $3,737.50 $8.20 $12,259.00 $2.60 $3,887.00 $7.00 $10,465.00 $3.00 $4,485.00 $2.04 $3,049.80
58 701021P 446 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit $35.00 $15,610.00 $37.80 $16,858.80 $37.10 $16,546.60 $36.00 $16,056.00 $45.00 $20,070.00 $41.97 $18,718.62
59 701102M 2 Unit 18" X 36" Junction Box $1,700.00 $3,400.00 $1,878.00 $3,756.00 $1,840.00 $3,680.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $2,085.34 $4,170.68
60 804006P 3605 S.Y. Topsoiling, 4" Thick $3.00 $10,815.00 $8.25 $29,741.25 $1.80 $6,489.00 $1.75 $6,308.75 $6.00 $21,630.00 $2.04 $7,354.20
61 806027P 3605 S.Y. Fertilizing And Seeding, Type P $0.50 $1,802.50 $1.30 $4,686.50 $1.30 $4,686.50 $1.25 $4,506.25 $2.00 $7,210.00 $1.46 $5,263.30
62 807006M 3367 S.Y. Topsoil Stabilization, Type 2 Mat $5.00 $16,835.00 $3.68 $12,390.56 $3.85 $12,962.95 $3.75 $12,626.25 $5.00 $16,835.00 $4.37 $14,713.79
63 809003M 3,605.00 S.Y. Straw Mulching $0.50 $1,802.50 $0.53 $1,910.65 $0.50 $1,802.50 $0.50 $1,802.50 $1.00 $3,605.00 $0.58 $2,090.90
64 401036M 227.00 GAL Prime Coat $0.01 $2.27 $1.00 $227.00 $3.00 $681.00 $1.00 $227.00 $0.01 $2.27 $1.17 $265.59
65 609021M 1,500.00 L.F. Rub Rail $11.00 $16,500.00 $9.45 $14,175.00 $12.35 $18,525.00 $12.00 $18,000.00 $45.00 $67,500.00 $10.49 $15,735.00
66 8B31MPT 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $394,566.00 $394,566.00 $300,000.00 $300,000.00 $1,603,558.06 $1,603,558.06
67 3B33HMA 12.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M 64 Base Course $215.00 $2,580.00 $500.00 $6,000.00 $118.00 $1,416.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $313.00 $3,756.00 $349.79 $4,197.48
68 5J52BGR 50.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $25.00 $1,250.00 $21.00 $1,050.00 $36.10 $1,805.00 $35.00 $1,750.00 $34.00 $1,700.00 $23.32 $1,166.00
69 5J54BGP 10.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $50.00 $500.00 $52.50 $525.00 $97.90 $979.00 $95.00 $950.00 $69.00 $690.00 $58.30 $583.00
70 5H04CMB 40 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway, Vaiable Height $240.00 $9,600.00 $342.00 $13,680.00 $376.00 $15,040.00 $246.00 $9,840.00 $458.00 $18,320.00 $425.35 $17,014.00
71 202009P 1141 C.Y. Excavation, Unclassified $67.00 $76,447.00 $79.00 $90,139.00 $59.00 $67,319.00 $40.00 $45,640.00 $30.00 $34,230.00 $36.41 $41,543.81
72 601132P 12 L.F. 30" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $255.00 $3,060.00 $243.15 $2,917.80 $120.00 $1,440.00 $285.00 $3,420.00 $265.00 $3,180.00 $510.00 $6,120.00
73 602006P 6 C.Y. Concrete Headwall $850.00 $5,100.00 $1,090.44 $6,542.64 $1,200.00 $7,200.00 $1,375.00 $8,250.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00
80 162005P 1.00 L.S. Vibration Monitoring $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $27,000.00 $27,000.00 $78,236.46 $78,236.46
81 201006P 1.00 L.S. Clearing Site, Bridge 20WB $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,130,000.00 $1,130,000.00 $775,000.00 $775,000.00 $2,400,000.00 $2,400,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $963,611.95 $963,611.95
82 201039P 1.00 L.S. Temporary Shielding $570,000.00 $570,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $617,807.45 $617,807.45
84 501003P 918.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $1.00 $918.00 $1.00 $918.00 $0.01 $9.18 $100.00 $91,800.00 $390.00 $358,020.00 $89.34 $82,014.12
85 502015M 1.00 Unit Static Pile Load Test $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $82,500.00 $82,500.00 $97,000.00 $97,000.00 $39,081.75 $39,081.75
86 502016M 81 Unit 11.875" Diameter Micropiles $5,000.00 $405,000.00 $7,667.35 $621,055.35 $10,500.00 $850,500.00 $8,000.00 $648,000.00 $8,812.00 $713,772.00 $10,019.14 $811,550.34
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P100.423

Bid Date: 11/17/16

Base Line Item Detail South State, Inc. Earle Asphalt Company Richard E. Pierson Construction Co., Inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc. Midlantic Construction LLC IEW Construction Group Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

87 504006P 145904 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $1.40 $204,265.60 $1.71 $249,495.84 $1.40 $204,265.60 $1.70 $248,036.80 $4.00 $583,616.00 $1.44 $210,101.76
88 504010P 306 L.F. Drill And Grout Reinforcement Steel $75.00 $22,950.00 $117.19 $35,860.14 $42.25 $12,928.50 $35.00 $10,710.00 $60.00 $18,360.00 $81.77 $25,021.62
89 504015P 97 C.Y. Concrete Footing $1,550.00 $150,350.00 $815.00 $79,055.00 $1,200.00 $116,400.00 $950.00 $92,150.00 $1,245.00 $120,765.00 $971.95 $94,279.15
90 504018P 28 C.Y. Concrete Wing Wall $1,725.00 $48,300.00 $1,410.00 $39,480.00 $1,700.00 $47,600.00 $1,000.00 $28,000.00 $2,200.00 $61,600.00 $2,173.63 $60,861.64
91 504024P 32.00 C.Y. Concrete Abutment Wall $2,750.00 $88,000.00 $2,222.00 $71,104.00 $3,000.00 $96,000.00 $2,000.00 $64,000.00 $2,400.00 $76,800.00 $2,543.09 $81,378.88
92 504027P 29 C.Y. Concrete Pier Column And Cap $3,850.00 $111,650.00 $3,283.00 $95,207.00 $4,310.00 $124,990.00 $2,000.00 $58,000.00 $4,800.00 $139,200.00 $3,177.83 $92,157.07
93 504032P 17 C.Y. Concrete Diaphragm, Hpc $4,000.00 $68,000.00 $7,225.00 $122,825.00 $15,000.00 $255,000.00 $6,000.00 $102,000.00 $4,800.00 $81,600.00 $5,692.58 $96,773.86
94 504036P 66 S.Y. Epoxy Waterproofing $120.00 $7,920.00 $132.75 $8,761.50 $45.00 $2,970.00 $75.00 $4,950.00 $96.00 $6,336.00 $199.40 $13,160.40
95 504038P 2281 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $22.00 $50,182.00 $22.05 $50,296.05 $41.25 $94,091.25 $15.00 $34,215.00 $77.00 $175,637.00 $78.70 $179,514.70
96 505003P 595.00 L.F. AASHTO TYPE |ll Prestressed Concrete Beam $355.00 $211,225.00 $450.00 $267,750.00 $450.00 $267,750.00 $300.00 $178,500.00 $328.00 $195,160.00 $449.93 $267,708.35
97 506006P 24 Unit Reinforced Elastomeric Bearing Assembly $2,400.00 $57,600.00 $1,600.00 $38,400.00 $1,100.00 $26,400.00 $2,000.00 $48,000.00 $2,500.00 $60,000.00 $2,503.54 $60,084.96
98 507024P 573 C.Y. Concrete Bridge Deck, HPC $1,000.00 $573,000.00 $1,186.00 $679,578.00 $1,290.00 $739,170.00 $1,275.00 $730,575.00 $1,285.00 $736,305.00 $1,048.58 $600,836.34
99 507039P 626 L.F. Concrete Bridge Parapet, HPC $155.00 $97,030.00 $164.85 $103,196.10 $222.00 $138,972.00 $157.00 $98,282.00 $300.00 $187,800.00 $250.68 $156,925.68
100 508006M 2.00 Unit Scupper $2,225.00 $4,450.00 $6,705.00 $13,410.00 $4,840.00 $9,680.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $11,400.00 $22,800.00 $5,722.53 $11,445.06
101 508012P 50 L.F. 10" Steel Alloy Pipe $175.00 $8,750.00 $175.00 $8,750.00 $328.00 $16,400.00 $105.00 $5,250.00 $467.00 $23,350.00 $379.74 $18,987.00
102 555009M 168.00 S.F. Concrete Spall Repair, Type 1 $200.00 $33,600.00 $277.70 $46,653.60 $400.00 $67,200.00 $229.00 $38,472.00 $500.00 $84,000.00 $305.21 $51,275.28
103 555012M 255.00 C.F. Concrete Spall Repair, Type 2 $500.00 $127,500.00 $742.80 $189,414.00 $600.00 $153,000.00 $556.00 $141,780.00 $1,200.00 $306,000.00 $1,168.26 $297,906.30
104 555013P 35 S.F. Concrete Beam Spall Repair $245.00 $8,575.00 $610.55 $21,369.25 $350.00 $12,250.00 $275.00 $9,625.00 $800.00 $28,000.00 $539.74 $18,890.90
105 601047P 80 L.F. 8" Corrugated Steel Pipe $135.00 $10,800.00 $64.75 $5,180.00 $50.90 $4,072.00 $85.00 $6,800.00 $126.00 $10,080.00 $78.53 $6,282.40
106 603016P 128 S.Y. Bituminous Treated Stone Slope Protection $110.00 $14,080.00 $116.70 $14,937.60 $79.00 $10,112.00 $175.00 $22,400.00 $192.00 $24,576.00 $132.57 $16,968.96
108 999913P 470 L.F. Reflective Cracking Joint Assembly $7.00 $3,290.00 $48.95 $23,006.50 $50.00 $23,500.00 $22.00 $10,340.00 $27.00 $12,690.00 $81.93 $38,507.10

Base Total $6,439,441.62 $6,960,513.13 $6,992,978.38 $7,968,552.55 $9,361,900.29 $9,947,581.86
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Base Line Item Detail

A. P. Construction, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description
1 1G01SCH 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $15,000.00 $15,000.00
2 1D10MOB 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $550,000.00 $550,000.00
3 5Q01FOB 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $30,000.00 $30,000.00
4 5Q02MFB 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $300.00 $4,200.00
5 1DO1LAY 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $75,000.00 $75,000.00
6 158003M 1,340.00 L.F. Caution Fence $5.00 $6,700.00
7 158006M 1,340.00 L.F. Silt Fence $5.00 $6,700.00
8 158030M 12.00 Unit Inlet Filter Type 2, 2'x4" $250.00 $3,000.00
9 158063P 1.00 L.S. Concrete Washout System $3,000.00 $3,000.00
10 158072M 2.00 Unit Oil Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $1,500.00 $3,000.00
11 158095M 63.00 C.Y. Basin Sand Layer $205.00 $12,915.00
12 159003M 37.00 Unit Breakaway Barricade $75.00 $2,775.00
13 159006M 225.00 Unit Drum $50.00 $11,250.00
14 159012M 1,784.00 S.F. Construction Signs $20.00 $35,680.00
15 159015M 2 Unit Construction Identification Sign, 4' x 8" $2,000.00 $4,000.00
16 159021P 6,760.00 L.F. Construction Barrier Curb $60.00 $405,600.00
17 159027M 5 Unit Flashing Arrow Board, 4' x 8' $2,200.00 $11,000.00
18 159030M 6 Unit Portable Variable Message Sign $8,000.00 $48,000.00
19 159054M 3.00 Unit Temporary Crash Cushion, Inertial Barrier System, 14 Modules $10,000.00 $30,000.00
20 159108M 2.00 Unit Traffic Control Truck with Mounted Crash Cushion $20,000.00 $40,000.00
21 159126M 35,000.00 L.F. Temporary Traffic Stripes, 4" $1.00 $35,000.00
22 1HFPOB 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $2,800.00 $2,800.00
23 160007M 1.00 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $3,000.00 $3,000.00
24 201003P 1.00 L.S. Clearing Site $224,000.00 $224,000.00
25 203021P 2,225.00 C.Y. 1-14 Soil Aggregate $75.00 $166,875.00
26 302039P 874.00 S.Y. Dense-Graded Aggregate Base Course, 7" Thick $20.00 $17,480.00
27 401009P 25,347.00 S.Y. HMA Milling, 3" Or Less $12.00 $304,164.00
28 401012P 5520 S.Y. HMA Milling, More Than 3" To 6" $20.00 $110,400.00
29 401030M 3650 GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $18,250.00
30 401054M 3,514.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5 M 64 Surface Course $120.00 $421,680.00
31 401084M 447.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Intermediate Course $110.00 $49,170.00
32 401096M 368.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M 64 Base Course $105.00 $38,640.00
33 401108M 5.00 Unit Core Samples, Hot Mix Asphalt $500.00 $2,500.00
34 507059P 2,910.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, HPC $120.00 $349,200.00
35 514021P 1.00 L.S. Construction Access $6,000.00 $6,000.00
36 601248P 695.00 L.F. 15" High Density Polyethylene Pipe $70.00 $48,650.00
37 601370M 3.00 Unit 15" Reinforced Concrete End Section $4,000.00 $12,000.00
38 602012M 7.00 Unit Inlet, Type B $5,000.00 $35,000.00
39 602099M 5.00 Unit Reset Existing Casting $2,000.00 $10,000.00
40 602171M 22 Unit Reconstructed Inlet, Type D-2, Using New Casting $2,500.00 $55,000.00
41 602210M 7.00 Unit Bicycle Safe Grate $2,500.00 $17,500.00
42 602216M 12.00 Unit Cleaning Drainage Structure $750.00 $9,000.00
43 602223M 1 Unit Outlet Control Structure $9,000.00 $9,000.00
44 603035P 77.00 S.Y. Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 48" Thick (D50=24") $400.00 $30,800.00
45 603036P 5.00 S.Y. Riprap Stone Channel Protection, 12" Thick (D50=6") $300.00 $1,500.00
46 607018P 1,129.00 L.F. 9" X 16" Concrete Vertical Curb $70.00 $79,030.00
47 608003P 688 S.Y. Nonvegetative Surface, Hot Mix Asphalt $45.00 $30,960.00
48 609003M 1500 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $24.00 $36,000.00
49 609027M 1 Unit Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $3,500.00 $3,500.00
50 609042M 5.00 Unit Beam Guide Rail Post $95.00 $475.00
51 609051M 11.00 Unit Beam Guide Rail Post, 10' Long $105.00 $1,155.00
52 610006M 28,350.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, 6" $1.00 $28,350.00
53 610009M 1295 S.F. Traffic Markings $4.00 $5,180.00
54 610012M 278 Unit RPM, Mono-Directional, White Lens $32.00 $8,896.00
55 610018M 94 Unit RPM, Mono-Directional, Amber Lens $32.00 $3,008.00
56 610024M 315 Unit Removal Of RPM $32.00 $10,080.00
57 610033M 1,495.00 L.F. Rumble Strip $2.00 $2,990.00
58 701021P 446 L.F. 3" Rigid Metallic Conduit $150.00 $66,900.00
59 701102M 2 Unit 18" X 36" Junction Box $6,000.00 $12,000.00
60 804006P 3605 S.Y. Topsoiling, 4" Thick $6.00 $21,630.00
61 806027P 3605 S.Y. Fertilizing And Seeding, Type P $2.00 $7,210.00
62 807006M 3367 S.Y. Topsoil Stabilization, Type 2 Mat $4.00 $13,468.00
63 809003M 3,605.00 S.Y. Straw Mulching $4.00 $14,420.00
64 401036M 227.00 GAL Prime Coat $6.00 $1,362.00
65 609021M 1,500.00 L.F. Rub Rail $15.00 $22,500.00
66 8B31MPT 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $350,000.00 $350,000.00
67 3B33HMA 12.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M 64 Base Course $110.00 $1,320.00
68 5J52BGR 50.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $33.00 $1,650.00
69 5J54BGP 10.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $68.00 $680.00
70 5H04CMB 40 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Roadway, Vaiable Height $300.00 $12,000.00
71 202009P 1141 C.Y. Excavation, Unclassified $85.00 $96,985.00
72 601132P 12 L.F. 30" Reinforced Concrete Pipe $400.00 $4,800.00
73 602006P 6 C.Y. Concrete Headwall $900.00 $5,400.00
80 162005P 1.00 L.S. Vibration Monitoring $30,000.00 $30,000.00
81 201006P 1.00 L.S. Clearing Site, Bridge 20WB $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00
82 201039P 1.00 L.S. Temporary Shielding $525,000.00 $525,000.00
84 501003P 918.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $75.00 $68,850.00
85 502015M 1.00 Unit Static Pile Load Test $150,000.00 $150,000.00
86 502016M 81 Unit 11.875" Diameter Micropiles $12,500.00 $1,012,500.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Base Line Item Detail

A. P. Construction, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description
87 504006P 145904 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $2.00 $291,808.00
88 504010P 306 L.F. Drill And Grout Reinforcement Steel $150.00 $45,900.00
89 504015P 97 C.Y. Concrete Footing $1,500.00 $145,500.00
90 504018P 28 C.Y. Concrete Wing Wall $2,200.00 $61,600.00
91 504024P 32.00 C.Y. Concrete Abutment Wall $2,700.00 $86,400.00
92 504027P 29 C.Y. Concrete Pier Column And Cap $2,500.00 $72,500.00
93 504032P 17 C.Y. Concrete Diaphragm, Hpc $4,000.00 $68,000.00
94 504036P 66 S.Y. Epoxy Waterproofing $300.00 $19,800.00
95 504038P 2281 S.Y. Membrane Waterproofing $120.00 $273,720.00
96 505003P 595.00 L.F. AASHTO TYPE Il Prestressed Concrete Beam $750.00 $446,250.00
97 506006P 24 Unit Reinforced Elastomeric Bearing Assembly $4,000.00 $96,000.00
98 507024P 573 C.Y. Concrete Bridge Deck, HPC $1,500.00 $859,500.00
99 507039P 626 L.F. Concrete Bridge Parapet, HPC $180.00 $112,680.00
100 508006M 2.00 Unit Scupper $5,000.00 $10,000.00
101 508012P 50 L.F. 10" Steel Alloy Pipe $250.00 $12,500.00
102 555009M 168.00 S.F. Concrete Spall Repair, Type 1 $300.00 $50,400.00
103 555012M 255.00 C.F. Concrete Spall Repair, Type 2 $700.00 $178,500.00
104 555013P 35 S.F. Concrete Beam Spall Repair $350.00 $12,250.00
105 601047P 80 L.F. 8" Corrugated Steel Pipe $180.00 $14,400.00
106 603016P 128 S.Y. Bituminous Treated Stone Slope Protection $150.00 $19,200.00
108 999913P 470 L.F. Reflective Cracking Joint Assembly $25.00 $11,750.00

Base Total

$10,292,386.00
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