New Jersey Turnpike Authority
Sample Engineer's Estimate

Procedures Manual Reference Document

NJTA Project Manager: Roadway(s):
Design Consultant: Mileposts:
SAM PLE E NG I N E E R'S ESTI MATE Designer Project Mgr: Last Updated By:
NJTA OPS No.: Date:
NJTA Contract No: Version:
I Project Name:ISAMPLE
ITEM UNIT UNIT OF
NO. CODE DESCRIPTION MEASURE Qry. UNIT PRICE LINE TOTAL
1 104-0001 CONSTRUCTION LAYOUT LS. 1 S 5,000.00| $ 5,000.00
2 104-0002 MOBILIZATION LS. 1 S 160,907.00 $ 160,907.00)
3 108-0001 FUEL PRICE ADJUSTMENT (NO BID) LS. 1 S 1,000.00( $ 1,000.00]
4 202-0002 ROADWAY EXCAVATION, EARTH C.Y. 80 S 285.00( $ 22,800.00)
5 301-0002 AGGREGATE BASE COURSE, 6" THICK A 530 S 25.00| $ 13,250.00
6 304-0001 PORTLAND CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT S.Y. 120 S 180.00( $ 21,600.00)
7 305-006 PAVEMENT REMOVAL, 2IN DEPTH A 92 S 85.00 $ 7,820.00
8 511-N0028 |MOTORIZED GATE REPAIRS LS. 1 S 100,000.00 $ 100,000.00
9 531-N0002 [BUILDING STRUCTRUAL WORK- LOCATION NO. 2 (MOORESTOWN) LS. 1 S 19,950.00( $ 19,950.00
10 599-N0003 |PROJECT ALLOWANCES (NO-BID) usD 150,000 S 1.00| $ 150,000.00
11 2000-N006 [LEAD & ASBESTOS SURVEY (NO BID) usb 135,000 S 1.00| $ 135,000.00
12 2000-N009 |BUILDING ELECTRIC WORK - LOCATION NO. 1 (MILLTOWN) LS. 1 S 108,800.00 $ 108,800.00
13 2000-N010 [BUILDING ELECTRIC WORK- LOCATION NO. 2 (MOORESTOWN) LS. 1 S 347,900.00 $ 347,900.00
14 2000-N015 [BUILDING MECHANICAL WORK - LOCATION NO. 1 (MILLTOWN) LS. 1 S 49,900.00( $ 49,900.00]
15 2000-N016 [BUILDING MECHANICAL WORK - LOCATION NO. 2 (MOORESTOWN) LS. 1 S 15,250.00 $ 15,250.00
16 2000-N025 |BUILDING ARCHITECTURAL WORK - LOCATION NO. 1 (MILLTOWN) LS. 1 S 151,550.00 $ 151,550.00
17 2000-NO53 [BUILDING ARCHITECTURAL WORK - LOCATION NO. 2 (MOORESTOWN) LS. 1 $  1,249,050.00 $ 1,249,050.00]
18 2000-N055 |BUILDING ARCHITECTURAL WORK - LOCATION NO. 3 (HIGHTSTOWN) LS. 1 S 147,750.00 $ 147,750.00)
19 2000-N026 [BUILDING PLUMBING WORK - LOCATION NO. 1 (MILLTOWN) LS. 1 S 19,300.00( $ 19,300.00
20 2000-N058 |BUILDING PLUMBING WORK - LOCATION NO. 2 (MOORESTOWN) LS. 1 S 85,350.00 $ 85,350.00]
21 2000-N030 [NJDCA CONSTRUCTION PERMIT ALLOWANCE (NO-BID) usb 25,000 $ 1.00[ $ 25,000.00]
TOTAL $  2,837,177.00

The foregoing unit prices and lump sum figures represent the fair and reasonable cost of performing the work by contract, including profit.
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