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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:

BID FORM

26-S-1 APRIL 1, 2026

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET #

MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA

] 103,861
T | 2G1WABE37E1178063 A-3239 | 103,86 $3,005.00
FRANK LOSACCO
2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA
2 2G11X5532K9101692 A-3388 | 132,828 $6,500.00
BRIAN BOGIE
2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA
3 | 2G11X5S37K9101154 A-3389 | 127,315 $2,670.00
ECOMOMY AUTO
2015 CHEVROLET CAPRICE
4 | 6G3NS5R27GL237419 A-3315 | 119,141 $2,688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 CREW CAB 4WD
5 | {GCRYAEF5L77332907 T-3945 | 173,292 $4,088.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 CREW CAB 4WD
6 | {GCRYAEF4LZ332509 T-3048 | 135,341 $6.110.00
GURAL FARMS
2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
7 | 3GCNWAEF1LG383776 T-3961 | 166,960 $4,000.00
A-TECH CONCRETE
2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
8 | {FTEX1EF5GKD66250 T-3068 | 133,202 $5,400.00
PEDRO VERGARA
2018 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
9 | {FTEX1E52JKE40528 T-3606 | 177,018 $5,100.00
PERDRO VERGARA
2017 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
10 FTEX1E88HKD77116 T-3424 | 142,698 $7,525.00
CARLOS VERGARA
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD MIN. BID
1 {GNSKDKC1JR361856 T-3673 | 149,955 | ¢g 500 $0.00
NO BID
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD MIN. BID
12 GNSKDKC9JR361863 T-3675 | 142,034 | g 50 $0.00
NO BID
2018 DODGE CHARGER
13 | 5C3CDXKTOJH323899 A-3361 | 141,541 $7,250.00
PEDRO VERGARA
2021 DODGE DURANGO 4WD
14 | 1c4sDUFTaMC764305 150013 | 141,154 $2,830.00

ECONOMY AUTO
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2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
15 | GCNCNEC0JZ334166 T-3610 | 241,946 $1,688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
16 | {GCNCNEC4JZ344554 T-3614 | 258,882 $2.088.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2013 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
17 | {FTEX1EF1DKF28178 T-2817 | 115,733 $2,342.00
ROBERT DUNN
2017 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD
18 | {GC1KUEG3HF225078 1-3437 | 215,726 $3,100.00
PLEIADES AUTO SALES
2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD
19 | S ETNET CFAEKE48022 T-2923 | 94,939 $3,157.00
TIMOTHY MOTORS
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 4WD
20 | {GC1KUEG5JF239165 T-3574 | 141,984 $6,767.00
TIMOTHY MOTORS
2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 4WD
21 | {GCIYLE7XMF135915 T-4005 | 357,088 $3.688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD
22 | {GCIYLE78MF135914 T-4002 | 324,074 $3,688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2016 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD
23 | {ETMF1CF8GKD66227 1-3074 | 112,400 $4,000.00
A-TECH CONCRETE
2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD LAST
24 | 1FTEX1E51KKE25181 T-3740 | KNOWN $2,000.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 18,417
ACE AUTO SALVAGE
2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD LAST
25 | 1FTBF2B60LEE11085 T-3974 | KNOWN $6,500.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 8,268
FRANK ESPOSITO
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
26 | 1GNSKDKC4GR429821 T-3317 | 133,860 $3,527.00
(NO BRAKES - TOW OUT)
ROBERT DUNN
2016 FORD F350 OPEN UTILITY 4WD LAST
~ KNOWN
27 | 1FDRF3HTOGEA33174 T-3012 AN $2.791.00

(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE)

HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
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2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD LAST
28 | 1FTBF2B61LEE11080 T-3979 | KNOWN $6,619.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 4,576
FERAS ALMASRI
2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD LAST
29 | 1FTEX1EF5GKE27127 T-3226 | KNOWN $888.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 86,799
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
30 1GCNCNEC3J2344125 T-3607 | 140,218 $1,288.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
31 | {FTEX1EF1GKE27125 T-3224 | 118,096 $5,600.00
FRANK ESPOSITO
2014 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 LAST
32 | 1GCZGTCGOE1125546 T-2875 | KNOWN $1,088.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 82,771
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
33 | {GCNCNEC1JZ342664 1-3608 | 167,939 $2,088.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD ) 2 688.00
34 | {GCNCNEC2J7135667 1-3450 | 119,592 $2,688.
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
35 | {GCNCNEC2J2338672 T-3609 | 256,769 $2,188.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
36 | {GNSKDEC7LR228453 1-3878 | 124,956 $3,527.00
ROBERT DUNN
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD
37 | {GCIKUEGOJF239171 T-3569 | 141,153 $3,388.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2017 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 LAST
38 | 1GCZGGFG1H1258551 T-3380 | KNOWN $1,088.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 126,044
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 DODGE JOURNEY
39 | 3C4PDCAB5JT430082 T-3680 | 124,562 $3,000.00
A-TECH CONCRETE
2017 DODGE CHARGER
40 | 2C3CDXKTXHH621405 A-3328 | 149,843 $1,285.00
(INOPERABLE)
JACHIN DECK
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2014 FORD FOCUS SEDAN
- 2
41 | {FADP3E27EL112864 A-3189 | 95,260 $1,990.00
RAYMOND HAN
2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD LAST
42 | 1GCNCPEX0CZ164652 T-2525 | KNOWN $488.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 120,030
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD LAST
43 | 1FTNF1CFBEKE48023 T-2926 | KNOWN $511.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 153,887
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD
44 | {GCNCNECXJZ135464 1-3456 | 172,469 $2,588.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2013 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD LAST
45 | 1FTNF1CFXDKF38757 T-2811 | KNOWN $488.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 109,263
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2016 GMC SIERRA 3500 MASON DUMP LAST
46 | 1GD31VCGXGF158249 T-3189 | KNOWN $3,088.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 36,372
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD LAST
47 |1FTBF2B63LEE11078 T-3980 | KNOWN $5,119.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 14,990
FERAS ALMASRI
2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 LAST
48 | 1GCSGAFX0C1120703 T-2559 | KNOWN $588.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 55,959
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2014 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 LAST
49 | 1GCZGTCG2E1208539 T-2932 | KNOWN $688.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 99,977
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD LAST
50 | 1FTEX1E50KKE25169 T-3738 | KNOWN $1,655.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 48,653
FERAS ALMASRI
2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD LAST
51 | 1FTNF1CF2EKE48018 T-2924 | KNOWN $381.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 101,818
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
5, | 2013 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 70686 | 93,346 $1.137.00

1FTNF1CFXCKE25602

TIMOTHY MOTORS
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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:
APRIL 1, 2026

BID FORM

26-S-1

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET #

MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD

53 | 1GNSKDECXLR230004 T-3858 | 128,585 $3,580.00
(INOPERABLE)
ECONOMY AUTO
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
54 | 1GNSKDEC2HR317791 T-3480 | 150,882 $3,000.00
(NO BRAKES - TOW OUT)
ACE AUTO SALVAGE
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
55 | {GNSKDEC7HR316068 T-3477 | 165,564 $4,369.00
ROBERT DUNN
2016 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500
2 177,62
%6 | 1GczGGFG8G1328108 T-8257 /623 $5,800.00
PEDRO VERGARA
2021 DODGE DURANGO 4WD
57 | 1C4SDJFTBMC764297 T-50005 | 116,858 $5,285.00
JACHIN DECK
2017 FORD F550 SHOP TRUCK LAST
58 | 1FDUF5GTXHED36150 T-3364 | KNOWN $19,999.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 19,566
GURAL FARMS
2019 FORD F550 37° BUCKET TRUCK LAST
59 | 1FDUF5GT2KEC37278 T-3552 | KNOWN $10,700.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 8,767
ACE AUTO SALVAGE
2016 FORD F450 RACK BODY LAST
60 | 1TFDUF4GT9GEA53036 T-3004 | KNOWN $3,888.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 52,556
EAST COAST DESIGNERS
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6-YD DUMP W/ VALK PLOW T-1839
61 | {HTWDADRS5J036049 R-8855 = UNK $1,211.00
ALPINE DEERE
2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6-YD DUMP
62 | {HTWDADR24J085813 T-1813 | 56,047 $1,211.00
ALPINE DEERE
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/ VALK PLOW & SWENSON 79903
63 | SPREADER (R-7274) R.7o3g | UNK $2,585.00
1HTWDAZR8AJ278505
ALPINE DEERE
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/ VALK PLOW T-2202
64 | {HTWDAZR9AJ278464 R-733g | 281 $2,699.00
ALPINE DEERE
65 | 2011 INTL 7400 7-YD DUMP 70351 | 63,049 $2.585.00

THTWDAZR7BJ437015

ALPINE DEERE
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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:
APRIL 1, 2026

BID FORM

26-S-1

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET #

MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/VALK PLOW & SWENSON

66 | SPREADER (R-7308) Larsl | 4572 $5,975.75
1HTWDAZR5AJ278462
NORTHEAST CONSTRUCTION
2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/HENDERSON PLOW & 0441
67 | SPREADER (R-7886) Ro7agp | 45:213 $4,589.00
1HTWDAZR8CJ659712
ALPINE DEERE
2017 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD LAST
68 | 1IFTEX1EF8HKD97865 T-3464 | KNOWN $5,600.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 74,682
FRANK ESPOSITO
2017 FORD F550 CATCHBASIN TRUCK
69 | 1FDUF5HT4HEE22231 T-3414 UNK $3,688.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE)
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD LAST
70 | 1FTEX1E58JKE40520 T-3598 | KNOWN $5,600.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 71,275
FRANK ESPOSITO
2019 FORD F450 RACK TRUCK LAST
71 | 1FDUF4GT5KEC37270 T-3624 | KNOWN $5,357.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 17,458
ANDRES MIRANDA
2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/HENDERSON PLOW & LAST
IHTWDAZR1BJ436944 R-7618 | 65,486 A
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/HENDERSON PLOW & 72359
73 | SPREADER (R-7589) R.7eqg | 36452 $5,625.00
1HTWDAZR5BJ136946
ALPINE DEERE
2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6-YD DUMP W/ GLEDHILL PLOW T1800 | AST
KNOWN
74 | {HTWDAAR44J085800 R-6064 | 45956 $1,311.00
ALPINE DEERE
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 Y-7D DUMP W/ SWENSON SPREADER
75 | (R-7303) T-2240 | 25,039 $7,000.00
1HTWDAZR4AJ278453
A-TECH CONCRETE
2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/ HENDERSON PLOW & 72349
76 | SPREADER (R-7579) Roe0g | 25094 $6,629.00

1HTWDAZR8BJ437010

ALPINE DEERE
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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:

26-S-1 APRIL 1, 2026

BID FORM

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET #

MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/ VALK PLOW & SWENSON

77 | SPREADER (R-7311) ons | 26514 $6,629.00
1HTWDAZR3AJ278489
ALPINE DEERE
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3-YD DUMP
78 | 1HTWDAZR55J010601 T-1905 | 48,709 $2,589.00
ALPINE DEERE
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3-YD DUMP W/ VALK PLOW & SPREADER | o
79 | (R-6421) Reaay | 27676 $4,700.00
1HTWDAZR75J151458
NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
80 | 1GNSKDEC6HR319334 T-3504 | 128,917 $2,651.00
(TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT - SALVAGE TITLE)
EDWIN RIBOT
2022 CHEVROLET TAHOE
81 | {GNSKLEDSNR304848 1-50090 | 63,869 $3,459.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2022 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
82 | 1GNSKLED4NR306323 T-50108 | 25,747 $3,489.00
(TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT - SALVAGE TITLE)
ECONOMY AUTO
2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD
83 | {FTEX1E57KKE25170 T-3749 | 105,885 $6,359.00
A & J CONSTRUCTION
2014 FORD FOCUS 5-DR HATCHBACK LAST
84 | 1FADP3K27EL332798 A-3197 | KNOWN $388.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 11,021
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD LAST
85 | 1GNSKDEC3JR363734 T-3636 | KNOWN $2,746.00
(COLLISION DAMAGE - TOW OUT - SALVAGE TITLE) 135,301
EDWIN RIBOT
2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
86 | {GNSKDECOGR405866 T-3303 | 243,031 $1,688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD LAST
87 | 1GNSKDEC6LR228668 T-3864 | KNOWN $2,121.00
(TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT - SALVAGE TITLE) 56,764
ACE AUTO SALVAGE
gg | 2018 DODGE JOURNEY T3677 | 141,042 $1.160.00

3C4PDCAB7JT430083

ECONOMY AUTO
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2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD
: 1 1
89 | {GNSKDEC3JR364835 1-3644 | 133,08 $1,785.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2018 DODGE CHARGER
90 | »C3CDXKTIJH3223871 A-3347 | 127,999 $1,875.00
ECONOMY AUTO
2023 FORD EXPLORER LAST
91 | 1FM5K8AB5NGC25183 T-50138 | KNOWN $825.00
(TOTAL WRECK - TOW OUT - SALVAGE TITLE) 31,550
FERAS ALMASRI
2014 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 2WD LAST
92 | 1GC1CVCG3EF106545 T-2840 | KNOWN $388.00
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE) 127,939
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2011 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER
93 | {DW624KHEBD639698 R-7590 | 6,400hr $33,000.00
JAMES CATALANO
2002 STEPHAN GREENE 6-TON TRAILER
94 | 1S9E2621821489017 R-5861 | N/A $1,688.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
2013 WANCO WLTC4K 30’ LIGHT TOWER
95 | 5F13D1411D1002767 R-8396 | UNK $350.00
SITE SPEC EQUIPMENT
o | 1996 VALK RVS1142 PLOW 4901 | /A $420.01
19348
MIKE FRATESI
o7 | 1998 VALK RVS1142 PLOW T $522.03
20453
MIKE FRATESI
og | 2016 VALK V610-84 PLOW R.o3s0 | /A $401.72
38978
MIKE FRATESI
og | 2005 VALK RVE03-104PR PLOW Reesos | /A $125.99
30668
ALPINE DEERE
2014 CIMLINE CRACK SEALER
100 | 1G9241522EM119090 R-8640 & UNK $2,100.00
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)
LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
2018 STEPP ROADWAY SEALER
101 | 4S9JK2759JS127112 R-10266 UNK $4,230.00

(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

GURAL FARMS
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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:
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26-S-1 APRIL 1, 2026

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET #

MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

102

2017 VERMEER BC1800XL CHIPPER
1VRY151Z1H1006468
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-9606

UNK

$16,200.00

DAN KILCOMONS

103

2013 DOOSAN P250WJD COMPRESSOR
4FVCABDA3DU454902
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-8276

UNK

$1,350.00

FRANK ESPOSITO

104

2009 INGERSOLL RAND P185WJD COMPRESSOR
4FVCABEA49U408601
(INOP. - FLOOD TITLE)

R-7201

UNK

$1,019.00

ALLEN RAIMI

105

2014 WANCO WTSP ARROWBOARD
5F1151019E1002245
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-8623

UNK

$57.00

JOHN VANNESS

106

2013 WANCO WLTC4K 30’ LIGHT TOWER
5F13D1415D1002772
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-8390

UNK

$291.00

HAZLETON EQUIPMENT

107

2018 ALL-AMERICAN PRESSURE WASHER
109177
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-10157

UNK

$1,515.00

GURAL FARMS

108

1991 VERMEER 630B STUMP GRINDER
1VRC11142M1001720
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-4273

UNK

$388.00

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL

109

2018 VERMEER BC1800XL CHIPPER
1VRY15128J1006781
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-9847

UNK

$14,800.00

DAN KILCOMONS

110

2010 STONE 95CM MIXER
472010088
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-7684

UNK

$308.00

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL

111

2009 STONE 95CM MIXER
182009012
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-7204

UNK

$308.00

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL

112

2014 ALAMO TRAXXRF REMOTE MOWER
51400459
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)

R-8871

$888.00

GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
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1991 CASE 275 TRACTOR W/LOADER ATTACHMENT
113 | CCJ0029503 R-4236 $708.00
(INOP. - FLOOD DAMAGE)
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
114 2013 KUBOTA F3080 72” MOWER R-8290 $2,009.00
11607
ALEEN RAIMI
115 S?ggSGREEN CLIMBER UT-125 FLAIL MOWER R-10594 $2500
NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
116 gglg:\gOTRlM 88” FLAIL MOWER R-8158 $25900
ALLEN RAIMI
117 381§1|\;|OTRIM 88” FLAIL MOWER R-8151 $25900
ALLEN RAIMI
118 (1) LOT OF APPROX. (216) 10’ PLOW BLADES $3.557.00
106840
ALPINE DEERE
119 g‘l) LOT OF APPROX. (55) 10’ PLOW BLADES $1,671.00
00896
ALPINE DEERE
120 (1) LOT OF APPROX. (41) 8 MEYER PLOW BLADES $486OO
106765
ALPINE DEERE
121 | (1) LOT OF (12) MISC. PUSH FRAMES $7,268.28
MIKE FRATESI
192 g‘lgéé;g OF (2) 10’ VALK MOLDBOARDS $45700
JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
193 g136L6(?2'£ OF (4) 9’ GOODROADS MOLDBOARDS $22063
MIKE FRATESI
104 g130L808'|9' OF APPROX. (42) 10’ RUBBER PLOW BLADES $56312
MIKE FRATESI
105 g‘|36L606'|(; OF APPROX. (30) 10’ RUBBER PLOW BLADES $56312
MIKE FRATESI
126 (1) LOT OF APPROX. (31) 10’ POLYURETHANE PLOW BLADES $307OO

100895

KEITH GADEK
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SURPLUS SALE #:

DUE DATE:

BID FORM

26-S-1 APRIL 1, 2026

NAME OF BIDDER:

ITEM
NO.

ARTICLES FOR SALE

ASSET # MILEAGE

MIN BID

TOTAL PRICE
BID

2007 YALE MPB040 ELECTRIC PALLET TRUCK

127 | Bgo7N26539E G-20966 = UNK $250.00
MICHAEL RIELA
2004 MITSUBISHI 3000LB. ELECTRIC FORKLIFT
128 | A3BC110309 G-15849 | UNK $1,648.00
FERAS ALMASRI
129 1?§Z8PRIME MOVER ELECTRIC PALLET JACK c7oss | UNK $100.00
MICHAEL RIELA
130 ; ZggsERASE—RITE LINE ERASER R.2680 $15.00
JACOB CZARNOWSKI
1969 LINCOLN R3M-300 ARC WELDER
131 | 5060 G-2822 $65.00
NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
130 1823 SPEEDAIRE COMPRESSOR 64044 $22.00
JOHN VANNESS
133 1L ?ggigﬁDSTAR 1/2-TON ELECTRIC CHAIN HOIST 11204 $100.00
JACHIN DECK
1995 DAYTON WATER PUMP
134 | 0083007 G-12545 $27.00
JOHN VANNESS
135 | COATS WHEEL BALANCER UNK $350.00
VICTOR MARCANO
TRANSMISSION JACK
136 | oo 110158413 UNK $167.00
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
TRANSMISSION JACK
187 | peoeey UNK $177.00
DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
138 | (1) PALLET OF (16) AMBER/CLEAR LED LIGHTBARS $1,285.00
PHIL ROHN
139 | (1) PALLET OF (7) AMBER/CLEAR HALOGEN LIGHT BARS $358.00
VINCENT MARTINI
140 | (1) PALLET OF (13) AMBER/CLEAR LED LIGHTBARS $665.00
PHIL ROHN
141 | (2) PALLETS OF MISC. CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTS $390.00
FERAS ALMASRI
142 | (1) PALLET OF STOKO (30) SOAP & (91) SANITIZER DISPENSERS $11.00

JOHN VANNESS
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SURPLUS SALE #: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
26-S-1 APRIL 1, 2026 BID FORM
Ev ARTICLES FOR SALE ASSET# | MILEAGE MIN BID TOTAL PRICE
143 | (1) PALLET OF 20 FUEL DISPENSER NOZZLES $80.00
FRANK ESPOSITO
144 | (1) PALLET OF (2) INDUSTRIAL ELECTRIC MOTORS $590.00
FERAS ALMASRI
145 | (1) KOHLER 36” SHOWER ENCLOSURE (3 PIECES) $159.00
ALLEN RAIMI
146 | (1) LOT OF (3) ANDERSEN WINDOWS (VARIOUS SIZES) $159.00
ALLEN RAIMI
147 | (1) FIBERGLASS TRUCK CAP W/WINDOWS $66.00
GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
148 | (1) ALUMINUM ROOF ACCESS HATCH $7.00
JOHN VANNESS
149 S/)IRPQLLET OF MISC ELECTRICAL FIXTURES & (1) SPOOL OF 18AWG $37OO
JOHN VANNESS
150 | (1) PALLET OF MISC. PRINT SHOP CHEMISTRY SUPPLIES $107.00

DALE BROOKS




	2014 CHEVROLET IMPALA 2G1WA5E37E1178063Row1: FRANK LOSACCO
	2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA 2G11X5S32K9101692Row1: BRIAN BOGIE
	2019 CHEVROLET IMPALA 2G11X5S37K9101154Row1: ECOMOMY AUTO
	2015 CHEVROLET CAPRICE 6G3NS5R27GL237419Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 CREW CAB 4WD 1GCRYAEF5LZZ332907Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 CREW CAB 4WD 1GCRYAEF4LZ332509Row1: GURAL FARMS
	2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 3GCNWAEF1LG383776Row1: A-TECH CONCRETE
	2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1EF5GKD66250Row1: PEDRO VERGARA
	2018 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E52JKE40528Row1: PERDRO VERGARA
	2017 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E88HKD77116Row1: CARLOS VERGARA
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDKC1JR361856Row1: NO BID
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDKC9JR361863Row1: NO BID
	2018 DODGE CHARGER 2C3CDXKT9JH323899Row1: PEDRO VERGARA
	2021 DODGE DURANGO 4WD 1C4SDJFT3MC764305Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC0JZ334166Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC4JZ344554Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2013 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTFX1EF1DKF28178Row1: ROBERT DUNN
	2017 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD 1GC1KUEG3HF225078Row1: PLEIADES AUTO SALES
	2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTNF1CF4EKE48022Row1: TIMOTHY MOTORS
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 4WD 1GC1KUEG5JF239165Row1: TIMOTHY MOTORS
	2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 4WD 1GC1YLE7XMF135915Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD 1GC1YLE78MF135914Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2016 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTMF1CF8GKD66227Row1: A-TECH CONCRETE
	2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E51KKE25181 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: ACE AUTO SALVAGE
	2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD 1FTBF2B60LEE11085 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDKC4GR429821 NO BRAKES  TOW OUTRow1: ROBERT DUNN
	2016 FORD F350 OPEN UTILITY 4WD 1FDRF3HT0GEA33174 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD 1FTBF2B61LEE11080 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1EF5GKE27127 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC3J2344125Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2016 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1EF1GKE27125Row1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	2014 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 1GCZGTCG0E1125546 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC1JZ342664Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC2JZ135667Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNEC2JZ338672Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC7LR228453Row1: ROBERT DUNN
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500HD CREW CAB 4WD 1GC1KUEG0JF239171Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2017 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 1GCZGGFG1H1258551 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 DODGE JOURNEY 3C4PDCAB5JT430082Row1: A-TECH CONCRETE
	2017 DODGE CHARGER 2C3CDXKTXHH621405 INOPERABLERow1: JACHIN DECK
	2014 FORD FOCUS SEDAN 1FADP3E27EL112864Row1: RAYMOND HAN
	2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCPEX0CZ164652 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTNF1CF6EKE48023 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 REG CAB 2WD 1GCNCNECXJZ135464Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2013 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTNF1CFXDKF38757 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2016 GMC SIERRA 3500 MASON DUMP 1GD31VCGXGF158249 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2020 FORD F250 REG CAB 4WD 1FTBF2B63LEE11078 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 1500 1GCSGAFX0C1120703 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2014 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 1GCZGTCG2E1208539 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E50KKE25169 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	2014 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTNF1CF2EKE48018 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2013 FORD F150 REG CAB 2WD 1FTNF1CFXCKE25602Row1: TIMOTHY MOTORS
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDECXLR230004 INOPERABLERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC2HR317791 NO BRAKES  TOW OUTRow1: ACE AUTO SALVAGE
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC7HR316068Row1: ROBERT DUNN
	2016 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 1GCZGGFG8G1328108Row1: PEDRO VERGARA
	2021 DODGE DURANGO 4WD 1C4SDJFT8MC764297Row1: JACHIN DECK
	2017 FORD F550 SHOP TRUCK 1FDUF5GTXHED36150 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GURAL FARMS
	2019 FORD F550 37 BUCKET TRUCK 1FDUF5GT2KEC37278 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: ACE AUTO SALVAGE
	2016 FORD F450 RACK BODY 1FDUF4GT9GEA53036 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: EAST COAST DESIGNERS
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6YD DUMP W VALK PLOW 1HTWDADR85J036049Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6YD DUMP 1HTWDADR24J085813Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP W VALK PLOW  SWENSON SPREADER R7274 1HTWDAZR8AJ278505Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP W VALK PLOW 1HTWDAZR9AJ278464Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2011 INTL 7400 7YD DUMP 1HTWDAZR7BJ437015Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WVALK PLOW  SWENSON SPREADER R7308 1HTWDAZR5AJ278462Row1: NORTHEAST CONSTRUCTION 
	2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WHENDERSON PLOW  SPREADER R7886 1HTWDAZR8CJ659712Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2017 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1EF8HKD97865 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	2017 FORD F550 CATCHBASIN TRUCK 1FDUF5HT4HEE22231 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E58JKE40520 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	2019 FORD F450 RACK TRUCK 1FDUF4GT5KEC37270 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: ANDRES MIRANDA
	2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WHENDERSON PLOW  SPREADER R7580 IHTWDAZR1BJ436944Row1: DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
	2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WHENDERSON PLOW  SPREADER R7589 1HTWDAZR5BJ136946Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 6YD DUMP W GLEDHILL PLOW 1HTWDAAR44J085800Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 Y7D DUMP W SWENSON SPREADER R7303 1HTWDAZR4AJ278453Row1: A-TECH CONCRETE
	2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP W HENDERSON PLOW  SPREADER R7579 1HTWDAZR8BJ437010Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP W VALK PLOW  SWENSON SPREADER R7311 1HTWDAZR3AJ278489Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3YD DUMP 1HTWDAZR55J010601Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3YD DUMP W VALK PLOW  SPREADER R6421 1HTWDAZR75J151458Row1: NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
	2017 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC6HR319334 TOTAL WRECK  TOW OUT  SALVAGE TITLERow1: EDWIN RIBOT
	2022 CHEVROLET TAHOE 1GNSKLED8NR304848Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2022 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKLED4NR306323 TOTAL WRECK  TOW OUT  SALVAGE TITLERow1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2019 FORD F150 SUPERCAB 4WD 1FTEX1E57KKE25170Row1: A & J CONSTRUCTION
	2014 FORD FOCUS 5DR HATCHBACK 1FADP3K27EL332798 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC3JR363734 COLLISION DAMAGE  TOW OUT  SALVAGE TITLERow1: EDWIN RIBOT
	2016 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC0GR405866Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2020 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC6LR228668 TOTAL WRECK  TOW OUT  SALVAGE TITLERow1: ACE AUTO SALVAGE
	2018 DODGE JOURNEY 3C4PDCAB7JT430083Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2018 CHEVROLET TAHOE 4WD 1GNSKDEC3JR364835Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2018 DODGE CHARGER 2C3CDXKT9JH3223871Row1: ECONOMY AUTO
	2023 FORD EXPLORER 1FM5K8AB5NGC25183 TOTAL WRECK  TOW OUT  SALVAGE TITLERow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	2014 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 2WD 1GC1CVCG3EF106545 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2011 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER 1DW624KHEBD639698Row1: JAMES CATALANO
	2002 STEPHAN GREENE 6TON TRAILER 1S9E2621821489017Row1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2013 WANCO WLTC4K 30 LIGHT TOWER 5F13D1411D1002767Row1: SITE SPEC EQUIPMENT
	1996 VALK RVS1142 PLOW 19348Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	1998 VALK RVS1142 PLOW 22453Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	2016 VALK V61084 PLOW 38978Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	2005 VALK RV903104PR PLOW 30668Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	2014 CIMLINE CRACK SEALER 1G9241522EM119090 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	2018 STEPP ROADWAY SEALER 4S9JK2759JS127112 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GURAL FARMS
	2017 VERMEER BC1800XL CHIPPER 1VRY151Z1H1006468 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: DAN KILCOMONS
	2013 DOOSAN P250WJD COMPRESSOR 4FVCABDA3DU454902 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	2009 INGERSOLL RAND  P185WJD COMPRESSOR 4FVCABEA49U408601 INOP  FLOOD TITLERow1: ALLEN RAIMI
	2014 WANCO WTSP ARROWBOARD 5F1151019E1002245 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: JOHN VANNESS
	2013 WANCO WLTC4K 30 LIGHT TOWER 5F13D1415D1002772 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	2018 ALLAMERICAN PRESSURE WASHER 109177 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GURAL FARMS
	1991 VERMEER 630B STUMP GRINDER 1VRC11142M1001720 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2018 VERMEER BC1800XL CHIPPER 1VRY151Z8J1006781 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: DAN KILCOMONS
	2010 STONE 95CM MIXER 472010088 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2009 STONE 95CM MIXER 182009012 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2014 ALAMO TRAXXRF REMOTE MOWER 51400459 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	1991 CASE 275 TRACTOR WLOADER ATTACHMENT CCJ0029503 INOP  FLOOD DAMAGERow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	2013 KUBOTA F3080 72 MOWER 11607Row1: ALEEN RAIMI
	2020 GREEN CLIMBER UT125 FLAIL MOWER 91803Row1: NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
	2012 MOTRIM 88 FLAIL MOWER 201218Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	2012 MOTRIM 88 FLAIL MOWER 201212Row1: ALLEN RAIMI
	1 LOT OF APPROX 216 10 PLOW BLADES 106840Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	1 LOT OF APPROX 55 10 PLOW BLADES 100896Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	1 LOT OF APPROX 41 8 MEYER PLOW BLADES 106765Row1: ALPINE DEERE
	1 LOT OF 12 MISC PUSH FRAMESRow1: MIKE FRATESI
	1 LOT OF 2 10 VALK MOLDBOARDS 106623Row1: JOSEPH DEFINO TRUCKING
	1 LOT OF 4 9 GOODROADS MOLDBOARDS 106622Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	1 LOT OF APPROX 42 10 RUBBER PLOW BLADES 100889Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	1 LOT OF APPROX 30 10 RUBBER PLOW BLADES 106666Row1: MIKE FRATESI
	1 LOT OF APPROX 31 10 POLYURETHANE PLOW BLADES 100895Row1: KEITH GADEK
	2007 YALE MPB040 ELECTRIC PALLET TRUCK B827N26539ERow1: MICHAEL RIELA
	2004 MITSUBISHI 3000LB ELECTRIC FORKLIFT A3BC110309Row1: FERAS ALMASRI
	1983 PRIME MOVER ELECTRIC PALLET JACK 11748Row1: MICHAEL RIELA
	1980 ERASERITE LINE ERASER 54575Row1: JACOB CZARNOWSKI
	1969 LINCOLN R3M300 ARC WELDER 244060Row1: NJ HEAVY HAUL.COM
	1973 SPEEDAIRE COMPRESSOR 103Row1: JOHN VANNESS
	1992 LOADSTAR 12TON ELECTRIC CHAIN HOIST L082KKRow1: JACHIN DECK
	1995 DAYTON WATER PUMP 94083007Row1: JOHN VANNESS
	COATS WHEEL BALANCERRow1: VICTOR MARCANO
	TRANSMISSION JACK SS110158413Row1: DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
	TRANSMISSION JACK B67554Row1: DEVINO TRUCKS & PARTS
	1 PALLET OF 16 AMBERCLEAR LED LIGHTBARSRow1: PHIL ROHN
	1 PALLET OF 7 AMBERCLEAR HALOGEN LIGHT BARSRow1: VINCENT MARTINI
	1 PALLET OF 13 AMBERCLEAR LED LIGHTBARSRow1: PHIL ROHN
	2 PALLETS OF MISC CHEVROLET CAPRICE PARTSRow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	1 PALLET OF STOKO 30 SOAP  91 SANITIZER DISPENSERSRow1: JOHN VANNESS
	1 PALLET OF 20 FUEL DISPENSER NOZZLESRow1: FRANK ESPOSITO
	1 PALLET OF 2 INDUSTRIAL ELECTRIC MOTORSRow1: FERAS ALMASRI
	1 KOHLER 36 SHOWER ENCLOSURE 3 PIECESRow1: ALLEN RAIMI
	1 LOT OF 3 ANDERSEN WINDOWS VARIOUS SIZESRow1: ALLEN RAIMI
	1 FIBERGLASS TRUCK CAP WWINDOWSRow1: GUARANTEED AUTO MALL
	1 ALUMINUM ROOF ACCESS HATCHRow1: JOHN VANNESS
	1 PALLET OF MISC ELECTRICAL FIXTURES  1 SPOOL OF 18AWG WIRERow1: JOHN VANNESS
	1 PALLET OF MISC PRINT SHOP CHEMISTRY SUPPLIESRow1: DALE BROOKS
	MIN BID: 
	0: 
	0: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	13: 


	TOTAL BID: 
	0: 
	0: 3005
	1: 6500
	2: 2670
	3: 2688
	4: 4088
	5: 6110
	6: 4000
	7: 5400
	8: 5100
	9: 7525
	10: 0.00
	11: 0.00
	12: 7250
	13: 2830


	MIN BID 2: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	0: 

	TOTAL BID 2: 
	1: 2088
	2: 2342
	3: 3100
	4: 3157
	5: 6767
	6: 3688
	7: 3688
	8: 4000
	9: 2000
	10: 6500
	11: 3527
	12: 2791
	0: 1688

	TOTAL BID 3: 
	0: 6619
	1: 888
	2: 1288
	3: 5600
	4: 1088
	5: 2088
	6: 2688
	7: 2188
	8: 3527
	9: 3388
	10: 1088
	11: 3000
	12: 1285

	MIN BID 3: 
	0: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 

	MIN BID 4: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	0: 

	TOTAL BID 4: 
	1: 488
	2: 511
	3: 2588
	4: 488
	5: 3088
	6: 5119
	7: 588
	8: 688
	9: 1655
	10: 381
	11: 1137
	0: 1990

	TOTAL BID 5: 
	1: 3000
	2: 4369
	3: 5800
	4: 5285
	5: 19999
	6: 10700
	7: 3888
	8: 1211
	9: 1211
	10: 2585
	11: 2699
	12: 2585
	0: 3580

	MIN BID 5: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	0: 

	MIN BID 6: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	0: 

	TOTAL BID 6: 
	1: 4589
	2: 5600
	3: 3688
	4: 5600
	5: 5357
	6: 1667
	7: 5625
	8: 1311
	9: 7000
	10: 6629
	0: 5975.75

	TOTAL BID 7: 
	0: 6629
	1: 2589
	2: 4700
	3: 2651
	4: 3459
	5: 3489
	6: 6359
	7: 388
	8: 2746
	9: 1688
	10: 2121
	11: 1160

	MIN BID 7: 
	0: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 

	TOTAL BID 8: 
	1: 1875
	2: 825
	3: 388
	4: 33000
	5: 1688
	6: 350
	7: 420.01
	8: 522.03
	9: 401.72
	10: 125.99
	11: 2100
	12: 4230
	0: 1785

	MIN BID 8: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	0: 

	TOTAL BID 9: 
	0: 16200
	1: 1350
	2: 1019
	3: 57
	4: 291
	5: 1515
	6: 388
	7: 14800
	8: 308
	9: 308
	10: 888

	MIN BID 9: 
	0: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 

	TOTAL BID 10: 
	0: 708
	2: 25
	3: 259
	4: 259
	5: 3557
	6: 1671
	7: 486
	8: 7268.28
	9: 457
	10: 220.63
	11: 563.12
	12: 563.12
	13: 307
	1: 2009

	MIN BID 10: 
	0: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	13: 
	1: 

	TOTAL BID 11: 
	1: 1648
	2: 100
	3: 15
	4: 65
	5: 22
	6: 100
	7: 27
	8: 350
	9: 167
	10: 177
	11: 1285
	12: 358
	13: 665
	14: 390
	15: 11
	0: 250.00

	MIN BID 11: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 
	8: 
	9: 
	10: 
	11: 
	12: 
	13: 
	14: 
	15: 
	0: 

	MIN BID 12: 
	0: 
	1: 
	2: 
	3: 
	4: 
	5: 
	6: 
	7: 

	TOTAL BID 12: 
	0: 80
	1: 590
	2: 159
	3: 159
	4: 66
	5: 7
	6: 37
	7: 107



