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91-PC-32 (REV.2T)

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
SURPLUS SALE #: DUE DATE:

BID FORM
NAME OF BIDDER:

25-S-3 NOVEMBER 25, 2025
ITEM 
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE ASSET # MILEAGE MIN BID TOTAL PRICE 

BID

1
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-7316)
1HTWDAZR2AJ278497
INOP

T-2245          
R-9126

LAST 
KNOWN     
29,079

2
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW
1HTWDAZR3AJ278458
INOP

T-2244          
R-7369

LAST 
KNOWN      
19,601

3

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-
10381)
1HTWDAZR55J010615
INOP

T-1920          
R-10408

UN-
KNOWN

4

2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-
71320)
1HTWDAZR47J460999
INOP

T-1987          
R-7992

LAST 
KNOWN       
31,469

5
2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-7294)
1HTWDAZR9AJ278481
INOP

T-2223          
R-7348

LAST 
KNOWN        
22,875

6
2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW
1HTWDAZR4CJ598441
INOP

T-2454          
R-7871

LAST 
KNOWN         
21,171

7
2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-7584)
1HTWDAZR5BJ436932
INOP/NO KEY

T-2354          
R-7614

LAST 
KNOWN          
27,545

8
2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-7899)
1HTWDAZR3BJ437013
INOP

T-2332          
R-7592

LAST 
KNOWN          
30,354

9
2002 INTERNATIONAL DT4900 POST POUNDER
1HTSDAARX2H510007
INOP

103789 3,734

10
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 5-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-6416)
1HTWDAZR1CJ659745
INOP/NO KEY

T-1951          
R-6253

LAST 
KNOWN                         
24,769

11 2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W/3.5 YD. BUCKET
1DW624KHCDE653025 R-8278 UNK



Page 2 of 6
Page 2 of 10

91-PC-32 (REV.2T)

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
SURPLUS SALE #: DUE DATE:
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12
2021 MCCLOSKEY ST80 CONVEYOR - COLLISION DAMAGE
92259
INOP

R-20082 UNK

13
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3-YD DUMP W/PLOW &SPREADER (R-6331)
1HTWDAZR15J010594
INOP

T-1898          
R-6236 UNK

14
2015 MCCLOSKEY ST80 CONVEYOR
83955
INOP

R-8879 UNK

15
2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/ SPREADER (R-6827)
3HTWDAZR47N461003
INOP

T-2006 
UNK UNK

16
2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP
1HTWDAZR85J010611
INOP

T-1918 UNK

17 2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB
1GC1YLE73MF135917 T-4006 226,158

18 2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB
1GC1YLE70MF135924 T-4008 188,254

19 2014 FORD F150
1FTEX1EM8EFB48646 T-2888 115,561

20 2018 FORD F150
1FTEX1EB0JKE96277 T-3579 173,765

21
2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5’ PLOW
1GC0KUEGXGZ270687

T-3235          
R-9451

LAST 
KNOWN 
59,088

22 2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W/8.5’ PLOW
1GC0KUEG1FZ546012

T-3086          
R-9083 58,152

23 2016 FORD F150
1FTMF1CFXGKD66228 T-3072 124,465

24
2016 FORD F150
1FTMF1CF5GJD66234 T-3079

LAST 
KNOWN 

138,566
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25
1995 FORD F-8000 RACK BODY
1FDYF80E4SVA73627
INOP

103114 UN-
KNOWN

26 2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW
1HTWDAZR9AJ278500

T-2235          
R-7360 20,489

27
2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7-YD DUMP W/PLOW & SPREADER (R-7890)
1HTWDAZR1CJ659745
INOP/NO KEY

T-2445          
R-6304

LAST 
KNOWN    
35,050

28
2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W/3.5 YD. BUCKET
1DW624KHKDE653023
INOP

R-8279 UNK

29 2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W/3.5 YD. BUCKET
1DW624KHLDE653031 R-8277 2,085 

HRS.

30
2005 JOHN DEERE SKID STEER
T00332E107386
INOP

R-6280 UNK

31
2010 BOBCAT SKID STEER
A5HA35810
INOP

R-7622 UNK

32
2016 DOOSAN P250 COMPRESSOR
477360UFAAF44
INOP

R-9490 UNK

33
2012 DOOSAN P250 COMPRESSOR
4FVCABDA7CV445022
INOP

R-8188 2,177 
HRS.

34
2004 JOHN DEERE EXCAVATOR
FF135CX300272
INOP

071287 UNK

35
2009 DOOSAN P185 COMPRESSOR
4FVCBBAA4AV410705
INOP

R-7416 208 HRS.

36 2007 GEITH KMG-100 GRAPPLE ATTACHMENT
263205 R-6953
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37
2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W/3.5 YD. BUCKET
1DW624KHCDE653020
INOP

R-8280 UNK

38 2012 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER
1DW624KHLCE647941 R-8223 4,240 

HRS.

39 1995 JOHN DEERE 955 TRACTOR
LU0955D183673 70485 1,010 

HRS.

40
2018 TORO 4000-D 11’ MOWER
402959072
INOP

R-9977 UNK

41
2003 CASE MXM120 W/MOTT MF-48 FLAIL MOWER
ACM194749
INOP

71007     
71020

1,564 
HRS.

42 2014 GODWIN TRLR MOUNTED CD80M PUMP
16MPF0413ED068401 R-8552 UNK

43
2010 KUBOTA F3080 72” 4WD MOWER
10636
INOP

R-7549 1,429 
HRS.

44
2012 KUBOTA F3080 72” 4WD MOWER
11202
INOP

R-8110 1,750 
HRS.

45
2003 CASE MXM120 W/MOTT MF-48 FLAIL MOWER
ACM194749
INOP

71008     
71023

1,587 
HRS.

46
2013 KUBOTA F3080 72” 4WD MOWER
11533
INOP

R-8294 812 HRS.

47 2014 BOSS SD 8.5’ PLOW
BC114586 R-8616

48 2013 BOSS SD 8.5’ PLOW
BC090526 R-8337
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49 2015 BOSS SD 8.5’ PLOW
BC155343 R-9082

50 2005 VALK 9’ PLOW
30672 R-6533

51 2005 VALK 9’ PLOW
30186 R-6292

52 2011 HENDERSON 11’  PLOW
RSP09522 R-7615

53 2018 HENDERSON MUT V-BOX SPREADER
FSH7201681 R-9918

54 2006 ERSKINE ES200 SKID STEER MTD SNOWBLOWER
VE900386 R-6616

55 1 LOT OF (5) VARIOUS SIZE BACKHOE BUCKETS

56 2011 HENDERSON TAILGATE SPREADER
TGS07672 R-7562

57 2005 WARREN TAILGATE SPREADER
AC620A R-6420

58 2004 SMITH 1.75YD HOPPER SPREADER
7638 071244

59 TOW BEHIND CAR DOLLY
INOP

60 2017 BOBCAT 30” FLAIL MOWER ATTACHMENT
B1YS00539 R-9679

61 2009 BOBCAT MX112 TRENCHER ATTACHMENT
45100132 R-7409

62
2012 KUBOTA F3080 72” 4WD MOWER
11161
INOP

R-8113 799 HRS.



Page 6 of 6
Page 6 of 10

91-PC-32 (REV.2T)

SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
SURPLUS SALE #: DUE DATE:

BID FORM
NAME OF BIDDER:

25-S-3 NOVEMBER 25, 2025
ITEM 
NO. ARTICLES FOR SALE ASSET # MILEAGE MIN BID TOTAL PRICE 
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63 INDECO HYDRAULIC HAMMER & TAMPER ATTACHMENTS

64
2013 KUBOTA F3080 72” 4WD MOWER
11362
INOP

R-8297 756 HRS.

65
2014 KUBOTA F2690 72” 4WD MOWER
10224
INOP

R-8644 UNK

66 2006 STORCH ROADWAY MAGNET
S005ST0951 R-6763

67
2014 VARITECH 1300GAL. SKID MTD. SPRAYER
12402
INOP

R-8487

68 1 LOT OF (3) PALLETS MISC. KUBOTA MOWER PARTS & TIRES

69 1 LOT OF (5) KUBOTA (72”) & TORO MOWER DECKS

70 2012 MOTRIM 88” 3-PT MTD FLAIL
20127 R-8144

71 2006 STORCH ROADWAY MAGNET
S005ST0961 R-6759

72 INTERNATIONAL ELECTRIC 150KW GENERATOR
692911

GN-
0048

73 20” JACOBSEN PUSH MOWER
INOP 70074

74 1990 JACOBSEN 20” PUSH MOWER
11102 19614

75 1990 JACOBSEN 20” PUSH MOWER
11106 19618

76 2009 BOBCAT GRADING BLADE R-7407


	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 29079: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 29079: 5000.00
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R7316 1HTWDAZR2AJ278497 INOPRow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 19601: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 19601: 1178.00
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW 1HTWDAZR3AJ278458 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R 10381 1HTWDAZR55J010615 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BIDRow6: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDRow6: 888.00
	2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R 71320 1HTWDAZR47J460999 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BIDRow8: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDRow8: 1127.00
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 22875: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 22875: 1227.00
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R7294 1HTWDAZR9AJ278481 INOPRow1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 21171: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 21171: 1188.00
	2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW 1HTWDAZR4CJ598441 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 27545: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 27545: 1888.00
	2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R7584 1HTWDAZR5BJ436932 INOPNO KEYRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 30354: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 30354: 2187.00
	2011 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R7899 1HTWDAZR3BJ437013 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BID3734: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID3734: 15515.00
	2002 INTERNATIONAL DT4900 POST POUNDER 1HTSDAARX2H510007 INOPRow1: RICHARD GRASSO
	MIN BIDLAST KNOWN 24769: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDLAST KNOWN 24769: 1088.00
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 5YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R6416 1HTWDAZR1CJ659745 INOPNO KEYRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	MIN BIDUNK: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDUNK: 45891.00
	2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W35 YD BUCKET 1DW624KHCDE653025Row1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	2021 MCCLOSKEY ST80 CONVEYOR  COLLISION DAMAGE 92259 INOPRow1: NORTH CREEK LLC
	R20082Row1: 
	UNKRow1_2: 27680.00
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 3YD DUMP WPLOW SPREADER R6331 1HTWDAZR15J010594 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	T1898 R6236Row1: 
	UNKRow1_3: 1675.00
	2015 MCCLOSKEY ST80 CONVEYOR 83955 INOPRow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	R8879Row1: 
	UNKRow1_4: 10001.00
	2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP W SPREADER R6827 3HTWDAZR47N461003 INOPRow1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	T2006 UNKRow1: 
	UNKRow1_5: 818.00
	2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP 1HTWDAZR85J010611 INOP: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 1GC1YLE73MF135917Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	T4006Row1: 
	226158Row1: 4335.00
	2021 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 CREW CAB 1GC1YLE70MF135924Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	T4008Row1: 
	188254Row1: 3838.00
	2014 FORD F150 1FTEX1EM8EFB48646Row1: JBH AUTO SALES
	T2888Row1: 
	115561Row1: 6900.00
	2018 FORD F150 1FTEX1EB0JKE96277Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	T3579Row1: 
	173765Row1: 4111.00
	2016 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW 1GC0KUEGXGZ270687Row1: JBH AUTO SALES
	T3235 R9451Row1: 
	LAST KNOWN 59088Row1: 7100.00
	2015 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 W85 PLOW 1GC0KUEG1FZ546012Row1: LAFERRARRA CONSTRUCTION
	T3086 R9083Row1: 
	58152Row1: 10101.00
	2016 FORD F150 1FTMF1CFXGKD66228Row1: ROBERT PINSKY
	T3072Row1: 
	124465Row1: 2575.00
	2016 FORD F150 1FTMF1CF5GJD66234Row1: JACHIN DECK
	T3079Row1: 
	LAST KNOWN 138566Row1: 2250.00
	1995 FORD F8000 RACK BODY 1FDYF80E4SVA73627 INOPRow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	103114Row1: 
	UN KNOWNRow1_2: 2000.00
	2010 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW 1HTWDAZR9AJ278500Row1: ALPINE DEERE LANDSCAPING
	T2235 R7360Row1: 
	20489Row1: 6324.00
	2012 INTERNATIONAL 7400 7YD DUMP WPLOW  SPREADER R7890 1HTWDAZR1CJ659745 INOPNO KEYRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	T2445 R6304Row1: 
	LAST KNOWN 35050Row1: 2888.00
	2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W35 YD BUCKET 1DW624KHKDE653023 INOPRow1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	R8279Row1: 
	UNKRow1_6: 55791.00
	2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W35 YD BUCKET 1DW624KHLDE653031Row1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	R8277Row1: 
	2085 HRSRow1: 24791.00
	2005 JOHN DEERE SKID STEER T00332E107386 INOPRow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	R6280Row1: 
	UNKRow1_7: 6300.00
	2010 BOBCAT SKID STEER A5HA35810 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	R7622Row1: 
	UNKRow1_8: 7177.00
	2016 DOOSAN P250 COMPRESSOR 477360UFAAF44 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	R9490Row1: 
	UNKRow1_9: 2677.00
	2012 DOOSAN P250 COMPRESSOR 4FVCABDA7CV445022 INOPRow1: DEVINO TRUCKS
	R8188Row1: 
	2177 HRSRow1: 2388.00
	2004 JOHN DEERE EXCAVATOR FF135CX300272 INOPRow1: JAMES CATALANO
	071287Row1: 
	UNKRow1_10: 16200.00
	2009 DOOSAN P185 COMPRESSOR 4FVCBBAA4AV410705 INOPRow1: NORTH CREEK LLC
	R7416Row1: 
	208 HRSRow1: 3751.00
	2007 GEITH KMG100 GRAPPLE ATTACHMENT 263205Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE 
	R6953Row1: 
	208 HRSRow3: 1850.00
	MIN BIDUNK_2: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDUNK_2: 19991.00
	2013 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER W35 YD BUCKET 1DW624KHCDE653020 INOPRow1: HAZLETON EQUIPMENT
	MIN BID4240 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID4240 HRS: 21275.00
	2012 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER 1DW624KHLCE647941Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	MIN BID1010 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1010 HRS: 2475.00
	1995 JOHN DEERE 955 TRACTOR LU0955D183673Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	MIN BIDUNK_3: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDUNK_3: 13500.00
	2018 TORO 4000D 11 MOWER 402959072 INOPRow1: NELSON EBERLY
	MIN BID1564 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1564 HRS: 5251.00
	2003 CASE MXM120 WMOTT MF48 FLAIL MOWER ACM194749 INOPRow1: GURAL FARMS
	MIN BIDUNK_4: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDUNK_4: 8143.00
	2014 GODWIN TRLR MOUNTED CD80M PUMP 16MPF0413ED068401Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	MIN BID1429 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1429 HRS: 509.00
	2010 KUBOTA F3080 72 4WD MOWER 10636 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BID1750 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1750 HRS: 1109.00
	2012 KUBOTA F3080 72 4WD MOWER 11202 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BID1587 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1587 HRS: 7110.00
	2003 CASE MXM120 WMOTT MF48 FLAIL MOWER ACM194749 INOPRow1_2: GURAL FARMS
	MIN BID812 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID812 HRS: 1609.00
	2013 KUBOTA F3080 72 4WD MOWER 11533 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDR8616: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR8616: 301.00
	2014 BOSS SD 85 PLOW BC114586Row1: LAFERRARRA CONSTRUCTION
	MIN BIDR8337: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR8337: 301.00
	2013 BOSS SD 85 PLOW BC090526Row1: LAFERRARRA CONSTRUCTION
	MIN BIDR9082: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR9082: 301.00
	2015 BOSS SD 85 PLOW BC155343Row1: LAFERRARRA CONSTRUCTION
	MIN BIDR6533: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6533: 400.00
	2005 VALK 9 PLOW 30672Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDR6292: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6292: 400.00
	2005 VALK 9 PLOW 30186Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDR7615: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR7615: 400.00
	2011 HENDERSON 11  PLOW RSP09522Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDR9918: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR9918: 1200.00
	2018 HENDERSON MUT VBOX SPREADER FSH7201681Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDR6616: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6616: 309.00
	2006 ERSKINE ES200 SKID STEER MTD SNOWBLOWER VE900386Row1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BID1 LOT OF 5 VARIOUS SIZE BACKHOE BUCKETS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1 LOT OF 5 VARIOUS SIZE BACKHOE BUCKETS: 450.00
	1 LOT OF 5 VARIOUS SIZE BACKHOE BUCKETSRow1: HAROLD CROWTHER
	MIN BIDR7562: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR7562: 50.00
	2011 HENDERSON TAILGATE SPREADER TGS07672Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDR6420: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6420: 50.00
	2005 WARREN TAILGATE SPREADER AC620ARow1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BID071244: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID071244: 1123.00
	2004 SMITH 175YD HOPPER SPREADER 7638Row1: DEFINO CONTRACTING
	MIN BIDTOW BEHIND CAR DOLLY INOP: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDTOW BEHIND CAR DOLLY INOP: 275.00
	TOW BEHIND CAR DOLLY INOPRow1: JACHIN DECK
	MIN BIDR9679: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR9679: 109.00
	2017 BOBCAT 30 FLAIL MOWER ATTACHMENT B1YS00539Row1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDR7409: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR7409: 1950.00
	2009 BOBCAT MX112 TRENCHER ATTACHMENT 45100132Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	MIN BID799 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID799 HRS: 1609.00
	2012 KUBOTA F3080 72 4WD MOWER 11161 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDINDECO HYDRAULIC HAMMER  TAMPER ATTACHMENTS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDINDECO HYDRAULIC HAMMER  TAMPER ATTACHMENTS: 1668.00
	INDECO HYDRAULIC HAMMER  TAMPER ATTACHMENTSRow1: GURAL FARMS
	MIN BID756 HRS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID756 HRS: 1609.00
	2013 KUBOTA F3080 72 4WD MOWER 11362 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDUNK_5: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDUNK_5: 509.00
	2014 KUBOTA F2690 72 4WD MOWER 10224 INOPRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDR6763: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6763: 1015.00
	2006 STORCH ROADWAY MAGNET S005ST0951Row1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	2014 VARITECH 1300GAL SKID MTD SPRAYER 12402 INOPRow1: GURAL FARMS
	MIN BIDRow10_4: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDRow10_4: 451.00
	MIN BID1 LOT OF 3 PALLETS MISC KUBOTA MOWER PARTS  TIRES: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1 LOT OF 3 PALLETS MISC KUBOTA MOWER PARTS  TIRES: 1109.00
	1 LOT OF 3 PALLETS MISC KUBOTA MOWER PARTS  TIRESRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BID1 LOT OF 5 KUBOTA 72  TORO MOWER DECKS: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID1 LOT OF 5 KUBOTA 72  TORO MOWER DECKS: 1109.00
	1 LOT OF 5 KUBOTA 72  TORO MOWER DECKSRow1: FOR TWO K'S REAL ESTATE
	MIN BIDR8144: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR8144: 0.00
	2012 MOTRIM 88 3PT MTD FLAIL 20127Row1: NO BID
	MIN BIDR6759: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR6759: 160.00
	2006 STORCH ROADWAY MAGNET S005ST0961Row1: JAMES CATALANO 
	MIN BIDGN 0048: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDGN 0048: 103.00
	INTERNATIONAL ELECTRIC 150KW GENERATOR 692911Row1: LIBERTY MOTORS
	MIN BID70074: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID70074: 0.00
	20 JACOBSEN PUSH MOWER INOPRow1: NO BID
	MIN BID19614: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID19614: 0.00
	1990 JACOBSEN 20 PUSH MOWER 11102Row1: NO BID
	MIN BID19618: 
	TOTAL PRICE BID19618: 0.00
	1990 JACOBSEN 20 PUSH MOWER 11106Row1: NO BID
	MIN BIDR7407: 
	TOTAL PRICE BIDR7407: 973.00
	2009 BOBCAT GRADING BLADERow1: LONGFORD LANDSCAPE
	Text1: 
	Text2: 935.00


