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INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER:
22-S-2 october 26,2022 | QUOTATION FORM = REVISED 12/28/2022
NUMBER UNIT PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRICE
NO. UNITS MEAS. UNIT BID
1.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD. W/PLOW (R-6303) T-1919 1 EA. $5,125.00

N/A miles VIN #lHTWDAZR15J010613

A & A Truck Parts

2.| 2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 6 YD. W/PLOW (TP-70796) T-1789 1 EA. $2,781.00

85355 miles 8999 hours VIN #1lHTWDADR94J085789

A & A Truck Parts

3.1 2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 6 YD. 57349 miles T-1805 1 EA. $ 4,280.00

5046 hours VIN #IlHTWDADR34J085805

A & A Truck Parts

4.| 2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD. 21017 miles T-1914 1 EA. $ 3,785.00

2265 HOURS VIN #1HTWDAZR75J010602

DeFino Trucking

5.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP3 YD. CREW CAB W/TAILGATE SPREADER  T-1884 1 EA. $ 2,850.00

(R-6324) 63896 miles 7410 hours VIN #1lHTWDAZR65J185357

A & A Truck Parts

6. 2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP3 YD. SIDE DUMP W/TAILGATE T-1954 1 EA. $2,852.00

SPRDR. (R-6419) 49240 miles 5201 hours VIN #lHTWDAZR35J151456

A & A Truck Parts

7.1 2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP7 YD. W/PLOW (R-6354) T-1921 1 EA. $3,377.00

N/A miles VIN #lHTWDAZR75J010616

Devino Trucks

8. T-1803 2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP6 YD. W/PLOW (R-6341) T-1803 1 EA. $ 3,129.00

56594 miles 5827 hours VIN #1HTWDADRX4J085803

A & A Truck Parts

9.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP3 YD. W/PLOW (R-6286) 24667 miles T-1908 1 EA. $ 2,852.00

3752 hours VIN #IHTWDAZR65J010610

A & A Truck Parts

10. | 2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD. T-1988 1 EA. $ 2,852.00

26082 miles 2764 hours VIN #1lHTWDAZR07J460997

A & A Truck Parts

11.| 2015 INTERNATIONAL 7400 STAKE18' STAKE BODY ACCIDENT T-2983 1 EA. $ 6,350.00

DAMAGE 108373 miles 5777 hours VIN #lHTWCAZR9FH719530

Economy Auto

12.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7600 DUMPTANDEM AXLE FRAME ROT T-1881 1 EA. $3,279.00

N/A miles VIN #lHTWXAHT25J138994

A & A Truck Parts
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13.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD. W/PLOW (R-6290) T-1910

1 EA.

$2,879.00

28832 miles 5090 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR95J010598

A & A Truck Parts

14.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD. SIDE DUMP W/SPRDR T-1957

$2,879.00

(R-6530) & PLOW (R-7073) 23701 miles 3236 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR95J151459

A & A Truck Parts

15.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD. CREW CAB T-1886

$2,279.00

55293 miles 5065 hours VIN #1HTWDAZRXS5J185359

A & A Truck Parts

16.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD. T-1902

$2,279.00

28479 miles 3375 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR85J010608

A & A Truck Parts

17.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD. W/PLOW T-1917

$4,779.00

32146 miles 3796 hours VIN #lHTWDAZRX5J010612

A & A Truck Parts

18.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 5 YD W/PLOW (R-6817) & T-1948

$ 3,279.00

SPRDR (R-6413) 35077 miles 3548 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR75J151461

A & A Truck Parts

19.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 5 YD W/SPRDR (R-6417) T-1952

$ 3,279.00

33085 miles 4360 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR25J151464

A & A Truck Parts

20.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD W/SPRDR (R-6334) T-1901

$ 2,879.00

26548 miles 3132 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR05J010604

A & A Truck Parts

21.

2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD W/SPRDR (71319) T-1984

$ 3,133.00

23260 miles 2507 hours VIN #1HTWDAZR77J460995

Devino Trucks

22,

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD W/PLOW (R-6289) & SPRDR T-1903

$2,779.00

(R-6336) 20889 miles 2639 hours VIN #l HTWDAZR35J010600

A & A Truck Parts

23.

2005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP3 YD W/SPRDR (R-6322) T-1882

$ 3,279.00

73120 miles 5932 hours VIN #l HTWDAZR25J185355

A & A Truck Parts

24.

1989 FORD LM9000 GENERATOR TRUCK MOUNTED GENERATOR  TP-102367

$ 4,239.00

(GN-0045) 99726 miles 6236 hours VIN #]FDYR9OLOKVA56707

A & A Truck Parts




Page 3 _of 13

91-PC-32 (REV.2T) SALE OF NEW JERSEY TURNPIKE AUTHORITY SURPLUS PROPERTY
INVITATION NO.: DUE DATE: NAME OF BIDDER;:
22-S-2 october 26,2022 QUOTATION FORM
NUMBER UNIT PRICE BID TOTAL
ITEM ARTICLES FOR SALE OF OF PER PRICE
NO. UNITS MEAS. UNIT BID
25.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD. T-1922 1 EA. $4,179.00

51827 miles 4628 hours VIN #lHTWDAZR95J010617

A & A Truck Parts

26. | 2004 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 6 YD. T-1796 1 EA. $3,279.00

74924 miles 6082 hours VIN #1HTWDADR44J085795

A & A Truck Parts

27.12002 STERLING LT-9513 TRACTOR TANDEM 5TH WHEEL TP-103836 1 EA. $12,200.00

123534 miles 6991 hours VIN #2FWJAZBD12AJ53080

Longford Landscape
28.12001 INTERNATIONAL 5600 TRACTOR TANDEM - SOLD AS SET W/R-5329 T-1641 | 1 EA. $15,388.00

listed below 144467 miles 6530 hours VIN #1HSXHAER71J087824

Devino Trucks

29. 11999 EAGER BEAVER 35GSL-S TRAILER LOWBOY 35 TON — R-5329 1 EA.

|
S

SOLD AS A SET W/T-1641 listed above VIN #112SCZ402XL0525%4

Devino Trucks

30. 12002 STERLING L7500 DUMP5 YD W/SCORPION ATTENUATOR TP-103710 1 EA. $6,529.00

62276 miles 8254 hours VIN #2FZAATBS22AJ98267

A & A Truck Parts

31.12005 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 3 YD W/10’ POWER ANGLE T-1900 1 EA. $2,629.00

PLOW 27961 milles VIN #IHTWDAZRS55J010596

A & A Truck Parts

32. 12002 STERLING L7500 DUMP 5 YD W/SCORPION ATTENUATOR TP-103704 1 EA. $6,529.00

28370 miles 3685 hours VIN #2FZAATBSX2AJ98260

A & A Truck Parts

33. | 2007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7 YD. W/10' POWER ANGLE T-1985 | 1 EA. $3,829.00

PLOW. 54120 miles 4349 hours VIN# IHTWDAZR97J460996

A & A Truck Parts

34.|2019 INTERNATIONAL 7500 MUT MULTI-USE BODY — T-3534 | 1 EA. $1,589.00

FIRE TOTAL WRECK N/A miles VIN #l HTWLTAR2KH211112

A & A Truck Parts

35.12007 INTERNATIONAL 7400 DUMP 7YD.- FIRE TOTAL WRECK T-2005 1 EA. $509.00

N/Amiles VIN#3HTWDAZR27N461002

A & A Truck Parts

36.|2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP T-2491 1 EA. $1,102.00

186518 miles VIN #1GCNCPEX4CZ165058

Mark Pajor
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37.| 2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB T-2667 1 | EA $3,176.00
211790 miles  VIN #1FTFX1EF3CKE10518
Timothy Motors
38.| 2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB T-2660 | 1 EA. $ 3,216.00
153118 miles VIN #1FTEX1EF3CKE10499
Timothy Motors
39.| 2012 GMC SIERRA 2500 PICKUP MISSING MOTOR/TRANS T-2419 | 1 EA. $1,051.00
105376 miles VIN #1GT11ZCG5CF111059
Mark Pajor
40./ 2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD T-2671| 1 EA. $ 3,252.00
145891 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF1CKE10520
Timothy Motors
41./ 2013 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN T-2695 | 1 EA. $7,275.00
107907 miles VIN #1GCZGTCG5D1101144
Premium Autos NY
42.12011 GMC SIERRA 2500 PICKUP2WD CREW CAB T-2321| 1 EA.
144408 miles VIN #1GT11ZCG5BF160759
Removed from sale
43. 2013 FORD F150 PICKUP MISSING PARTS T-2833 | 1 EA. $1,702.00
N/A miles VIN #1FTFX1EFIDKF28181
Julian Torres
44. 2019 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD TOTAL WRECK T-3788 | 1 EA. $501.00
N/A miles VIN #1FTEX1EBIKKD65120
CH Autos
45.] 2012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN T2505 | 1 EA. $ 6,850.00
112112 miles VIN #1GCZGTCG6C1127928
Premium Autos NY
46./ 2017 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 PICKUP 4WD CREW CAB T-3440 | 1 EA. $9,250.00
BODY DAMAGE 178648 miles VIN #1GC1KUEGIHF225077
Garden Irrigation
47.1 2013 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB T-2827 | 1 EA. $5,317.00
74109 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF6DKF28175
Timothy Motors
48.] 2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 PICKUP 4WD CREW CAB TOTALWRECK ~ T-3953 | 1 EA. $6,610.00
N/A miles VIN #1GCRYAEF4LZ335877
Economy Auto
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49.

2014 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB

T-2918

1 EA.

$3,539.00

165084 miles VIN #1FTFX1EFSEKE48030

Economy Auto

50.

2020 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 PICKUP 4WD CREW CAB

T-3775

$10,200.00

TOTAL WRECK 30477 miles VIN #1GC1YLE76LF165380

Economy Auto

51.

2014 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN BODY DAMAGE -

T-2961

$4,369.00

NO KEYS N/Amiles VIN #1GCZGTFG7E1208497

Maloney's Pub Florin Lupo

52.

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 2500 PICKUP 2WD CREW CAB

T-2425

BODY DAMAGE 115181 miles VIN #1GT11ZCG3CF111061

Removed from sale

53.

2013 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB

T-2819

$7,150.00

87358 miles VIN #1FTFX1EFS8DKF06257

Premium Autos NY

54.

2013 FORD F150 PICKUP

T-2808

$3,756.00

98043 miles VIN #1FTNF1CF1DKF38758

Timothy Motors

55.

2017 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN TOTAL WRECK

T-3387

$1,827.00

74691 miles VIN #1GCZGGF60H1258525

Mark Pajor

56.

2012 FORD ESCAPE SUV

T-2434

$510.00

146848 miles VIN #1FMCU9DG3CKA37111

Jersey One Auto

57.

2016 FORD F150 PICKUP TOTAL WRECK

T-3062

$533.00

135727 miles VIN #1FTEX1EF5GKD66247

Jersey One Auto

58.

2014 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB

T-2917

$1,702.00

173982 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF7EKE48028

Julian Torres

59.

2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB BODY DAMAGE

T-2677

$3,219.00

162557 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF6CKE10500

Timothy Motors

60.

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP TOTAL WRECK -

T-3445

$803.00

NO ENGINE/TRANS 97315 miles VIN #1GCNCNEC7JZ136250

Mark Pajor
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61.

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP MISSING BODY PARTS

T-2527

1 EA.

$ 1,100.00

121555 miles VIN #1GCNCPEX2CZ163728

Mark Pajor

62.

2009 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 2500 VAN

T-2264

$ 3,150.00

82097 miles VIN# 1GCGG29C691179459

Premium Auto NY

63.

2018 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD XTRA CAB TOTAL WRECK

T-3599

$2,739.00

109633 miles VIN #1FTEX1ES51JKE40522

Economy Auto

64.

2013 FORD F150 PICKUP BODY DAMAGE MISSING PARTS

T-2805

$511.00

168197 miles VIN #1FTNF1CF4DKF38768

Jersey One Auto

65.

2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD XTRA CAB MISSING PARTS

T-2673

$ 1,702.00

116147 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF7CKE10506

Julian Torres

66.

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP

T-2483

$ 778.00

144230 miles VIN #1GCNCPEX2CZ165429

Liberty Motors

67.

2019 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB TOTAL WRECK

T-3746

$ 4,329.00

41004 miles VIN #1FTEX1ES0KKE25172

Economy Auto

68.

2019 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN BODY DAMAGE

T-3830

$8,791.00

MISSING PARTS 117492 miles VIN #1 GCZGGFG8K 1368214

Hazelton Equipment

69.

2012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP

T-2493

$611.00

N/A miles VIN #1GCNCPEX8CZ163717

Jersey One Auto

70.

2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB BODY DAMAGE

T-2681

$ 510.00

180666 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF3CKE10504

Jersey One Auto

71.

2010 CHEVROLET COLORADO PICKUP MISSING INTERIOR PARTS

T-2254

$ 2,000.00

134215 miles VIN #1GCITBDE1AS8115822

Mark Reddick

72.

2014 CHEVROLET CAPRICE SEDAN

A-3203

$ 3,485.00

N/A miles VIN #6G3NS5R29E1.982329

Mark Reddick
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73.12012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB BODY DAMAGE T-2676 | 1 EA. $4,500.00
135010 miles VIN #1FTFX1EFOCKE10508
Longford Landscape
74.1 2014 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB W/FIBERGLASS CAP T-2892 | 1 EA. . .
Minimum Bid $7 500.00
184417 miles VIN #1FTEX1EMSEFB48653 $5,500.00 ’ :
Amboy Auto
75.12013 CHEVROLET TAHOE SUV 2WD T-2749 | 1 EA. $3,227.00
94096 miles VIN #1GNLC2E09DR283404
Mark Pajor
76.12012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB T-2678 | 1 EA. $3,759.00
172263 miles VIN #1FTFX1EF7CKE25040
Timothy Motors
77.12012 CHEVROLET SILVERADO 1500 PICKUP T-2523 | 1 EA. $3.012.00
143687 miles VIN #1GCNCPEX6CZ163926
Vincent Martini
78.12012 FORD F150 PICKUP MISSING BODY PARTS T-2690 | 1 EA. $1.027.00
92698 miles VIN #1FTNF1CF3CKE25604
Jersey One Auto
79. 12012 CHEVROLET EXPRESS 3500 VAN T-2592 | 1 EA. $2.661.00
108562 miles VIN #1GCZGTCGO0C1128427
Jersey One Auto
80.| 2012 GMC CANYON PICKUP T-2634 | 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
175354 miles VIN #1GTJ6LFE2C8152021 $4,500.00 $O . OO
No Bid
81.| 2012 FORD F150 PICKUP 4WD EXTRA CAB BODY DAMAGE T-2682 | 1 EA. $727.00
N/A miles VIN #1FTFX1EFOCKE10511
Jersey One Auto
82.|2018 FORD F150 PICKUP EXTRA CAB - FIRE, TOTAL WRECK T-3597| 1 EA. $109.00
50592 miles VIN #1FTEX1E5XJKE40521
A & A Truck Parts
83.| 1994 GMC C7H042 STAKE 18' W/IR COMPRESSOR (71080) & TP-102884 | 1 EA. $3.299.00
SANDBLASTER (71062) 166808 VIN #1GDP7H1JXRI507460
A & A Truck Parts
84.| 71010 2003 CASE MXM120 TRACTOR 1163 hours SER #ACM193447 1 EA. $11 225.00
Shaun Gural
85.| 71015 2003 NEW HOLLAND TM120 TRACTOR W/FLAIL SYSTEM (71028) - 1 EA. $5.425.00
NOKEY 1972 hours SER #ACM194779 1972 hours SER #ACM194779 Shaun Gural
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86. | R-6764 2006 MASSEY FERG. MF573TRACTOR W/CAB & LOADER BUCKET 1 EA. $5.525.00

405 hours SER #9363BR25037
Shaun Gural
87. 171014 2003 NEW HOLLAND TM120 TRACTOR W/FLAIL SYSTEM (71027) 1 EA. $5,005.00

850 hours SER #ACM194762

William Perrine

88. | R-5685 2001 CASE C80 TRACTOR 1129 hours SER #CO80RN3JJE1019253 1 EA. $3,005.00

William Perrine

89. 170482 1995 JOHN DEERE 955 TRACTOR W/REAR FLAIL (ALAMO) 1 EA. $1,867.00

1595 hours SER #LV0955D183675

Jersey One Auto

90. | 70973 2002 MOTT HD88 FLAIL REAR FLAIL SER #SH88-20691 1 EA. $150.00
Robert Fiore
91.| 18737 1986 MOTT HD88 FLAIL REAR FLAIL SER #14698 1 EA. 175.00
Robert Fiore
92.| R-6561 2005 ALAMO MGF60 FLAIL SER #2283SA05 1 EA. $310.00
Frank Battiato
93.| 71021 2003 MOTT MF48 FLAIL SER #1216 1 EA. $300.00
Dan Colson
94.| R-7550 2010 KUBOTA F3080 MOWER INCOMPLETE - PARTS ONLY SER #10692 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
95.| R-8120 2012 KUBOTA F3080 MOWER INCOMPLETE - PARTS ONLYSER #11129| 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
96.| R-8112 2012 KUBOTA F3080 MOWER INCOMPLETE - PARTS ONLY SER #11162 1 EA. $40.00
Jacob Czarnowski
97.| 70450 1995 JACOBSEN 32024 MOWER PUSH MOWER - INCOMPLETE - 1 EA. $3.00
PARTS ONLY SER #2284
Kevin Urban
98.| 70478 1995 JACOBSEN 32024 MOWER PUSH MOWER - INCOMPLETE - 1 EA. $3.00
PARTS ONLY SER #2294
Kevin Urban
99.| R-9182 2015 TORO 22289 MOWER PUSH MOWER SER #315001024 1 EA. $1.00
Jacob Czarnowski
100.| R-6561 2005 ALAMO MGF60 FLAILSIDE FLAIL SER #2283SA05 1 EA. $100.00
Shaun Gural
101.| GN-0019 MAGNETEK 125RD GENERATOR JOHN DEERE POWER - 1 EA. $5,005.00

TRAILER MOUNTED William Perrine
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102.| GN-0012 1971 DELCO E-5222 GENERATOR 6 CYL DETROIT DIESEL 1 EA. $ 452.00
SER #68-E-66
A & A Truck Parts
103.| R-7712 2010 WANCO WTSP ARROW BD VIN #5F11S1016A1003745 1 EA. $ 26.00
Mark Pajor
104.| R-7213 2009 WANCO WTSP ARROW BD VIN #5F11S101X91001367 1 EA. $ 26.00
Mark Pajor
105.| R-7210 2009 WANCO WTSP ARROW BD. VIN #5F11S101491001364 1 EA. $42.00
Mark Pajor
106. | 70306 1994 DIG. RECORDER W1M94 TRAILER RADIO TRAILER - SOLAR 1 EA. $ 55.00
VIN #1W9FC1011RF080226
Mark Pajor
107.| RADIO TRAILER - SOLAR 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
108. | R-7855 2011 VORTEQ VTQ3G TRAILER ATTENUATOR TRAILER - WRECK 1 EA. $ 0.00
VIN #1E9TC2314BA362074
No Bid
109. | R-6581 2005 TEREX RL4060D1-4MH TRAILER LIGHT TOWER 3 CYL. KUBOTA DIESEL 1 EA. $ 775.00
SER #FOF-16023
Andrew Brennan
110. | 104091 2004 TRAIL-EXE TE70HT48DDTRAILER LOWBOY VIN #1DA72D7D14C016754 | 1 EA. $5.005.00
William Perine
111.| 17806 1982 FAYETTE 15055 TRAILER FLATBED - 3-TON SER #2848-Z 1 EA. $ 203.00
Mark Pajor
112.| 71165 2003 RAY-TECH RC8000 TRAILER ROADWAY RECLAIMER 4-TON 1 EA. $0.00
VIN #1R9PD14283C463040
No Bid
113.| 71168 2003 RAY-TECH RC8000 TRAILER ROADWAY RECLAIMER 4-TON 1 EA. $0.00
VIN #1R9PD14214C463043
No Bid
114.| R-8212 2012 CIMLINE 230DHRC TRAILER ROADWAY SEALER 1 EA. $ 1.500.00
VIN #1C92M1524CM 119111
Longford Landscape
115.| R-7840 2011 CIMLINE 230DHRC TRAILER ROADWAY SEALER - 1 EA. $101.00
FIRE DAMAGE VIN #1X92M152XBM119130
Liberty Motors
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116.| R-7839 2011 CIMLINE 230DHRC TRAILER ROADWAY SEALER 1 EA. $2,676.00
VIN #1C92M1526BM119125
Ed Ribot
117.| R-8140 2012 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER COLLISION DAMAGE 1 EA. $16,777.00
VIN #1DW624KHLCE645185
Jersey One Auto
118.| R-7655 2010 JOHN DEERE 624K LOADER 1 EA. | Minimum Bid
5738 hours VIN #1DW624KHPA0633295 $55,000.00 $ O i OO
No Bid
119.| R-8308 2013 BOBCAT E35 EXCAVATOR ROLLOVER - PARTS ONLY - 1 EA. $1,500.00
INCOMPLETE UNIT SER #A93K17501
Sal Eadicicco
120.| G-11270 1993 CATERPILLAR V35D FORKLIFT 4 CYL. GASOLINE FORKLIFT - 1 EA. $ 400.00
INOPERABLE SER #5HB05492
CH Auto
121.| 71313 2004 JOHN DEERE GATOR UTILITY 6X4 WHEEL GATOR WITH CAB 1 EA. $ 60.00
SER #W006X4X076164
Mallory Kenney
122.| MISC EQUIP STAINLESS STEEL FUEL TANK 1 EA. $ 252.00
William Perrine
123.| MISC EQUIP STAINLESS STEEL FUEL TANK 1 EA. $ 252.00
William Perrine
124.| MISC PARTS TEN (10) PALLETS MISC. TIRES 1 EA. $1,101.00
Dino Simoes
125.] 16887 MISC PARTS MISC AUTO BODY PARTS W/CONTAINER 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
126.| MISC PARTS MISC PLUMBING PARTS, PIPE & FITTINGS (LOT) 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
127.| 71273 2004 HOTSY 790SS MISC EQUIP HOTSY PRESSURE WASHER 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
128.| G-20060 2006 HOTSY 555SS MISC EQUIP HOTSY PRESSURE WASHER 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
129.| 18304 MILWAUKEE MISC EQUIP SHOP-VAC 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
130.| 39275 MISC EQUIP OIL FIRED SHOP HEATER 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
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131.| 16257 SNAP-ON EEAC316A MISC EQUIP R-134A AC RECHARGER 1 EA. $0.00
SER #0413A0122
No Bid
132.| 16258 SNAP-ON EEAC316A MISC EQUIP R-134A AC RECHARGER 1 EA. $0.00
SER #0413A0132
No Bid
133.| MOHAWK MP18472AF MISC EQUIP 18,000 LB. COLUMN LIFT (SET OF FOUR (4)) | 1 EA. $1,250.00
SER #2478
Robert Fiore
134.] 39262 SNAP-ON VAT45 MISC EQUIP BATTERY AND CHARGING 1 EA. $ 13.00
SYSTEM CHECKER

Jacob Czarnowski

135. ] G-18606 2005 HOTSY 790SS-4 MISC EQUIP HOTSY PRESSURE WASHER 2039 1 EA. $ 50.00
Jacob Czarnowski
136. | G-18607 2005 HOTSY 790SS-4 MISC EQUIP HOTSY PRESSURE WASHER 2137 1 EA. $50.00
Jacob Czarnowski
137.| SNAP-ON LR-66396 MISC EQUIP RIM CLAMP TIRE CHANGER 1 EA. $112.00
Vincent Martini
138.] SNAP-ON LR-66396 MISC EQUIP RIM CLAMP TIRE CHANGER 1 EA. $ 300.00
Sal Eadicicco
139.| GRACO MISC EQUIP GUN WASHER 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
140.| SNAP-ON EEWB305A MISC EQUIP WHEEL BALANCER 1 EA. $ 200.00
Sal Eadicicco
141.| MILLER CP300 MISC EQUIP MIG WELDER 1 EA. $51.00
Vincent Martini
142.| G-16262 SNAP-ON EEFS305A MISC EQUIP FUEL SYSTEM TESTER/CLEANER 1 EA. $1.00
SER #11513
Jacob Czarnowski
143.1 19181 LINCOLN MISC EQUIP TIG WELDER 1 EA. $11.00
Jacob Czarnowski
144.| BLACK HAWK MISC EQUIP 10-TON FLOOR JACK 1 EA. $ 25.00
Jacob Czarnowski
145.| LINCOLN MISC EQUIP 4-TON FLOOR JACK 1 EA. $11.00
Jacob Czarnowski
146.| MISC EQUIP BAND SAW 1 EA. $ 300.00

Jacin Deck
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147.| SKAT BLAST E010566 MISC EQUIPS AND BLASTING CABINET 1 EA. $ 280.00
Andrew Brennan

148.| LINCOLN MISC EQUIP WELDPAK 100 WELDER 1 EA. $110.00

Sal Eadicicco

149. | 70694 2001 VALK RV120-116 PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE SER #25851 1 EA. $106.00
A & A Truck Parts

150. | 70318 1994 VALK 1136 PLOW 11' MANUAL SER #16691 1 EA. $2,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

151.1 70326 1994 VALK 1136 PLOW 11' MANUAL SER #16672 1 EA. $2,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

152.|70714 2001 VALK RV120-116 PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE SER #25875 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

153.| 70341 1994 VALK 1136 PLOW 11' MANUAL SER #16684 1 EA. $1,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

154./ 70118 1992 GOODROADS 112M1042 PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE SER #337-10 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

155.170528 1995 VALK RV103-60 PLOW10' POWER ANGLE SER #18182 1 EA. $1,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

156. | 70113 1992 GOODROADS 112M1042 PLOW 10" POWER ANGLE SER #337-5 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

157.| R-7004 2007 VALK RVS-1142 PLOW11' MANUAL SER #31485 1 EA. $2,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

158.| 14996 1972 GOODROADS 112 PLOW10' POWER ANGLE SER #52234 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

159.170336 1994 VALK 1136 PLOW 11' MANUAL SER #16678 1 EA. $2,222.00
A & A Truck Parts

160.| 70532 1995 VALK RV103-60 PLOW10' POWER ANGLE SER #18186 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

161.|70699 2001 VALK RV120-116 PLOW10' POWER ANGLE SER #25872 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

162.| PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

163.| PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts

164.| PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE 1 EA. $ 206.00
A & A Truck Parts
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165.| PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
166.| PLOW 10' POWER ANGLE 1 EA. $0.00
No Bid
167.| PLOW 11' MANUAL 1 EA. $2,222.00
A & A Truck Parts
168.| PLOW 11' MANUAL 1 EA. $1,222.00
A & A Truck PArts
169.| PLOW V-PLOW 1 EA. $1,222.00
A & A Truck Parts
170. PLOW V-PLOW 1 EA. $1,222.00
A & A Truck Parts
171.| R-6283 2005 VALK RV903-104PR PLOW 9' POWER ANGLE SER #30176 1 EA. $122.00
A & A Truck Parts
172.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
173.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
174.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
175.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
176.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
177.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
178.| SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
179., SPREADER LOT OF TWO (2) TAILGATE SPREADERS 1 EA. $50.00
Park Auto
180.| 18538 MISC EQUIP PROPANE FIRED SHOP HEATER 1 EA. $0.00
Removed Prior to Sale
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	NAME OF BIDDER_4: 
	EA_34: 
	Text71: 3176
	Text72: 
	211790 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF3CKE10518Row1: Timothy Motors
	EA_35: 
	Text73: 3216
	Text74: 
	153118 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF3CKE10499Row1: Timothy Motors
	EA_36: 
	Text75: 1051
	Text76: 
	105376 miles VIN 1GT11ZCG5CF111059Row1: Mark Pajor
	EA_37: 
	Text77: 3252
	Text78: 
	145891 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF1CKE10520Row1: Timothy Motors
	EA_38: 
	Text79: 7275
	Text80: 
	107907 miles VIN 1GCZGTCG5D1101144Row1: Premium Autos NY
	EA_39: 
	Text81: 
	Text82: 
	144408 miles VIN 1GT11ZCG5BF160759Row1: Removed from sale
	EA_40: 
	Text83: 1702
	Text84: 
	NA miles VIN 1FTFX1EF1DKF28181Row1: Julian Torres
	EA_41: 
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	Text86: 
	NA miles VIN 1FTEX1EB1KKD65120Row1: CH Autos
	EA_42: 
	Text87: 6850
	Text88: 
	112112 miles VIN 1GCZGTCG6C1127928Row1: Premium Autos NY
	EA_43: 
	Text89: 9250
	Text90: 
	BODY DAMAGE 178648 miles  VIN 1GC1KUEG1HF225077Row1: Garden Irrigation
	EA_44: 
	Text91: 5317
	Text92: 
	74109 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF6DKF28175Row1: Timothy Motors
	EA_45: 
	Text93: 6610
	Text94: 
	NA miles VIN 1GCRYAEF4LZ335877Row1: Economy Auto
	NAME OF BIDDER_5: 
	EA_46: 
	Text95: $3,539.00
	Text96: 
	165084 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF5EKE48030Row1: Economy Auto
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	Text97: $10,200.00
	Text98: 
	TOTAL WRECK 30477 miles VIN 1GC1YLE76LF165380Row1: Economy Auto
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	Text99: $4,369.00
	Text100: 
	NO KEYS NA miles VIN 1GCZGTFG7E1208497Row1: Maloney's Pub Florin Lupo
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	Text101: 
	Text102: 
	BODY DAMAGE 115181 miles VIN 1GT11ZCG3CF111061Row1: Removed from sale
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	Text103: $7,150.00
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	74691 miles VIN 1GCZGGF60H1258525Row1: Mark Pajor
	EA_53: 
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	Text110: 
	146848 miles VIN 1FMCU9DG3CKA37111Row1: Jersey One Auto
	EA_54: 
	Text111: $533.00
	Text112: 
	135727 miles VIN 1FTEX1EF5GKD66247Row1: Jersey One Auto
	EA_55: 
	Text113: $1,702.00
	Text114: 
	173982 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF7EKE48028Row1: Julian Torres
	EA_56: 
	Text115: $3,219.00
	Text116: 
	162557 miles VIN 1FTFX1EF6CKE10500Row1: Timothy Motors
	EA_57: 
	Text117: $803.00
	Text118: 
	NO ENGINETRANS  97315 miles  VIN 1GCNCNEC7JZ136250Row1: Mark Pajor


