New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.828 Letting Date: 04/07/2026

BaseLine Item Detail Green Construction, Inc. Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc. Montana Construction Corp Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Underground Utilities Corp.
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Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $137,500.00 $137,500.00 $88,000.00 $88,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $965,734.42 $965,734.42 $370,000.00 $370,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $470,000.00 $470,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

5 108-N0002 200,000.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00

6 108-N0004 1,000.00 USD  Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

7 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

8 202-0002 65.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $150.00 $9,750.00 $85.00 $5,525.00 $45.00 $2,925.00 $200.00 $13,000.00 $20.00 $1,300.00

9 202-0007 1,990.00 C.Y.  Stripping Topsoil $40.00 $79,600.00 $18.00 $35,820.00 $20.00 $39,800.00 $55.00 $109,450.00 $15.00 $29,850.00
10 202-0009 65,000.00 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $65,000.00 $1.00 $65,000.00 $1.00 $65,000.00 $1.00 $65,000.00 $1.00 $65,000.00
11 203-0001 65.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $0.01 $0.65 $85.00 $5,525.00 $25.00 $1,625.00 $95.00 $6,175.00 $50.00 $3,250.00
12 203-N0002 90.00 C.Y. Controlled Low Strength Material $500.00 $45,000.00 $675.00 $60,750.00 $200.00 $18,000.00 $450.00 $40,500.00 $250.00 $22,500.00
13 207-N0008 24.00 Ton  Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $375.00 $9,000.00 $175.00 $4,200.00 $200.00 $4,800.00 $350.00 $8,400.00 $200.00 $4,800.00
14 208-0008 3,135.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $8.00 $25,080.00 $9.00 $28,215.00 $5.00 $15,675.00 $7.00 $21,945.00 $30.00 $94,050.00
15 208-0022 108.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $175.00 $18,900.00 $225.00 $24,300.00 $125.00 $13,500.00 $300.00 $32,400.00 $200.00 $21,600.00
16 208-0024 950.00 Ton Construction Driveway $75.00 $71,250.00 $72.00 $68,400.00 $60.00 $57,000.00 $140.00 $133,000.00 $100.00 $95,000.00
17 208-N0001 2.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $0.01 $0.02 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $2.00 $1,100.00 $2,200.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00
18 208-N0002 6.00 Each Sediment Control Bags $0.01 $0.06 $450.00 $2,700.00 $1.00 $6.00 $700.00 $4,200.00 $750.00 $4,500.00
19 208-N0009 2.00 Each OQil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1.00 $2.00
20 213-0002 505.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $75.00 $37,875.00 $55.00 $27,775.00 $85.00 $42,925.00 $20.00 $10,100.00 $135.00 $68,175.00
21 302-0002 550.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $250.00 $137,500.00 $260.00 $143,000.00 $225.00 $123,750.00 $900.00 $495,000.00 $400.00 $220,000.00
22 302-0071 6,400.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $1.00 $6,400.00 $3.00 $19,200.00 $1.00 $6,400.00 $5.00 $32,000.00 $5.00 $32,000.00
23 302-N0007 355.00 GAL  Trackless Tack Coat $6.00 $2,130.00 $10.00 $3,550.00 $20.00 $7,100.00 $6.00 $2,130.00 $25.00 $8,875.00
24 303-0001 465.00 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $0.01 $4.65 $80.00 $37,200.00 $72.00 $33,480.00 $72.00 $33,480.00 $100.00 $46,500.00
25 305-0006 4,670.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2in Depth $25.00 $116,750.00 $22.00 $102,740.00 $15.00 $70,050.00 $70.00 $326,900.00 $15.00 $70,050.00
26 401-0067 400.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $4.00 $1,600.00 $6.00 $2,400.00 $3.00 $1,200.00 $4.00 $1,600.00 $3.00 $1,200.00
27 501-0001 750.00 L.F. 8-Inch Pipe Underdrain $0.01 $7.50 $65.00 $48,750.00 $110.00 $82,500.00 $50.00 $37,500.00 $75.00 $56,250.00
28 502-0005 4,049.00 L.F. 15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il $135.00 $546,615.00 $145.00 $587,105.00 $400.00 $1,619,600.00 $275.00 $1,113,475.00 $310.00 $1,255,190.00
29 502-0006 5,967.00 L.F. 18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $140.00 $835,380.00 $150.00 $895,050.00 $400.00 $2,386,800.00 $260.00 $1,551,420.00 $310.00 $1,849,770.00
30 502-0010 16.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class llI $145.00 $2,320.00 $190.00 $3,040.00 $475.00 $7,600.00 $645.00 $10,320.00 $400.00 $6,400.00
31 502-0011 358.00 L.F. 30 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $160.00 $57,280.00 $165.00 $59,070.00 $500.00 $179,000.00 $390.00 $139,620.00 $400.00 $143,200.00
32 502-0025 1.00 Each  15-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,100.00 $6,100.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00
33 502-0037 48.00 L.F. 12 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $4,500.00 $216,000.00 $190.00 $9,120.00 $400.00 $19,200.00 $400.00 $19,200.00 $400.00 $19,200.00
34 502-N0003 65.00 L.F. 21 Inch Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il $145.00 $9,425.00 $550.00 $35,750.00 $400.00 $26,000.00 $730.00 $47,450.00 $400.00 $26,000.00
35 502-N0010 125.00 L.F. 24 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner $700.00 $87,500.00 $650.00 $81,250.00 $600.00 $75,000.00 $355.00 $44,375.00 $750.00 $93,750.00
36 502-N0013 740.00 L.F. 18 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner $300.00 $222,000.00 $240.00 $177,600.00 $200.00 $148,000.00 $250.00 $185,000.00 $300.00 $222,000.00
37 503-0001 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D3 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00
38 503-0003 20.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $8,100.00 $162,000.00 $10,000.00 $200,000.00 $7,500.00 $150,000.00 $13,000.00 $260,000.00 $9,000.00 $180,000.00
39 503-0005 69.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,700.00 $117,300.00 $3,000.00 $207,000.00 $2,500.00 $172,500.00 $4,800.00 $331,200.00 $4,000.00 $276,000.00
40 503-0009 5.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,700.00 $8,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $10,000.00 $50,000.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00
41 503-0011 11.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $8,100.00 $89,100.00 $9,000.00 $99,000.00 $7,000.00 $77,000.00 $20,000.00 $220,000.00 $14,000.00 $154,000.00
42 503-0037 2.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 Modified $8,100.00 $16,200.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00 $15,000.00 $30,000.00
43 503-0053 1.00 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type P-2, Using Existing Cover and Frame $1,700.00 $1,700.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00
44 503-0253 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame $1,700.00 $3,400.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $5,200.00 $10,400.00 $6,000.00 $12,000.00
45 503-0254 3.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using New Grate and Frame $1,700.00 $5,100.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00 $3,500.00 $10,500.00 $6,400.00 $19,200.00 $6,000.00 $18,000.00
46 504-0011 12.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $400.00 $4,800.00 $1,850.00 $22,200.00 $850.00 $10,200.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00 $350.00 $4,200.00
47 505-0001 350.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $40.00 $14,000.00 $20.00 $7,000.00 $67.00 $23,450.00 $67.00 $23,450.00 $80.00 $28,000.00
48 506-0001 400.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $150.00 $60,000.00 $75.00 $30,000.00 $45.00 $18,000.00 $90.00 $36,000.00 $100.00 $40,000.00
49 510-0008 1,738.00 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $28.00 $48,664.00 $30.00 $52,140.00 $26.00 $45,188.00 $26.00 $45,188.00 $40.00 $69,520.00
50 510-0009 638.00 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail, Dual Faced $44.00 $28,072.00 $55.00 $35,090.00 $33.00 $21,054.00 $33.00 $21,054.00 $40.00 $25,520.00
51 510-0010 15.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $0.01 $0.15 $26.00 $390.00 $12.00 $180.00 $12.00 $180.00 $25.00 $375.00
52 510-0031 488.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $1.00 $488.00 $2.00 $976.00 $1.00 $488.00 $1.00 $488.00 $5.00 $2,440.00
53 510-N0080 350.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Pre-Stained $85.00 $29,750.00 $80.00 $28,000.00 $59.00 $20,650.00 $59.00 $20,650.00 $66.00 $23,100.00
54 510-N0081 138.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced, Pre-Stained $95.00 $13,110.00 $90.00 $12,420.00 $104.00 $14,352.00 $104.00 $14,352.00 $120.00 $16,560.00
55 510-N0087 15.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post, Pre-stained $130.00 $1,950.00 $125.00 $1,875.00 $180.00 $2,700.00 $180.00 $2,700.00 $225.00 $3,375.00
56 510-N0089 350.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element, Pre-Stained $28.00 $9,800.00 $27.00 $9,450.00 $25.00 $8,750.00 $24.00 $8,400.00 $30.00 $10,500.00
57 516-0015 3,375.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic $2.00 $6,750.00 $1.50 $5,062.50 $1.50 $5,062.50 $2.00 $6,750.00 $5.00 $16,875.00
58 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
59 517-0008 15.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $5,000.00 $75,000.00 $4,000.00 $60,000.00 $2,500.00 $37,500.00 $3,600.00 $54,000.00 $5,000.00 $75,000.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.828

Green Construction, Inc.

Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc.

Montana Construction Corp Inc.

Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.

Letting Date: 04/07/2026

Underground Utilities Corp.

Item No. Unit Code
60 517-0013
61 522-0001
62 523-0002
63 523-0003
64 523-N0001
65 531-0001
66 532-0001
67 599-N0235
68 703-0001
69 704-0002
70 704-0007
71 704-0010
72 706-0001
73 706-0002
74 801-0001
75 801-0009
76 801-0013
77 801-0014
78 801-0015
79 803-0032
80 803-N0001

Qty uom
30,000.00 USD
25.00 Each
275.00 L.F.
90.00 L.F.
365.00 L.F.
30,000.00 USD
500,000.00 USD
220.00 L.F.
17,870.00 S.Y.
855.00 S.Y.
15,065.00 S.Y.
1,950.00 S.V.
1,950.00 S.Y.
175.00 S.Y.
1.00 L.S.
3.00 Each
3.00 Each
100.00 M.H.
3.00 Each
30,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.

Description

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Clean Existing Storm Drain, 24 in. to 48 in. Diameter

Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter

Video Inspection of Pipes

Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid)

Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)
15 in High Density Polypropylene Pipe

Topsoil

Seeding, Type B

Seeding, Type Wildflower

Seeding, Type Wildflower for Steep Slopes

Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting

Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting

Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign

Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator

Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use
Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways

Unit Price
$1.00
$750.00
$300.00
$40.00
$5.50
$1.00
$1.00
$75.00
$4.50
$1.70
$2.80
$2.80
$5.00
$5.00
$350,000.00
$14,000.00
$25,000.00
$200.00
$0.01
$1.00
$50,000.00

Line Total

$30,000.00
$18,750.00
$82,500.00
$3,600.00
$2,007.50
$30,000.00
$500,000.00
$16,500.00
$80,415.00
$1,453.50
$42,182.00
$5,460.00
$9,750.00
$875.00
$350,000.00
$42,000.00
$75,000.00
$20,000.00
$0.03
$30,000.00
$50,000.00
$6,361,429.48
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Unit Price

$1.00
$800.00
$25.00
$75.00
$15.00
$1.00
$1.00
$125.00
$3.30
$1.65
$2.75
$2.75
$5.50
$5.50
$1,575,000.00
$12,000.00
$15,000.00
$100.00
$1,500.00
$1.00
$25,000.00

Line Total

$30,000.00
$20,000.00
$6,875.00
$6,750.00
$5,475.00
$30,000.00
$500,000.00
$27,500.00
$58,971.00
$1,410.75
$41,428.75
$5,362.50
$10,725.00
$962.50
$1,575,000.00
$36,000.00
$45,000.00
$10,000.00
$4,500.00
$30,000.00
$25,000.00
$6,787,399.00

Unit Price

$1.00
$750.00
$20.00
$12.00
$5.00
$1.00
$1.00
$250.00
$5.00
$3.00
$4.65
$4.95
$4.65
$4.45
$175,000.00
$12,000.00
$20,000.00
$65.00
$15,000.00
$1.00
$150,000.00

Line Total

$30,000.00
$18,750.00
$5,500.00
$1,080.00
$1,825.00
$30,000.00
$500,000.00
$55,000.00
$89,350.00
$2,565.00
$70,052.25
$9,652.50
$9,067.50
$778.75
$175,000.00
$36,000.00
$60,000.00
$6,500.00
$45,000.00
$30,000.00
$150,000.00
$7,860,533.50

Unit Price

$1.00
$3,100.00
$100.00
$80.00
$20.00
$1.00
$1.00
$325.00
$8.00
$2.00
$2.00
$5.00
$5.00
$4.00
$217,157.00
$5,000.00
$15,000.00
$100.00
$8,500.00
$1.00
$50,000.00

Line Total

$30,000.00
$77,500.00
$27,500.00
$7,200.00
$7,300.00
$30,000.00
$500,000.00
$71,500.00
$142,960.00
$1,710.00
$30,130.00
$9,750.00
$9,750.00
$700.00
$217,157.00
$15,000.00
$45,000.00
$10,000.00
$25,500.00
$30,000.00
$50,000.00
$7,871,309.00

Unit Price

$1.00
$1,800.00
$365.00
$68.00
$10.00
$1.00
$1.00
$175.00
$8.00
$5.00
$5.00
$5.00
$8.00
$8.00
$275,000.00
$15,000.00
$25,000.00
$200.00
$10,000.00
$1.00
$2,019,033.00

Line Total

$30,000.00
$45,000.00
$100,375.00
$6,120.00
$3,650.00
$30,000.00
$500,000.00
$38,500.00
$142,960.00
$4,275.00
$75,325.00
$9,750.00
$15,600.00
$1,400.00
$275,000.00
$45,000.00
$75,000.00
$20,000.00
$30,000.00
$30,000.00
$2,019,033.00
$9,955,865.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.828

Crisdel Group, Inc.

BOND Civil & Utility Construction, Inc.

Colonnelli Brothers, Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 108-N0002
6 108-N0004
7 201-0002
8 202-0002
9 202-0007
10 202-0009
11 203-0001
12 203-N0002
13 207-N0008
14 208-0008
15 208-0022
16 208-0024
17 208-N0001
18 208-N0002
19 208-N0009
20 213-0002
21 302-0002
22 302-0071
23 302-N0007
24 303-0001
25 305-0006
26 401-0067
27 501-0001
28 502-0005
29 502-0006
30 502-0010
31 502-0011
32 502-0025
33 502-0037
34 502-N0003
35 502-N0010
36 502-N0013
37 503-0001
38 503-0003
39 503-0005
40 503-0009
41 503-0011
42 503-0037
43 503-0053
44 503-0253
45 503-0254
46 504-0011
47 505-0001
48 506-0001
49 510-0008
50 510-0009
51 510-0010
52 510-0031
53 510-N0080
54 510-N0081
55 510-N0087
56 510-N0089
57 516-0015
58 517-0002
59 517-0008

Qty uoMm

1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1,000.00 USD
200,000.00 USD
1,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
65.00 C.Y.
1,990.00 C.Y.
65,000.00 USD
65.00 C.Y.
90.00 C.Y.
24.00 Ton
3,135.00 L.F.
108.00 Each
950.00 Ton
2.00 Each
6.00 Each
2.00 Each
505.00 Ton
550.00 Ton
6,400.00 L.F.
355.00 GAL
465.00 S.Y.
4,670.00 S.Y.
400.00 LB
750.00 L.F.
4,049.00 L.F.
5,967.00 L.F.
16.00 L.F.
358.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
48.00 L.F.
65.00 L.F.
125.00 L.F.
740.00 L.F.
1.00 Each
20.00 Each
69.00 Each
5.00 Each
11.00 Each
2.00 Each
1.00 Each
2.00 Each
3.00 Each
12.00 C.Y.
350.00 L.F.
400.00 L.F.
1,738.00 L.F.
638.00 L.F.
15.00 Each
488.00 L.F.
350.00 L.F.
138.00 L.F.
15.00 Each
350.00 L.F.
3,375.00 L.F.
1.00 L.S.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid)

Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Stripping Topsoil

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Embankment, Common

Controlled Low Strength Material

Riprap Stone Scour Hole, 24in Thick (D50=12in)

Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Construction Driveway

Concrete Washout Facility

Sediment Control Bags

Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1

Disposal of Regulated Material

Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course

Polymerized Joint Adhesive

Trackless Tack Coat

Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick

Pavement Removal, 2in Depth

Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated

8-Inch Pipe Underdrain

15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il

18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI

24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class llI

30 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI

15-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section

12 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI

21 Inch Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il

24 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner

18 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner

Inlet, Type D3

Inlet, Type D2

Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame
Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame
Manhole, Type P-1

Inlet, Type D2 Modified

Reconstructed Manhole, Type P-2, Using Existing Cover and Frame
Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame
Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using New Grate and Frame
Incidental Concrete

Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb

Concrete Curb, Type A

Reset Beam Guide Rail

Reset Beam Guide Rail, Dual Faced

Beam Guide Rail Blockout

Removal of Beam Guide Rail

Beam Guide Rail, Pre-Stained

Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced, Pre-Stained

Beam Guide Rail Post, Pre-stained

Beam Guide Rail Element, Pre-Stained

Traffic Stripes, Thermoplastic

Furnish Field Office, Type B

15.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B

Unit Price Line Total
$128,850.00 $128,850.00
$500,000.00 $500,000.00

$8,505.00 $8,505.00
$1.00 $1,000.00
$1.00 $200,000.00
$1.00 $1,000.00
$18,360.00 $18,360.00
$50.05 $3,253.25
$50.65 $100,793.50
$1.00 $65,000.00
$115.12 $7,482.80
$1,254.22 $112,879.80
$378.34 $9,080.16
$22.00 $68,970.00
$189.31 $20,445.48
$152.17 $144,561.50
$766.83 $1,533.66
$134.53 $807.18
$538.13 $1,076.26
$77.06 $38,915.30
$709.54 $390,247.00
$4.59 $29,376.00
$5.25 $1,863.75
$75.60 $35,154.00
$61.59 $287,625.30
$1.05 $420.00
$135.16 $101,370.00

$309.49 $1,253,125.01
$265.75 $1,585,730.25

$887.18 $14,194.88
$341.06 $122,099.48
$2,734.90 $2,734.90
$757.22 $36,346.56
$760.17 $49,411.05
$52.50 $6,562.50
$52.50 $38,850.00
$15,631.48 $15,631.48
$11,442.80 $228,856.00
$2,449.50 $169,015.50
$4,019.87 $20,099.35
$10,171.38 $111,885.18
$12,358.82 $24,717.64
$8,040.70 $8,040.70
$5,251.88 $10,503.76
$5,650.58 $16,951.74
$1,529.90 $18,358.80
$70.35 $24,622.50
$184.92 $73,968.00
$27.30 $47,447.40
$34.65 $22,106.70
$12.60 $189.00
$1.05 $512.40
$61.95 $21,682.50
$109.20 $15,069.60
$189.00 $2,835.00
$25.20 $8,820.00
$11.98 $40,432.50
$33,214.62 $33,214.62
$5,177.98 $77,669.70

Page 3 of 4

Unit Price
$110,000.00
$525,000.00

$30,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$120,000.00
$136.00
$30.00
$1.00
$180.00
$302.00
$408.00
$15.00
$300.00
$100.00
$3,500.00
$4,100.00
$1,850.00
$80.00
$332.00
$1.00
$42.00
$66.00
$25.00
$3.00
$43.00
$220.00
$255.00
$280.00
$375.00
$3,600.00
$86.00
$450.00
$802.00
$295.00
$6,917.00
$9,138.00
$2,300.00
$2,300.00
$18,550.00
$10,925.00
$20,800.00
$3,700.00
$3,700.00
$906.00
$73.00
$91.00
$139.00
$139.00
$15.00
$37.00
$110.00
$124.00
$219.00
$30.00
$2.10
$105,000.00
$7,465.00

Line Total
$110,000.00
$525,000.00

$30,000.00
$1,000.00
$200,000.00
$1,000.00
$120,000.00
$8,840.00
$59,700.00
$65,000.00
$11,700.00
$27,180.00
$9,792.00
$47,025.00
$32,400.00
$95,000.00
$7,000.00
$24,600.00
$3,700.00
$40,400.00
$182,600.00
$6,400.00
$14,910.00
$30,690.00
$116,750.00
$1,200.00
$32,250.00
$890,780.00
$1,521,585.00
$4,480.00
$134,250.00
$3,600.00
$4,128.00
$29,250.00
$100,250.00
$218,300.00
$6,917.00
$182,760.00
$158,700.00
$11,500.00
$204,050.00
$21,850.00
$20,800.00
$7,400.00
$11,100.00
$10,872.00
$25,550.00
$36,400.00
$241,582.00
$88,682.00
$225.00
$18,056.00
$38,500.00
$17,112.00
$3,285.00
$10,500.00
$7,087.50
$105,000.00
$111,975.00

Unit Price
$20,000.00
$1,100,000.00
$5,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$1.00
$325,000.00
$200.00
$80.00
$1.00
$150.00
$450.00
$150.00
$3.00
$60.00
$60.00
$500.00
$1.00
$1.00
$55.00
$586.00
$9.00
$95.00
$72.00
$53.00
$3.00
$100.00
$365.00
$370.00
$400.00
$405.00
$10,000.00
$200.00
$500.00
$400.00
$300.00
$6,000.00
$6,500.00
$1,500.00
$2,000.00
$15,000.00
$7,500.00
$6,500.00
$4,800.00
$5,000.00
$300.00
$67.00
$100.00
$26.00
$33.00
$12.00
$1.00
$40.00
$104.00
$180.00
$24.00
$10.00
$5,000.00
$2,800.00

Line Total
$20,000.00
$1,100,000.00
$5,000.00
$1,000.00
$200,000.00
$1,000.00
$325,000.00
$13,000.00
$159,200.00
$65,000.00
$9,750.00
$40,500.00
$3,600.00
$9,405.00
$6,480.00
$57,000.00
$1,000.00
$6.00
$2.00
$27,775.00
$322,300.00
$57,600.00
$33,725.00
$33,480.00
$247,510.00
$1,200.00
$75,000.00
$1,477,885.00
$2,207,790.00
$6,400.00
$144,990.00
$10,000.00
$9,600.00
$32,500.00
$50,000.00
$222,000.00
$6,000.00
$130,000.00
$103,500.00
$10,000.00
$165,000.00
$15,000.00
$6,500.00
$9,600.00
$15,000.00
$3,600.00
$23,450.00
$40,000.00
$45,188.00
$21,054.00
$180.00
$488.00
$14,000.00
$14,352.00
$2,700.00
$8,400.00
$33,750.00
$5,000.00
$42,000.00

Letting Date: 04/07/2026
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.828 Letting Date: 04/07/2026

BaseLine Item Detail Crisdel Group, Inc. BOND Civil & Utility Construction, Inc. Colonnelli Brothers, Inc.

Page 4 of 4

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

60 517-0013 30,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00
61 522-0001 25.00 Each Test Pits $1,256.15 $31,403.75 $2,639.00 $65,975.00 $1,000.00 $25,000.00
62 523-0002 275.00 L.F.  Clean Existing Storm Drain, 24 in. to 48 in. Diameter $22.91 $6,300.25 $60.00 $16,500.00 $12.00 $3,300.00
63 523-0003 90.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter $70.00 $6,300.00 $60.00 $5,400.00 $15.00 $1,350.00
64 523-N0001 365.00 L.F. Video Inspection of Pipes $17.26 $6,299.90 $9.00 $3,285.00 $10.00 $3,650.00
65 531-0001 30,000.00 USD  Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00
66 532-0001 500,000.00 USD  Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00
67 599-N0235 220.00 L.F. 15 in High Density Polypropylene Pipe $248.02 $54,564.40 $215.00 $47,300.00 $200.00 $44,000.00
68 703-0001 17,870.00 S.Y. Topsoil $3.94 $70,407.80 $6.00 $107,220.00 $6.00 $107,220.00
69 704-0002 855.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type B $1.57 $1,342.35 $2.00 $1,710.00 $2.00 $1,710.00
70 704-0007 15,065.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type Wildflower $2.62 $39,470.30 $4.00 $60,260.00 $2.00 $30,130.00
71 704-0010 1,950.00 S.V. Seeding, Type Wildflower for Steep Slopes $2.63 $5,128.50 $4.00 $7,800.00 $2.00 $3,900.00
72 706-0001 1,950.00 S.Y.  Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $5.25 $10,237.50 $7.50 $14,625.00 $4.00 $7,800.00
73 706-0002 175.00 S.Y. Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting $5.25 $918.75 $7.50 $1,312.50 $3.00 $525.00
74 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $2,469,000.00 $2,469,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $3,288,000.00 $3,288,000.00
75 801-0009 3.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $14,700.00 $44,100.00 $23,835.00 $71,505.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
76 801-0013 3.00 Each  Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $69,900.00 $209,700.00 $100,000.00 $300,000.00 $30,000.00 $90,000.00
77 801-0014 100.00 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $170.50 $17,050.00 $240.00 $24,000.00 $100.00 $10,000.00
78 801-0015 3.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $5,500.00 $16,500.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00
79 803-0032 30,000.00 USD  Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00
80 803-N0001 1.00 LS.  Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $20,000.00 $20,000.00  $2,510,000.00 $2,510,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

$9,970,878.14 $9,994,056.00 $11,978,045.00
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