New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.736 Letting Date: 03/18/2026

BaseLine Item Detail Creamer Ruberton, A Joint Venture

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $75,000.00 $75,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 LS.  Mobilization $959,670.00 $959,670.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $14,000.00 $14,000.00

4 108-0001 3,100.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $3,100.00

5 108-N0002 350,000.00 USD  Allowance for Unforeseen Work (No-Bid) $1.00 $350,000.00

6 108-N0004 5,000.00 USD  Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00

7 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $275,000.00 $275,000.00

8 202-0002 734.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $310.00 $227,540.00

9 202-0007 20.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $200.00 $4,000.00
10 202-0009 50,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00
11 203-0001 321.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $185.00 $59,385.00
12 203-0002 55.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $200.00 $11,000.00
13 205-0001 2,052.00 C.V. Foundation Excavation $110.00 $225,720.00
14 208-0008 16,369.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $6.00 $98,214.00
15 208-0022 60.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $300.00 $18,000.00
16 208-0024 40.00 Ton  Construction Driveway $250.00 $10,000.00
17 208-N0001 3.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $5,000.00 $15,000.00
18 213-0002 1,100.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material $40.00 $44,000.00
19 213-0003 400.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous $375.00 $150,000.00
20 301-0001 1,154.00 S.Y.  Aggregate Base Course, 6.5in Thick $60.00 $69,240.00
21 301-N0002 1,449.00 S.Y.  Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $55.00 $79,695.00
22 302-0001 205.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 19M 76 Intermediate Course $395.00 $80,975.00
23 302-0002 1,373.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $570.00 $782,610.00
24 302-0004 517.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $265.00 $137,005.00
25 302-0071 5,928.00 L.F.  Polymerized Joint Adhesive $5.00 $29,640.00
26 302-N0007 966.00 GAL  Trackless Tack Coat $15.00 $14,490.00
27 303-0001 7,173.00 S.Y.  Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $75.00 $537,975.00
28 305-0002 200.00 S.Y.  Surface Milling, 2in Average Depth $200.00 $40,000.00
29 305-0003 8,410.00 S.Y.  Pavement Removal, 2 1/2in Depth $50.00 $420,500.00
30 305-N0001 5,315.00 L.F. Remove Existing Rumble Strip $35.00 $186,025.00
31 306-0001 5,516.00 L.F.  Milled Rumble Strip $10.00 $55,160.00
32 401-0004 183,400.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Galvanized $4.00 $733,600.00
33 401-N0017 730.00 C.Y. Concrete in Moment Slab $1,500.00  $1,095,000.00
34 401-0070 9,631.00 S.F. Concrete Penetrating Sealer Treatment $12.00 $115,572.00
35 406-0002 31.00 C.Y. Concrete Foundations for Ground Mounted Signs $2,000.00 $62,000.00
36 406-N0001 60.00 LB Aluminum Posts For Parapet-Mounted Signs $150.00 $9,000.00
37 412-N0003 2.00 Each Weld Existing Inlet Grate $1,500.00 $3,000.00
38 415-0002 10,523.00 S.F.  Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $185.00 $1,946,755.00
39 502-0010 70.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il $210.00 $14,700.00
40 503-0003 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
41 503-0048 5.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type G3, Using New Grate and Frame $5,000.00 $25,000.00
42 504-0011 5.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $400.00 $2,000.00
43 505-0001 2,487.00 L.F.  Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $35.00 $87,045.00
44 506-0001 24.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $200.00 $4,800.00
45 506-0012 10.00 L.F.  Drop Curb $200.00 $2,000.00
46 506-N0009 129.00 L.F. Sawcut Existing Concrete Curb, 2 Inch $95.00 $12,255.00
47 506-N0010 111.00 L.F. Sawecut Existing Concrete Curb, 4 Inch $95.00 $10,545.00
48 508-N0017 322.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Half Shape $1,200.00 $386,400.00
49 508-N0022 528.00 L.F. Modified Concrete Barrier, Roadway $1,200.00 $633,600.00
50 509-0001 268.00 S.F. Sign Panels $60.00 $16,080.00
51 509-0002 47.00 L.F.  U-channel Post $50.00 $2,350.00
52 509-0003 17.00 Each Removal of Existing Ground-Mounted Sign $500.00 $8,500.00
53 509-0008 335.00 L.F.  Timber Posts $14.00 $4,690.00
54 509-N0008 20.00 Each Relocate Sign Panels (Ground Mounted) $1,500.00 $30,000.00
55 510-0001 20,525.00 L.F.  Beam Guide Rail $40.00 $821,000.00
56 510-0002 128.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Dual-Faced $60.00 $7,680.00
57 510-0005 225.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $20.00 $4,500.00
58 510-0010 29.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $12.00 $348.00
59 510-0011 14.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,800.00 $25,200.00
60 510-0014 13.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $5,500.00 $71,500.00
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.736 Letting Date: 03/18/2026

BaseLine Item Detail Creamer Ruberton, A Joint Venture

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total
61 510-0015 12.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $1,500.00 $18,000.00
62 510-0018 5.00 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $4,000.00 $20,000.00
63 510-0019 29.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $75.00 $2,175.00
64 510-0031 21,137.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $4.00 $84,548.00
65 510-N0076 10.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post, 9 FT Long $90.00 $900.00
66 510-NO117 2.00 Each Replace Thrie Beam Transition Section $300.00 $600.00
67 510-N0139 313.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail, Quarter Post Spacing $75.00 $23,475.00
68 515-0002 5.00 Each Delineator, Type CA-Y $150.00 $750.00
69 515-0003 5.00 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $150.00 $750.00
70 515-0004 7.00 Each Delineator, Type CA-W $150.00 $1,050.00
71 515-0005 34.00 Each Delineator, Type GA-Y $150.00 $5,100.00
72 515-0007 79.00 Each Delineator, Type GA-W $150.00 $11,850.00
73 516-0005 92,033.00 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $1.50 $138,049.50
74 516-0007 54,289.00 L.F.  Temporary Pavement Striping $1.00 $54,289.00
75 516-0008 37,395.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $1.50 $56,092.50
76 517-0003 1.00 LS.  Furnish Field Office, Type C $50,000.00 $50,000.00
77 517-0009 24.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $6,000.00 $144,000.00
78 517-0013 30,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00
79 522-0001 25.00 Each Test Pits $1,250.00 $31,250.00
80 524-N0068 5.00 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), TL-3, Narrow $55,000.00 $275,000.00
81 524-N0069 1.00 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), TL-3, Wide $95,000.00 $95,000.00
82 525-0002 1.00 Each Mile Marker, Type RC $350.00 $350.00
83 525-0004 7.00 Each Mile Marker, Type RG $350.00 $2,450.00
84 525-0005 8.00 Each Mile Marker, Type RP $350.00 $2,800.00
85 531-0001 50,000.00 USD  Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00
86 532-0001 125,000.00 USD  Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $125,000.00
87 601-0009 2,800.00 L.F.  3in Rigid Nonmetallic Conduit, PVC-(Schedule 40) $65.00 $182,000.00
88 601-0010 900.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $6.00 $5,400.00
89 601-0014 5.00 Each Junction Box Foundation, Type 1 $7,500.00 $37,500.00
90 601-0019 1,000.00 L.F. #4 A.W.G. Ground Wire $7.50 $7,500.00
91 601-0026 11.00 Each Concrete Base, Type | $6,000.00 $66,000.00
92 601-0056 500.00 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Ground Wire $5.00 $2,500.00
93 601-0074 5,700.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Power Cable $9.00 $51,300.00
94 601-0148 900.00 L.F. #6 A.W.G. Power Cable $5.00 $4,500.00
95 603-0025 16.00 Each Relocate Light Pole and Luminaire $3,500.00 $56,000.00
96 703-0001 848.00 S.Y. Topsoil $15.00 $12,720.00
97 704-0001 848.00 S.Y.  Seeding, Type A $4.00 $3,392.00
98 704-0004 70.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $5.00 $350.00
99 706-0001 70.00 S.Y.  Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $20.00 $1,400.00
100 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $1,377,000.00 $1,377,000.00
101 801-0002 720.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $250.00 $180,000.00
102 801-0003 7,090.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $75.00 $531,750.00
103 801-0007 3,280.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $20.00 $65,600.00
104 801-0009 4.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $10,000.00 $40,000.00
105 801-0013 6.00 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $1,000.00 $6,000.00
106 801-0014 70.00 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $150.00 $10,500.00
107 801-0015 10.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $1,000.00 $10,000.00
108 801-0017 30.00 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $500.00 $15,000.00
109 801-0029 8.00 Each  Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 60 MPH $10,000.00 $80,000.00
110 801-0033 32.00 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 60 MPH $2,500.00 $80,000.00
111 801-N0001 70.00 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $4,500.00 $315,000.00
112 801-N0002 70.00 Each Installation, Maintenance and Removal of Shoulder Closing $3,900.00 $273,000.00
113 801-N0003 45.00 Day  Placing and Removing Portable Variable Message Sign $1,000.00 $45,000.00

$15,860,955.00
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