
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T835.770.205 Letting Date: 11/12/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $730,000.00 $730,000.00 $545,520.00 $545,520.00 $785,000.00 $785,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $3,700,000.00 $3,700,000.00 $4,530,000.00 $4,530,000.00 $4,960,000.00 $4,960,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $29,000.00 $29,000.00

4 108-0001 4,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00

5 108-N0004 400,000.00 USD Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00

6 201-0001 9.00 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,525.00 $85,725.00 $1.00 $9.00

7 202-0002 6,000.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $10.00 $60,000.00 $67.00 $402,000.00 $29.00 $174,000.00

8 202-0007 1,500.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $30.00 $45,000.00 $27.00 $40,500.00 $24.00 $36,000.00

9 202-0009 60,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00

10 203-0001 15,000.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $41.72 $625,800.00 $59.00 $885,000.00 $38.00 $570,000.00

11 207-0004 26.00 Ton RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $159.72 $4,152.72 $87.00 $2,262.00 $195.00 $5,070.00

12 207-0061 13.00 Ton Filter Blanket $200.73 $2,609.49 $115.00 $1,495.00 $432.00 $5,616.00

13 208-0006 50.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $150.92 $7,546.00 $405.00 $20,250.00 $250.00 $12,500.00

14 208-0013 6,900.00 L.F. Floating Turbidity Barriers $46.00 $317,400.00 $76.00 $524,400.00 $57.00 $393,300.00

15 208-0022 14.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $1,000.00 $14,000.00 $667.00 $9,338.00 $380.00 $5,320.00

16 208-0024 3,150.00 Ton Construction Driveway $100.00 $315,000.00 $95.00 $299,250.00 $80.00 $252,000.00

17 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $23,380.00 $23,380.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00

18 208-N0002 3.00 Each Sediment Control Bags $100.00 $300.00 $477.00 $1,431.00 $1,770.00 $5,310.00

19 208-N0009 1.00 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,074.00 $1,074.00 $860.00 $860.00

20 208-N0022 7,000.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Orange Silt Fence $7.00 $49,000.00 $21.00 $147,000.00 $13.00 $91,000.00

21 213-0002 1,300.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $5.00 $6,500.00 $79.00 $102,700.00 $64.00 $83,200.00

22 213-0003 300.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous $5.00 $1,500.00 $295.00 $88,500.00 $410.00 $123,000.00

24 214-0001 1.00 L.S. Vibration and Displacement Monitoring $409,200.00 $409,200.00 $262,300.00 $262,300.00 $425,000.00 $425,000.00

25 299-N0010 9,880.00 S.Y. Geotextile $5.06 $49,992.80 $4.00 $39,520.00 $3.50 $34,580.00

26 299-N0017 1.00 L.S. Bubble Curtain System $490,000.00 $490,000.00 $81,800.00 $81,800.00 $2,250,000.00 $2,250,000.00

27 301-N0002 2,700.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $40.00 $108,000.00 $24.00 $64,800.00 $60.00 $162,000.00

28 302-0004 290.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $212.30 $61,567.00 $181.00 $52,490.00 $162.00 $46,980.00

29 302-0012 290.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M E Intermediate Course $338.13 $98,057.70 $192.00 $55,680.00 $193.00 $55,970.00

30 302-0063 5,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $5,000.00

31 302-0064 670.00 GAL Tack Coat $7.37 $4,937.90 $5.00 $3,350.00 $5.00 $3,350.00

32 302-0071 1,300.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $6.20 $8,060.00 $1.00 $1,300.00 $4.00 $5,200.00

33 302-N0021 540.00 Ton Stone Matrix Asphalt 12.5 MM Surface Course $400.00 $216,000.00 $275.00 $148,500.00 $223.00 $120,420.00

34 305-0007 3,160.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2In Depth $20.00 $63,200.00 $15.00 $47,400.00 $50.00 $158,000.00

35 403-0008 1.00 L.S. Structural Steel (Approximately 16,600,000 Lbs.) $32,872,192.46 $32,872,192.46 $37,253,000.00 $37,253,000.00 $41,749,231.00 $41,749,231.00

36 404-0004 2,249.00 MFBM Treated Timber Structures $2,000.00 $4,498,000.00 $2,897.00 $6,515,353.00 $2,815.00 $6,330,935.00

37 405-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles $10,000,000.00 $10,000,000.00 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $13,175,000.00 $13,175,000.00

38 405-0025 33,841.00 L.F. Furnishing 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $200.00 $6,768,200.00 $302.00 $10,219,982.00 $330.00 $11,167,530.00

39 405-0026 33,841.00 L.F. Driving 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $60.00 $2,030,460.00 $300.00 $10,152,300.00 $102.00 $3,451,782.00

40 405-0027 1,852.00 L.F. 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Test Piles $300.00 $555,600.00 $750.00 $1,389,000.00 $248.00 $459,296.00

41 405-0028 338.00 Each Splices for 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $700.00 $236,600.00 $2,235.00 $755,430.00 $1.00 $338.00

42 405-0091 37.00 Each Dynamic Pile Load Tests $5,000.00 $185,000.00 $8,850.00 $327,450.00 $17,500.00 $647,500.00

43 415-0002 4,650.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $200.00 $930,000.00 $360.00 $1,674,000.00 $1.00 $4,650.00

44 502-0005 865.00 L.F. 15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $130.77 $113,116.05 $98.00 $84,770.00 $90.00 $77,850.00

45 502-0006 30.00 L.F. 18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $106.32 $3,189.60 $120.00 $3,600.00 $218.00 $6,540.00

46 502-0010 73.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $123.11 $8,987.03 $134.00 $9,782.00 $175.00 $12,775.00

47 502-0017 1.00 Each 18-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $3,065.22 $3,065.22 $3,300.00 $3,300.00 $2,850.00 $2,850.00

48 502-0021 1.00 Each 24-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $4,197.19 $4,197.19 $3,416.00 $3,416.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00

49 502-0025 3.00 Each 15-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $2,968.20 $8,904.60 $3,200.00 $9,600.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00

50 503-0001 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D3 $9,778.72 $9,778.72 $8,830.00 $8,830.00 $7,400.00 $7,400.00

51 503-0003 4.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $8,547.80 $34,191.20 $7,920.00 $31,680.00 $8,200.00 $32,800.00

52 503-0011 3.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $8,000.24 $24,000.72 $8,618.00 $25,854.00 $6,100.00 $18,300.00

53 503-0029 6.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type G-2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,115.31 $6,691.86 $2,144.00 $12,864.00 $3,100.00 $18,600.00

54 503-0030 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type G-3, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,115.81 $2,231.62 $2,144.00 $4,288.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00

55 503-0111 1.00 Each Inlet Converted to Manhole $5,259.74 $5,259.74 $2,745.00 $2,745.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

56 503-N0026 1.00 Each Outlet Control Structure $28,513.60 $28,513.60 $19,628.00 $19,628.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

58 503-N0045 1.00 Each Reset Frame, Type G-2 with Extension $1,117.31 $1,117.31 $1,365.00 $1,365.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

59 506-0001 225.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $75.00 $16,875.00 $76.00 $17,100.00 $125.00 $28,125.00

60 509-0001 669.00 S.F. Sign Panels $30.00 $20,070.00 $88.00 $58,872.00 $30.00 $20,070.00

61 509-0002 1,080.00 L.F. U-channel Post $18.00 $19,440.00 $22.00 $23,760.00 $18.00 $19,440.00

62 509-0005 4.00 Each Relocate Existing Ground-Mounted Sign Assembly $7,431.47 $29,725.88 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00

BaseLine Item Detail Walsh Construction Company II, LLC Conti Civil, LLCPKF-Mark III, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T835.770.205 Letting Date: 11/12/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail Walsh Construction Company II, LLC Conti Civil, LLCPKF-Mark III, Inc.

63 510-0011 4.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,650.00 $6,600.00 $1,650.00 $6,600.00 $1,650.00 $6,600.00

64 510-0031 1,600.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $18.00 $28,800.00 $18.00 $28,800.00 $6.00 $9,600.00

65 511-0004 1,350.00 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 96in High $59.00 $79,650.00 $59.00 $79,650.00 $59.00 $79,650.00

66 511-0015 4.00 Each Vehicular Gate, Type II, 96in High, 30ft Wide $9,500.00 $38,000.00 $9,500.00 $38,000.00 $9,500.00 $38,000.00

70 516-0008 2,450.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $2.00 $4,900.00 $2.00 $4,900.00 $0.75 $1,837.50

71 516-0011 40.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $10.00 $400.00 $7.50 $300.00 $25.00 $1,000.00

72 516-0013 90.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $20.00 $1,800.00 $17.50 $1,575.00 $10.00 $900.00

73 517-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $78,000.00 $78,000.00 $51,000.00 $51,000.00

74 517-0007 15.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $4,000.00 $60,000.00 $23,250.00 $348,750.00 $4,950.00 $74,250.00

75 517-0013 43,100.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $43,100.00 $1.00 $43,100.00 $1.00 $43,100.00

76 522-0001 1.00 Each Test Pits $4,325.00 $4,325.00 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $1,350.00 $1,350.00

77 523-N0007 4.00 Each Clean Existing Inlet $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,750.00 $7,000.00 $2,300.00 $9,200.00

78 524-0011 4.00 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 3 Bays, 24in Wide $25,200.00 $100,800.00 $20,000.00 $80,000.00 $28,190.00 $112,760.00

79 524-N0064 1.00 Each Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 6 Bays, 24in Wide $37,400.00 $37,400.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $33,090.00 $33,090.00

80 524-N0071 5.00 Each Repair and Reset Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $1,000.01 $5,000.05 $17,500.00 $87,500.00 $7,500.00 $37,500.00

81 530-0001 110.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $65.00 $7,150.00 $47.00 $5,170.00 $34.50 $3,795.00

82 530-N0001 110.00 Each Removal of Raised Pavement Markers $25.90 $2,849.00 $30.00 $3,300.00 $25.00 $2,750.00

83 531-0001 35,000.00 USD Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00

84 601-0010 800.00 L.F. #8 A.W.G. Ground Wire $0.60 $480.00 $6.00 $4,800.00 $6.20 $4,960.00

85 601-0015 7.00 Each Junction Box, Type C $8,403.57 $58,824.99 $5,755.00 $40,285.00 $12,500.00 $87,500.00

86 601-0074 1,600.00 L.F. #2 A.W.G. Power Cable $22.16 $35,456.00 $8.75 $14,000.00 $8.50 $13,600.00

87 601-0103 800.00 L.F. 3in Rigid Metallic Conduit, Underground $88.65 $70,920.00 $93.00 $74,400.00 $149.00 $119,200.00

88 601-N0121 4.00 Each Foundation, Type SFT (NJDOT) $5,702.26 $22,809.04 $10,900.00 $43,600.00 $14,270.00 $57,080.00

89 603-0014 1.00 L.S. Temporary Lighting Systems $126,067.81 $126,067.81 $90,920.00 $90,920.00 $107,750.00 $107,750.00

90 704-0001 6,130.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $2.00 $12,260.00 $4.50 $27,585.00 $4.25 $26,052.50

91 704-0006 940.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type L $2.00 $1,880.00 $6.75 $6,345.00 $6.75 $6,345.00

92 704-0052 490.00 M.G. Watering for Seeding or Sodding $35.00 $17,150.00 $136.00 $66,640.00 $136.00 $66,640.00

93 706-0001 4,900.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $5.00 $24,500.00 $8.50 $41,650.00 $10.75 $52,675.00

94 803-0032 28,000.00 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $28,000.00 $1.00 $28,000.00 $1.00 $28,000.00

95 803-N0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $135,471.59 $135,471.59 $297,700.00 $297,700.00 $258,350.00 $258,350.00

96 803-N0011 20.00 Each Furnish and Place Traffic Drums (To Remain) $144.00 $2,880.00 $928.00 $18,560.00 $70.00 $1,400.00

97 803-N0012 3,600.00 L.F. Furnish and Place Precast Concrete Construction Barrier (To Remain) $162.99 $586,764.00 $116.00 $417,600.00 $145.00 $522,000.00

98 803-N0016 1.00 Each Furnish Truck with Mounted Attenuator (To Remain) $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $159,650.00 $159,650.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00

99 803-N0017 2.00 Each Furnish Flashing Arrow Board (To Remain) $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $4,798.00 $9,596.00 $6,600.00 $13,200.00

100 803-N0018 2.00 Each Furnish Portable Variable Message Sign (To Remain) $30,000.00 $60,000.00 $18,654.00 $37,308.00 $11,500.00 $23,000.00

101 805-0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Marine Traffic $179,773.72 $179,773.72 $50,881.00 $50,881.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00

102 805-N0041 1.00 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No.1 $45,636.45 $45,636.45 $241,000.00 $241,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00

103 202-0003 100.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Rock $40.00 $4,000.00 $58.00 $5,800.00 $68.00 $6,800.00

104 203-0004 600.00 C.Y. Porous Fill $95.00 $57,000.00 $175.00 $105,000.00 $77.00 $46,200.00

105 206-0003 650.00 C.Y. Trench Excavation, Earth $1.00 $650.00 $1.00 $650.00 $1.00 $650.00

106 206-0004 90.00 L.F. Trench Excavation, Electrical $200.00 $18,000.00 $160.00 $14,400.00 $1.00 $90.00

107 416-N0001 1.00 L.S. Permanent Steel Sheeting, Type Combi-Wall System $5,500,000.00 $5,500,000.00 $9,750,000.00 $9,750,000.00 $8,100,000.00 $8,100,000.00

108 601-N0152 1.00 Each Foundation, Type P (NJDOT) $5,640.94 $5,640.94 $77.00 $77.00 $10,670.00 $10,670.00

109 703-0001 7,000.00 S.Y. Topsoil $6.69 $46,830.00 $7.25 $50,750.00 $7.00 $49,000.00

110 803-N0019 1,700.00 L.F. Modular Glare Screen System To Remain $40.00 $68,000.00 $30.00 $51,000.00 $35.00 $59,500.00

$74,112,000.00 $90,308,277.00 $99,237,442.00
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