New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T835.770.204 Letting Date: 10/15/2025

BaseLine Item Detail George Harms Construction Co., Inc. Walsh Construction Company II, LLC PKF-Mark IIl, Inc. Yonkers Contracting Company, Inc. IEW Construction Group Inc.

$38,366,980.00

Page 1 of 2

$39,745,171.00

$46,493,000.00

$49,969,211.00

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $471,000.00 $471,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $153,962.21 $153,962.21

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $1,930,000.00 $1,930,000.00 $1,980,000.00 $1,980,000.00 $2,320,000.00 $2,320,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00 $4,048,000.00 $4,048,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

4 108-0001 4,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00 $1.00 $4,000.00

5 108-N0004 200,000.00 USD  Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00 $1.00 $200,000.00

6 201-0001 7.00 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $26,000.00 $182,000.00 $8,000.00 $56,000.00 $1,000.00 $7,000.00 $50,000.00 $350,000.00 $22,365.59 $156,559.13

7 202-0002 2,800.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $15.00 $42,000.00 $0.01 $28.00 $20.00 $56,000.00 $20.00 $56,000.00 $80.14 $224,392.00

9 202-0009 60,000.00 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00
10 203-0001 750.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $28.00 $21,000.00 $146.00 $109,500.00 $10.00 $7,500.00 $55.00 $41,250.00 $70.55 $52,912.50
11 205-0002 3,300.00 C.V. Coarse Aggregate Layer $80.00 $264,000.00 $77.00 $254,100.00 $62.00 $204,600.00 $125.00 $412,500.00 $82.49 $272,217.00
12 207-0001 830.00 Ton  Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 12in Thick, (D50=6in) $120.00 $99,600.00 $107.00 $88,810.00 $53.00 $43,990.00 $100.00 $83,000.00 $99.77 $82,809.10
13 207-0004 9.00 Ton RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $350.00 $3,150.00 $432.00 $3,888.00 $48.00 $432.00 $1,000.00 $9,000.00 $164.16 $1,477.44
14 207-0061 320.00 Ton  Filter Blanket $100.00 $32,000.00 $58.00 $18,560.00 $45.00 $14,400.00 $125.00 $40,000.00 $90.16 $28,851.20
15 208-0005 200.00 Ton  Temporary Stone, Grade B $190.00 $38,000.00 $88.00 $17,600.00 $46.00 $9,200.00 $100.00 $20,000.00 $106.92 $21,384.00
16 208-0006 100.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $140.00 $14,000.00 $58.00 $5,800.00 $20.00 $2,000.00 $300.00 $30,000.00 $554.57 $55,457.00
17 208-0013 5,400.00 L.F. Floating Turbidity Barriers $29.00 $156,600.00 $35.00 $189,000.00 $86.00 $464,400.00 $65.00 $351,000.00 $63.69 $343,926.00
18 208-0022 2.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $400.00 $800.00 $332.00 $664.00 $365.00 $730.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $479.22 $958.44
19 208-0024 270.00 Ton Construction Driveway $225.00 $60,750.00 $352.00 $95,040.00 $98.00 $26,460.00 $200.00 $54,000.00 $83.66 $22,588.20
20 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $2,628.00 $2,628.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $18,893.04 $18,893.04
21 208-N0002 3.00 Each Sediment Control Bags $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $475.00 $1,425.00 $320.00 $960.00 $100.00 $300.00 $979.26 $2,937.78
22 208-N0009 1.00 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $1,750.00 $1,750.00 $3,350.00 $3,350.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $1,198.43 $1,198.43
23 208-N0022 5,150.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Orange Silt Fence $14.00 $72,100.00 $40.00 $206,000.00 $8.50 $43,775.00 $25.00 $128,750.00 $14.08 $72,512.00
24 213-0002 2,230.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $72.00 $160,560.00 $87.00 $194,010.00 $50.00 $111,500.00 $75.00 $167,250.00 $24.72 $55,125.60
25 213-0003 150.00 Ton  Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous $460.00 $69,000.00 $324.00 $48,600.00 $265.00 $39,750.00 $375.00 $56,250.00 $337.84 $50,676.00
27 214-0001 1.00 L.S. Vibration and Displacement Monitoring $175,000.00 $175,000.00 $209,400.00 $209,400.00 $258,000.00 $258,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $257,284.33 $257,284.33
28 299-N0010 2,000.00 S.Y. Geotextile $6.00 $12,000.00 $4.50 $9,000.00 $1.75 $3,500.00 $2.00 $4,000.00 $7.47 $14,940.00
29 299-N0016 10,300.00 S.Y. Geogrid, Uniaxial $8.50 $87,550.00 $9.00 $92,700.00 $6.70 $69,010.00 $6.00 $61,800.00 $13.49 $138,947.00
30 299-N0017 1.00 L.S. Bubble Curtain System $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $112,154.00 $112,154.00 $264,000.00 $264,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $58,856.82 $58,856.82
31 302-0004 310.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $140.00 $43,400.00 $132.00 $40,920.00 $150.00 $46,500.00 $200.00 $62,000.00 $176.57 $54,736.70
32 302-0012 310.00 Ton  Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M E Intermediate Course $150.00 $46,500.00 $144.00 $44,640.00 $160.00 $49,600.00 $200.00 $62,000.00 $188.34 $58,385.40
33 302-0063 5,350.00 USD  Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $5,350.00 $1.00 $5,350.00 $1.00 $5,350.00 $1.00 $5,350.00 $1.00 $5,350.00
34 302-0064 560.00 GAL  Tack Coat $11.00 $6,160.00 $10.00 $5,600.00 $5.08 $2,844.80 $15.00 $8,400.00 $5.89 $3,298.40
35 302-0071 740.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $3.00 $2,220.00 $8.50 $6,290.00 $1.02 $754.80 $10.00 $7,400.00 $1.18 $873.20
36 302-N0021 200.00 Ton  Stone Matrix Asphalt 12.5 MM Surface Course $220.00 $44,000.00 $246.00 $49,200.00 $208.12 $41,624.00 $300.00 $60,000.00 $241.31 $48,262.00
37 305-0016 1,800.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 8In Depth $40.00 $72,000.00 $20.50 $36,900.00 $20.05 $36,090.00 $30.00 $54,000.00 $23.25 $41,850.00
38 403-0007 1.00 L.S. Structural Steel (Approximately 9,400,000 Lbs.) $18,620,000.00 $18,620,000.00 $17,229,608.00 $17,229,608.00 $20,793,299.40 $20,793,299.40 $19,904,116.00 $19,904,116.00 $22,407,602.03 $22,407,602.03
39 404-0004 1,302.00 MFBM Treated Timber Structures $2,750.00 $3,580,500.00 $2,622.00 $3,413,844.00 $3,002.00 $3,908,604.00 $3,600.00 $4,687,200.00 $3,262.10 $4,247,254.20
40 405-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles $3,350,000.00 $3,350,000.00 $162,677.00 $162,677.00 $8,100,000.00 $8,100,000.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $4,897,713.45 $4,897,713.45
41 405-0025 15,665.00 L.F. Furnishing 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $217.00 $3,399,305.00 $350.00 $5,482,750.00 $234.00 $3,665,610.00 $250.00 $3,916,250.00 $276.73 $4,334,975.45
42 405-0026 15,665.00 L.F. Driving 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $69.00 $1,080,885.00 $195.00 $3,054,675.00 $63.00 $986,895.00 $575.00 $9,007,375.00 $53.27 $834,474.55
43 405-0027 906.00 L.F. 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Test Piles $625.00 $566,250.00 $600.00 $543,600.00 $332.00 $300,792.00 $900.00 $815,400.00 $511.13 $463,083.78
44 405-0028 114.00 Each Splices for 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles $4,500.00 $513,000.00 $5,500.00 $627,000.00 $1.00 $114.00 $1,000.00 $114,000.00 $12,382.00 $1,411,548.00
45 405-0091 23.00 Each Dynamic Pile Load Tests $5,700.00 $131,100.00 $8,187.00 $188,301.00 $7,830.00 $180,090.00 $3,000.00 $69,000.00 $13,089.64 $301,061.72
46 415-0002 2,500.00 S.F.  Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $385.00 $962,500.00 $514.00 $1,285,000.00 $750.00 $1,875,000.00 $135.00 $337,500.00 $475.22 $1,188,050.00
47 499-N0195 21,800.00 L.F. Furnishing, Installing, and Testing Augered Cast In Place Piles, 18 In Diameter $51.00 $1,111,800.00 $68.00 $1,482,400.00 $60.00 $1,308,000.00 $190.00 $4,142,000.00 $114.11 $2,487,598.00
48 502-0006 36.00 L.F. 18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il $175.00 $6,300.00 $172.00 $6,192.00 $110.00 $3,960.00 $400.00 $14,400.00 $269.47 $9,700.92
49 502-0017 1.00 Each 18-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,351.00 $3,351.00 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,208.04 $3,208.04
50 503-N0026 1.00 Each Outlet Control Structure $37,500.00 $37,500.00 $17,314.00 $17,314.00 $18,660.00 $18,660.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $29,723.84 $29,723.84
51 503-N0045 2.00 Each Reset Frame, Type G-2 with Extension $1,400.00 $2,800.00 $1,725.00 $3,450.00 $2,015.00 $4,030.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $3,458.11 $6,916.22
52 511-N0001 460.00 L.F. Security Fence, Type IV $195.00 $89,700.00 $144.00 $66,240.00 $170.00 $78,200.00 $222.00 $102,120.00 $272.51 $125,354.60
53 511-N0002 2.00 Each Security Vehicular Gate, Type IV $8,500.00 $17,000.00 $3,930.00 $7,860.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,501.42 $5,002.84
54 517-0004 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type D $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $194,178.00 $194,178.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $52,844.86 $52,844.86
55 517-0010 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type D $6,900.00 $96,600.00 $5,442.00 $76,188.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00 $4,500.00 $63,000.00 $4,880.70 $68,329.80
56 517-0013 25,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00
57 522-0001 3.00 Each Test Pits $1,550.00 $4,650.00 $17,566.00 $52,698.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,447.69 $10,343.07
58 801-N0018 960.00 L.F. Furnishing and Placing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $90.00 $86,400.00 $268.00 $257,280.00 $70.00 $67,200.00 $125.00 $120,000.00 $99.78 $95,788.80
59 803-0032 40,000.00 USD  Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $40,000.00
60 803-N0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $127,000.00 $127,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $128,037.00 $128,037.00
61 805-0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Marine Traffic $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $89,715.00 $89,715.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $79,626.52 $79,626.52
62 805-N0041 1.00 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No.1 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $686,692.00 $686,692.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $465,000.00 $465,000.00 $89,556.98 $89,556.98

$49,981,415.59
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. T835.770.204

Ferreira Construction Co. Inc.

SPC Construction Co. LLC

A. Servidone, Inc. & B. Anthony
Construction Corp., A Joint Venture

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 108-N0004
6 201-0001
7 202-0002
9 202-0009
10 203-0001
11 205-0002
12 207-0001
13 207-0004
14 207-0061
15 208-0005
16 208-0006
17 208-0013
18 208-0022
19 208-0024
20 208-N0001
21 208-N0002
22 208-N0009
23 208-N0022
24 213-0002
25 213-0003
27 214-0001
28 299-N0010
29 299-N0016
30 299-N0017
31 302-0004
32 302-0012
33 302-0063
34 302-0064
35 302-0071
36 302-N0021
37 305-0016
38 403-0007
39 404-0004
40 405-0002
41 405-0025
42 405-0026
43 405-0027
44 405-0028
45 405-0091
46 415-0002
47 499-N0195
48 502-0006
49 502-0017
50 503-N0026
51 503-N0045
52 511-N0001
53 511-N0002
54 517-0004
55 517-0010
56 517-0013
57 522-0001
58 801-N0018
59 803-0032
60 803-N0001
61 805-0001
62 805-N0041

Qty

uoM
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
4,000.00 USD

200,000.00 USD

7.00 Acre
2,800.00 C.Y.
60,000.00 USD
750.00 C.Y.
3,300.00 C.Y.
830.00 Ton
9.00 Ton
320.00 Ton
200.00 Ton
100.00 C.Y.
5,400.00 L.F.
2.00 Each
270.00 Ton
1.00 Each
3.00 Each
1.00 Each
5,150.00 L.F.
2,230.00 Ton
150.00 Ton
1.00 L.S.
2,000.00 S.Y.
10,300.00 S.Y.
1.00 L.S.
310.00 Ton
310.00 Ton
5,350.00 USD
560.00 GAL
740.00 L.F.
200.00 Ton
1,800.00 S.Y.
1.00 L.S.

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Steel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Embankment, Common

Coarse Aggregate Layer

Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 12in Thick, (D50=6in)
RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in)
Filter Blanket

Temporary Stone, Grade B

Hay Bales

Floating Turbidity Barriers

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Construction Driveway

Concrete Washout Facility

Sediment Control Bags

Qil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1

Heavy Duty Orange Silt Fence

Disposal of Regulated Material

Disposal of Regulated Material, Hazardous
Vibration and Displacement Monitoring
Geotextile

Geogrid, Uniaxial

Bubble Curtain System

Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course

Hot Mix Asphalt 19 M E Intermediate Course
Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Tack Coat

Polymerized Joint Adhesive

Stone Matrix Asphalt 12.5 MM Surface Course
Pavement Removal, 8In Depth

Structural Steel (Approximately 9,400,000 Lbs.)

1,302.00 MFBM Treated Timber Structures

1.00 L.S.
15,665.00 L.F.
15,665.00 L.F.

906.00 L.F.
114.00 Each
23.00 Each
2,500.00 S.F.
21,800.00 L.F.
36.00 L.F.

1.00 Each

1.00 Each

2.00 Each

460.00 L.F.

2.00 Each

1.00 L.S.

14.00 Mnth
25,000.00 USD
3.00 Each
960.00 L.F.
40,000.00 USD

1.00 L.S.

1.00 L.S.

1.00 L.S.

Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles

Furnishing 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles

Driving 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles

42in Diameter Steel Pipe Test Piles

Splices for 42in Diameter Steel Pipe Piles

Dynamic Pile Load Tests

Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place

Furnishing, Installing, and Testing Augered Cast In Place Piles, 18 In Diameter
18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Il

18-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section

Outlet Control Structure

Reset Frame, Type G-2 with Extension

Security Fence, Type IV

Security Vehicular Gate, Type IV

Furnish Field Office, Type D

Maintain Field Office, Type D

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Furnishing and Placing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier
Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)

Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways
Maintenance and Protection of Marine Traffic

Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No.1

Unit Price
$250,000.00
$2,400,000.00
$40,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$18,000.00
$35.00
$1.00
$120.00
$90.00
$100.00
$300.00
$105.00
$100.00
$150.00
$24.00
$2,000.00
$200.00
$5,000.00
$1,000.00
$1,500.00
$12.00
$70.00
$300.00
$360,000.00
$10.00
$11.00
$75,000.00
$150.00
$160.00
$1.00
$11.00
$9.00
$400.00
$25.00
$31,869,460.00
$2,500.00
$800,000.00
$220.00
$185.00
$550.00
$4,600.00
$6,000.00
$310.00
$45.00
$300.00
$10,000.00
$25,000.00
$750.00
$200.00
$15,000.00
$40,000.00
$5,000.00
$1.00
$500.00
$75.00
$1.00
$200,000.00
$25,000.00
$10,000.00

Line Total

$250,000.00
$2,400,000.00
$40,000.00
$4,000.00
$200,000.00
$126,000.00
$98,000.00
$60,000.00
$90,000.00
$297,000.00
$83,000.00
$2,700.00
$33,600.00
$20,000.00
$15,000.00
$129,600.00
$4,000.00
$54,000.00
$5,000.00
$3,000.00
$1,500.00
$61,800.00
$156,100.00
$45,000.00
$360,000.00
$20,000.00
$113,300.00
$75,000.00
$46,500.00
$49,600.00
$5,350.00
$6,160.00
$6,660.00
$80,000.00
$45,000.00
$31,869,460.00
$3,255,000.00
$800,000.00
$3,446,300.00
$2,898,025.00
$498,300.00
$524,400.00
$138,000.00
$775,000.00
$981,000.00
$10,800.00
$10,000.00
$25,000.00
$1,500.00
$92,000.00
$30,000.00
$40,000.00
$70,000.00
$25,000.00
$1,500.00
$72,000.00
$40,000.00
$200,000.00
$25,000.00
$10,000.00

$50,825,155.00

Page 2 of 2

Unit Price
$400,000.00
$2,650,000.00
$50,800.00
$1.00
$1.00
$19,000.00
$120.00
$1.00
$70.00
$121.00
$125.00
$100.00
$260.00
$180.00
$416.00
$35.00
$460.00
$326.00
$6,000.00
$925.00
$1,975.00
$30.00
$60.00
$500.00
$300,000.00
$40.00
$20.00
$300,000.00
$224.00
$240.00
$1.00
$5.70
$5.70
$339.00
$49.00
$22,840,000.00
$5,600.00
$2,500,000.00
$400.00
$410.00
$1,500.00
$3,300.00
$14,000.00
$700.00
$105.00
$290.00
$2,000.00
$16,000.00
$4,500.00
$160.00
$4,280.00
$85,000.00
$8,500.00
$1.00
$4,500.00
$150.00
$1.00
$300,000.00
$80,000.00
$300,000.00

Line Total

$400,000.00
$2,650,000.00
$50,800.00
$4,000.00
$200,000.00
$133,000.00
$336,000.00
$60,000.00
$52,500.00
$399,300.00
$103,750.00
$900.00
$83,200.00
$36,000.00
$41,600.00
$189,000.00
$920.00
$88,020.00
$6,000.00
$2,775.00
$1,975.00
$154,500.00
$133,800.00
$75,000.00
$300,000.00
$80,000.00
$206,000.00
$300,000.00
$69,440.00
$74,400.00
$5,350.00
$3,192.00
$4,218.00
$67,800.00
$88,200.00
$22,840,000.00
$7,291,200.00
$2,500,000.00
$6,266,000.00
$6,422,650.00
$1,359,000.00
$376,200.00
$322,000.00
$1,750,000.00
$2,289,000.00
$10,440.00
$2,000.00
$16,000.00
$9,000.00
$73,600.00
$8,560.00
$85,000.00
$119,000.00
$25,000.00
$13,500.00
$144,000.00
$40,000.00
$300,000.00
$80,000.00
$300,000.00

$59,043,790.00

Unit Price
$500,000.00
$3,680,000.00
$65,000.00
$1.00
$1.00
$5,180.00
$46.00
$1.00
$40.00
$85.00
$84.00
$310.00
$80.00
$139.00
$355.00
$74.00
$187.00
$139.00
$10,000.00
$2,300.00
$2,000.00
$14.50
$47.00
$304.00
$380,000.00
$5.00
$14.00
$530,000.00
$150.00
$160.00
$1.00
$5.00
$1.00
$205.00
$19.75
$34,723,500.00
$4,975.00
$14,534,466.00
$289.00
$95.00
$515.00
$1.00
$2,935.00
$497.00
$103.00
$190.00
$8,725.00
$24,885.00
$2,000.00
$231.50
$2,125.00
$114,500.00
$2,750.00
$1.00
$1,915.00
$81.25
$1.00
$100,000.00
$50,000.00
$150,000.00

Line Total

$500,000.00
$3,680,000.00
$65,000.00
$4,000.00
$200,000.00
$36,260.00
$128,800.00
$60,000.00
$30,000.00
$280,500.00
$69,720.00
$2,790.00
$25,600.00
$27,800.00
$35,500.00
$399,600.00
$374.00
$37,530.00
$10,000.00
$6,900.00
$2,000.00
$74,675.00
$104,810.00
$45,600.00
$380,000.00
$10,000.00
$144,200.00
$530,000.00
$46,500.00
$49,600.00
$5,350.00
$2,800.00
$740.00
$41,000.00
$35,550.00
$34,723,500.00
$6,477,450.00
$14,534,466.00
$4,527,185.00
$1,488,175.00
$466,590.00
$114.00
$67,505.00
$1,242,500.00
$2,245,400.00
$6,840.00
$8,725.00
$24,885.00
$4,000.00
$106,490.00
$4,250.00
$114,500.00
$38,500.00
$25,000.00
$5,745.00
$78,000.00
$40,000.00
$100,000.00
$50,000.00
$150,000.00
$73,603,019.00

Letting Date: 10/15/2025
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