
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.676 Letting Date: 10/15/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $687,195.63 $687,195.63 $459,453.24 $459,453.24 $698,869.50 $698,869.50 $915,000.00 $915,000.00 $1,824,329.00 $1,824,329.00

2 108-0001 230,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $230,000.00 $1.00 $230,000.00 $1.00 $230,000.00 $1.00 $230,000.00 $1.00 $230,000.00

3 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,372.50 $5,372.50 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

4 302-0063 585,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $585,000.00 $1.00 $585,000.00 $1.00 $585,000.00 $1.00 $585,000.00 $1.00 $585,000.00

5 302-0071 333,000.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.01 $3,330.00 $0.28 $93,240.00 $0.63 $209,790.00 $0.35 $116,550.00 $0.36 $119,880.00

6 302-0072 90.00 Each Bituminous Core Samples $75.00 $6,750.00 $0.01 $0.90 $50.00 $4,500.00 $170.00 $15,300.00 $100.00 $9,000.00

7 302-N0004 74,000.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $97.00 $7,178,000.00 $86.71 $6,416,540.00 $99.46 $7,360,040.00 $107.00 $7,918,000.00 $105.50 $7,807,000.00

8 302-N0007 61,000.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $3.50 $213,500.00 $0.01 $610.00 $3.85 $234,850.00 $4.00 $244,000.00 $3.90 $237,900.00

9 302-N0013 2,000,000.00 USD Unanticipated Roadway Resurfacing (No Bid) $1.00 $2,000,000.00 $1.00 $2,000,000.00 $1.00 $2,000,000.00 $1.00 $2,000,000.00 $1.00 $2,000,000.00

10 302-N0023 16,000.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course, Echelon Paving $112.50 $1,800,000.00 $85.73 $1,371,680.00 $97.00 $1,552,000.00 $100.00 $1,600,000.00 $107.33 $1,717,280.00

11 305-0015 500,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 1/2in Depth $2.70 $1,350,000.00 $3.20 $1,600,000.00 $5.08 $2,540,000.00 $4.25 $2,125,000.00 $4.30 $2,150,000.00

12 306-0001 142,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.35 $49,700.00 $0.28 $39,760.00 $0.43 $61,060.00 $0.30 $42,600.00 $0.35 $49,700.00

13 503-0002 5.00 Each Reset Frame, Various Types with Extensions $200.00 $1,000.00 $250.00 $1,250.00 $700.00 $3,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $650.00 $3,250.00

14 503-0009 10.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $500.00 $5,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $2,175.00 $21,750.00 $1,800.00 $18,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00

15 503-0293 5.00 Each Reset Frames $425.00 $2,125.00 $500.00 $2,500.00 $275.00 $1,375.00 $1,100.00 $5,500.00 $900.00 $4,500.00

16 505-0001 5,000.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $0.01 $50.00 $1.00 $5,000.00 $0.01 $50.00 $5.00 $25,000.00 $5.00 $25,000.00

17 516-0002 282,000.00 L.F. Diamond Grinding $0.50 $141,000.00 $1.45 $408,900.00 $1.25 $352,500.00 $1.70 $479,400.00 $1.52 $428,640.00

18 516-0008 9,800.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $1.30 $12,740.00 $1.25 $12,250.00 $1.50 $14,700.00 $1.50 $14,700.00 $1.31 $12,838.00

19 516-0009 190,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $1.65 $313,500.00 $1.60 $304,000.00 $1.50 $285,000.00 $1.50 $285,000.00 $1.68 $319,200.00

20 516-0011 67,000.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $0.01 $670.00 $1.25 $83,750.00 $1.44 $96,480.00 $1.50 $100,500.00 $1.31 $87,770.00

21 516-0013 230.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $5.00 $1,150.00 $10.00 $2,300.00 $8.00 $1,840.00 $8.25 $1,897.50 $10.50 $2,415.00

22 516-N0020 80,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Permanent Tape $0.01 $800.00 $5.50 $440,000.00 $5.25 $420,000.00 $5.00 $400,000.00 $5.77 $461,600.00

23 516-N0023 12,000.00 L.F. Contrast Traffic Stripes, Permanent Tape $10.00 $120,000.00 $9.25 $111,000.00 $10.00 $120,000.00 $10.50 $126,000.00 $9.71 $116,520.00

24 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $3,095.00 $3,095.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

25 517-0008 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $4,500.00 $63,000.00 $1,500.00 $21,000.00 $2,975.00 $41,650.00 $3,800.00 $53,200.00 $4,500.00 $63,000.00

26 517-0013 25,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00

27 709-N0002 3,800.00 S.Y. Berm Repair Strip $0.01 $38.00 $1.00 $3,800.00 $0.01 $38.00 $7.35 $27,930.00 $5.00 $19,000.00

28 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $977,455.55 $977,455.55 $652,265.00 $652,265.00 $505,000.00 $505,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00

29 801-0007 1,200.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $0.01 $12.00 $1.00 $1,200.00 $0.01 $12.00 $5.00 $6,000.00 $1.00 $1,200.00

30 801-0008 250.00 M.H. Flaggers $0.01 $2.50 $1.00 $250.00 $0.01 $2.50 $5.00 $1,250.00 $1.00 $250.00

31 305-N0007 107,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 1/2in Depth, Echelon Paving $2.85 $304,950.00 $2.75 $294,250.00 $4.09 $437,630.00 $3.40 $363,800.00 $4.58 $490,060.00

$15,359,513.13 $15,499,590.69 $17,957,997.00 $18,270,000.00 $19,005,332.00

D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc. Schifano Construction Corp.BaseLine Item Detail Stavola Contracting Company, LLC Crisdel Group, Inc.Earle Asphalt Company
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T200.676 Letting Date: 10/15/2025

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description

1 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization

2 108-0001 230,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

3 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing

4 302-0063 585,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

5 302-0071 333,000.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive

6 302-0072 90.00 Each Bituminous Core Samples

7 302-N0004 74,000.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course

8 302-N0007 61,000.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat

9 302-N0013 2,000,000.00 USD Unanticipated Roadway Resurfacing (No Bid)

10 302-N0023 16,000.00 Ton Warm Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course, Echelon Paving

11 305-0015 500,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 1/2in Depth

12 306-0001 142,000.00 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip

13 503-0002 5.00 Each Reset Frame, Various Types with Extensions

14 503-0009 10.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame

15 503-0293 5.00 Each Reset Frames

16 505-0001 5,000.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb

17 516-0002 282,000.00 L.F. Diamond Grinding

18 516-0008 9,800.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin

19 516-0009 190,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

20 516-0011 67,000.00 L.F. Traffic Markings, Lines, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

21 516-0013 230.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

22 516-N0020 80,000.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long Life, Permanent Tape

23 516-N0023 12,000.00 L.F. Contrast Traffic Stripes, Permanent Tape

24 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B

25 517-0008 14.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B

26 517-0013 25,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

27 709-N0002 3,800.00 S.Y. Berm Repair Strip

28 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

29 801-0007 1,200.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time

30 801-0008 250.00 M.H. Flaggers

31 305-N0007 107,000.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 1/2in Depth, Echelon Paving

BaseLine Item Detail

Unit Price Line Total

$1,499,982.12 $1,499,982.12

$1.00 $230,000.00

$25,000.00 $25,000.00

$1.00 $585,000.00

$1.80 $599,400.00

$370.00 $33,300.00

$145.00 $10,730,000.00

$4.50 $274,500.00

$1.00 $2,000,000.00

$134.00 $2,144,000.00

$10.00 $5,000,000.00

$1.00 $142,000.00

$300.00 $1,500.00

$1,800.00 $18,000.00

$1,500.00 $7,500.00

$0.01 $50.00

$1.60 $451,200.00

$1.60 $15,680.00

$1.60 $304,000.00

$1.55 $103,850.00

$8.50 $1,955.00

$5.60 $448,000.00

$11.00 $132,000.00

$20,000.00 $20,000.00

$5,000.00 $70,000.00

$1.00 $25,000.00

$14.25 $54,150.00

$1,900,000.00 $1,900,000.00

$145.00 $174,000.00

$0.01 $2.50

$8.25 $882,750.00

$27,872,819.62

C. J. Hesse, Inc.
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