
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A900.655 Letting Date: 8/23/2022

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $13,000.00 $13,000.00 $47,000.00 $47,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $271,730.00 $271,730.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00 $107,508.59 $107,508.59 $301,676.62 $301,676.62 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,700.00 $4,700.00 $15,706.76 $15,706.76 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $36,949.00 $36,949.00 $77,605.00 $77,605.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00

6 202-0009 15,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

7 203-0002 392.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $56.41 $22,112.72 $33.00 $12,936.00 $0.01 $3.92 $80.00 $31,360.00 $1.00 $392.00

8 206-0003 2,494.00 C.Y. Trench Excavation, Earth $11.23 $28,007.62 $24.00 $59,856.00 $0.01 $24.94 $1.00 $2,494.00 $5.00 $12,470.00

9 208-0006 6.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $124.95 $749.70 $50.00 $300.00 $0.01 $0.06 $275.00 $1,650.00 $250.00 $1,500.00

10 208-0008 4,599.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $5.72 $26,306.28 $9.00 $41,391.00 $3.50 $16,096.50 $6.00 $27,594.00 $12.00 $55,188.00

11 208-0022 15.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $52.21 $783.15 $200.00 $3,000.00 $150.00 $2,250.00 $165.00 $2,475.00 $250.00 $3,750.00

12 208-0024 24.00 Ton Construction Driveway $200.85 $4,820.40 $80.00 $1,920.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $100.00 $2,400.00 $115.00 $2,760.00

13 213-0002 30.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $138.31 $4,149.30 $76.00 $2,280.00 $65.00 $1,950.00 $150.00 $4,500.00 $75.00 $2,250.00

14 301-0001 663.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5in Thick $10.50 $6,961.50 $9.00 $5,967.00 $7.00 $4,641.00 $23.00 $15,249.00 $21.00 $13,923.00

15 301-N0002 114 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $22.08 $2,517.12 $11.00 $1,254.00 $9.00 $1,026.00 $45.00 $5,130.00 $26.00 $2,964.00

16 302-0002 122.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $470.75 $57,431.50 $170.00 $20,740.00 $235.00 $28,670.00 $440.00 $53,680.00 $1,175.00 $143,350.00

17 302-0004 247 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $127.71 $31,544.37 $93.00 $22,971.00 $175.00 $43,225.00 $160.00 $39,520.00 $190.00 $46,930.00

18 302-N0007 20.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat $36.41 $728.20 $3.50 $70.00 $5.00 $100.00 $4.00 $80.00 $19.00 $380.00

19 504-0011 5.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $1,536.12 $7,680.60 $725.00 $3,625.00 $75.00 $375.00 $2,500.00 $12,500.00 $400.00 $2,000.00

20 506-0001 365.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A $57.01 $20,808.65 $58.00 $21,170.00 $35.00 $12,775.00 $42.00 $15,330.00 $75.00 $27,375.00

21 510-0008 50 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail $68.25 $3,412.50 $77.00 $3,850.00 $100.00 $5,000.00 $76.00 $3,800.00 $50.00 $2,500.00

22 511-0004 60 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 96in High $73.50 $4,410.00 $213.00 $12,780.00 $100.00 $6,000.00 $212.00 $12,720.00 $100.00 $6,000.00

23 514-0001 23 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $282.74 $6,503.02 $60.00 $1,380.00 $85.00 $1,955.00 $176.00 $4,048.00 $450.00 $10,350.00

24 514-N0001 2 S.Y. Detectable Warning Surface $465.45 $930.90 $205.00 $410.00 $100.00 $200.00 $333.00 $666.00 $285.00 $570.00

25 516-0009 700.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $4.20 $2,940.00 $4.50 $3,150.00 $3.50 $2,450.00 $6.00 $4,200.00 $25.00 $17,500.00

26 516-N0001 404 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8in Wide $4.20 $1,696.80 $6.00 $2,424.00 $2.50 $1,010.00 $10.25 $4,141.00 $3.00 $1,212.00

27 517-0001 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A $7,868.42 $7,868.42 $23,400.00 $23,400.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00

28 517-0007 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A $3,872.91 $46,474.92 $3,650.00 $43,800.00 $2,250.00 $27,000.00 $1,875.00 $22,500.00 $500.00 $6,000.00

29 517-0013 8,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

30 522-0001 34 Each Test Pits $436.23 $14,831.82 $900.00 $30,600.00 $125.00 $4,250.00 $600.00 $20,400.00 $200.00 $6,800.00

31 532-N0001 3 Each 4in Gate Valve and Valve Box $1,271.20 $3,813.60 $1,550.00 $4,650.00 $2,300.00 $6,900.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00 $1,800.00 $5,400.00

32 532-N0002 6.00 Each 6in Gate Valve and Valve Box $1,595.96 $9,575.76 $1,750.00 $10,500.00 $2,600.00 $15,600.00 $1,875.00 $11,250.00 $2,250.00 $13,500.00

33 532-N0005 630 L.F. 4in Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 350 $117.70 $74,151.00 $145.00 $91,350.00 $105.00 $66,150.00 $100.00 $63,000.00 $160.00 $100,800.00

34 532-N0006 1,845.00 L.F. 6in Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 350 $103.74 $191,400.30 $126.00 $232,470.00 $109.45 $201,935.25 $90.00 $166,050.00 $200.00 $369,000.00

35 532-N0014 1 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies $8,565.54 $8,565.54 $6,600.00 $6,600.00 $13,500.00 $13,500.00 $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $10,072.00 $10,072.00

36 532-N0019 1.00 Each 3in Gate Valve and Valve Box $1,244.30 $1,244.30 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $3,400.00 $3,400.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00

37 534-0001 146.00 L.F. 12 Inch Trenchless Installation $933.33 $136,266.18 $1,100.00 $160,600.00 $2,350.00 $343,100.00 $1,325.00 $193,450.00 $1,167.00 $170,382.00

38 599-N0022 10 Each Bollards $1,023.75 $10,237.50 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $500.00 $5,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00

39 599-N0023 1,255.00 L.F. 2in Copper Water Pipe, Type K $65.11 $81,713.05 $90.00 $112,950.00 $80.00 $100,400.00 $76.00 $95,380.00 $141.00 $176,955.00

40 599-N0024 5.00 Each 2in Water Valve $475.97 $2,379.85 $650.00 $3,250.00 $1,800.00 $9,000.00 $1,300.00 $6,500.00 $1,850.00 $9,250.00

41 599-N0148 38.00 L.F. 4in Steel Casing $334.71 $12,718.98 $27.00 $1,026.00 $285.00 $10,830.00 $182.00 $6,916.00 $100.00 $3,800.00

42 599-N0150 20.00 L.F. 3in Copper Water Pipe, Type K $234.79 $4,695.80 $107.00 $2,140.00 $300.00 $6,000.00 $240.00 $4,800.00 $150.00 $3,000.00

43 599-N0170 614.00 L.F. 2in HDPE Water Pipe $67.27 $41,303.78 $60.00 $36,840.00 $65.00 $39,910.00 $60.00 $36,840.00 $150.00 $92,100.00

44 599-N0171 1.00 Each Water Meter Enclosure $18,697.26 $18,697.26 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00

45 602-N0019 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1 $28,875.00 $28,875.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $32,500.00 $32,500.00 $37,500.00 $37,500.00

46 703-0001 3,395.00 S.Y. Topsoil $5.25 $17,823.75 $6.00 $20,370.00 $7.50 $25,462.50 $8.00 $27,160.00 $6.00 $20,370.00

47 704-0001 3,395.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $3.41 $11,576.95 $3.00 $10,185.00 $1.50 $5,092.50 $4.00 $13,580.00 $12.00 $40,740.00

48 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $17,173.52 $17,173.52 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $127,600.00 $127,600.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

49 801-0002 1,000.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $14.86 $14,860.00 $20.00 $20,000.00 $18.50 $18,500.00 $80.00 $80,000.00 $5.00 $5,000.00

50 801-0003 1,000.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $34.29 $34,290.00 $70.00 $70,000.00 $12.50 $12,500.00 $41.00 $41,000.00 $75.00 $75,000.00

51 801-0008 54.00 M.H. Flaggers $138.62 $7,485.48 $114.00 $6,156.00 $115.00 $6,210.00 $120.00 $6,480.00 $10.00 $540.00

52 801-0009 3 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $1,260.00 $3,780.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $4,500.00 $13,500.00 $700.00 $2,100.00

53 801-0013 4 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $250.00 $1,000.00 $8,500.00 $34,000.00 $2,500.00 $10,000.00 $13,200.00 $52,800.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00

54 801-0015 3 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $2,799.04 $8,397.12 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $0.03 $15,700.00 $47,100.00 $100.00 $300.00

55 801-0018 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH $2,851.80 $5,703.60 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $6,300.00 $12,600.00 $5,500.00 $11,000.00

56 801-0019 2 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH $2,444.77 $4,889.54 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,250.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $10,500.00 $21,000.00

57 801-N0001 8 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $7,310.95 $58,487.60 $105.00 $840.00 $0.01 $0.08 $3,600.00 $28,800.00 $3,500.00 $28,000.00

$1,494,504.95 $1,497,750.00 $1,597,613.13 $1,733,019.62 $1,743,973.00 

BaseLine Item Detail Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Earle Asphalt CompanyCrisdel Group, Inc. C. J. Hesse, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A900.655 Letting Date: 8/23/2022

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing

6 202-0009 15,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)

7 203-0002 392.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A

8 206-0003 2,494.00 C.Y. Trench Excavation, Earth

9 208-0006 6.00 C.Y. Hay Bales

10 208-0008 4,599.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence

11 208-0022 15.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2

12 208-0024 24.00 Ton Construction Driveway

13 213-0002 30.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material

14 301-0001 663.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6.5in Thick

15 301-N0002 114 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick

16 302-0002 122.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course

17 302-0004 247 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course

18 302-N0007 20.00 GAL Trackless Tack Coat

19 504-0011 5.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete

20 506-0001 365.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type A

21 510-0008 50 L.F. Reset Beam Guide Rail

22 511-0004 60 L.F. Chain Link Fence, Type II, 96in High

23 514-0001 23 S.Y. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

24 514-N0001 2 S.Y. Detectable Warning Surface

25 516-0009 700.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic

26 516-N0001 404 L.F. Removable Black Line Mask, 8in Wide

27 517-0001 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type A

28 517-0007 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type A

29 517-0013 8,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

30 522-0001 34 Each Test Pits

31 532-N0001 3 Each 4in Gate Valve and Valve Box

32 532-N0002 6.00 Each 6in Gate Valve and Valve Box

33 532-N0005 630 L.F. 4in Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 350

34 532-N0006 1,845.00 L.F. 6in Ductile Iron Water Pipe, Class 350

35 532-N0014 1 Each Fire Hydrant Assemblies

36 532-N0019 1.00 Each 3in Gate Valve and Valve Box

37 534-0001 146.00 L.F. 12 Inch Trenchless Installation

38 599-N0022 10 Each Bollards

39 599-N0023 1,255.00 L.F. 2in Copper Water Pipe, Type K

40 599-N0024 5.00 Each 2in Water Valve

41 599-N0148 38.00 L.F. 4in Steel Casing

42 599-N0150 20.00 L.F. 3in Copper Water Pipe, Type K

43 599-N0170 614.00 L.F. 2in HDPE Water Pipe

44 599-N0171 1.00 Each Water Meter Enclosure

45 602-N0019 1.00 L.S. Electrical Work at Location No. 1

46 703-0001 3,395.00 S.Y. Topsoil

47 704-0001 3,395.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A

48 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

49 801-0002 1,000.00 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier

50 801-0003 1,000.00 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier

51 801-0008 54.00 M.H. Flaggers

52 801-0009 3 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign

53 801-0013 4 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator

54 801-0015 3 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators

55 801-0018 2 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH

56 801-0019 2 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Array), 70 MPH

57 801-N0001 8 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing

BaseLine Item Detail

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

$27,500.00 $27,500.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00

$105,000.00 $105,000.00 $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $383,072.59 $383,072.59 $135,000.00 $135,000.00

$10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00

$1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

$65,000.00 $65,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

$1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

$40.00 $15,680.00 $80.00 $31,360.00 $50.00 $19,600.00 $35.00 $13,720.00

$0.01 $24.94 $50.00 $124,700.00 $15.00 $37,410.00 $40.00 $99,760.00

$45.00 $270.00 $25.00 $150.00 $0.01 $0.06 $15.00 $90.00

$7.75 $35,642.25 $8.00 $36,792.00 $10.00 $45,990.00 $20.00 $91,980.00

$250.00 $3,750.00 $450.00 $6,750.00 $175.00 $2,625.00 $75.00 $1,125.00

$87.00 $2,088.00 $250.00 $6,000.00 $0.01 $0.24 $100.00 $2,400.00

$92.00 $2,760.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $100.00 $3,000.00

$10.00 $6,630.00 $45.00 $29,835.00 $19.00 $12,597.00 $35.00 $23,205.00

$12.00 $1,368.00 $55.00 $6,270.00 $19.00 $2,166.00 $45.00 $5,130.00

$100.00 $12,200.00 $285.00 $34,770.00 $325.00 $39,650.00 $500.00 $61,000.00

$100.00 $24,700.00 $300.00 $74,100.00 $190.00 $46,930.00 $225.00 $55,575.00

$25.00 $500.00 $10.00 $200.00 $60.00 $1,200.00 $15.00 $300.00

$650.00 $3,250.00 $600.00 $3,000.00 $300.00 $1,500.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00

$55.00 $20,075.00 $60.00 $21,900.00 $70.00 $25,550.00 $150.00 $54,750.00

$75.00 $3,750.00 $105.00 $5,250.00 $105.00 $5,250.00 $100.00 $5,000.00

$175.00 $10,500.00 $80.00 $4,800.00 $130.00 $7,800.00 $135.00 $8,100.00

$140.00 $3,220.00 $320.00 $7,360.00 $200.00 $4,600.00 $125.00 $2,875.00

$500.00 $1,000.00 $250.00 $500.00 $900.00 $1,800.00 $300.00 $600.00

$5.00 $3,500.00 $4.00 $2,800.00 $4.75 $3,325.00 $7.75 $5,425.00

$0.01 $4.04 $4.00 $1,616.00 $4.75 $1,919.00 $6.75 $2,727.00

$15,000.00 $15,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00

$4,200.00 $50,400.00 $3,000.00 $36,000.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00 $2,000.00 $24,000.00

$1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00 $1.00 $8,000.00

$350.00 $11,900.00 $1,200.00 $40,800.00 $500.00 $17,000.00 $600.00 $20,400.00

$5,000.00 $15,000.00 $2,800.00 $8,400.00 $3,800.00 $11,400.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00

$7,500.00 $45,000.00 $3,200.00 $19,200.00 $3,700.00 $22,200.00 $2,250.00 $13,500.00

$135.00 $85,050.00 $115.00 $72,450.00 $90.00 $56,700.00 $140.00 $88,200.00

$150.00 $276,750.00 $116.00 $214,020.00 $100.00 $184,500.00 $170.00 $313,650.00

$12,500.00 $12,500.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

$4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,600.00 $2,600.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00

$1,200.00 $175,200.00 $1,150.00 $167,900.00 $2,600.00 $379,600.00 $1,250.00 $182,500.00

$2,000.00 $20,000.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 $2,500.00 $25,000.00 $3,500.00 $35,000.00

$85.00 $106,675.00 $80.00 $100,400.00 $15.50 $19,452.50 $125.00 $156,875.00

$2,000.00 $10,000.00 $1,200.00 $6,000.00 $2,100.00 $10,500.00 $1,250.00 $6,250.00

$500.00 $19,000.00 $1,150.00 $43,700.00 $265.00 $10,070.00 $325.00 $12,350.00

$200.00 $4,000.00 $280.00 $5,600.00 $400.00 $8,000.00 $330.00 $6,600.00

$100.00 $61,400.00 $50.00 $30,700.00 $26.00 $15,964.00 $100.00 $61,400.00

$100,000.00 $100,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00

$75,000.00 $75,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $44,000.00 $44,000.00

$5.00 $16,975.00 $10.00 $33,950.00 $6.00 $20,370.00 $10.00 $33,950.00

$1.00 $3,395.00 $2.00 $6,790.00 $2.40 $8,148.00 $2.00 $6,790.00

$200,000.00 $200,000.00 $63,500.00 $63,500.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

$1.00 $1,000.00 $80.00 $80,000.00 $0.01 $10.00 $30.00 $30,000.00

$30.00 $30,000.00 $30.00 $30,000.00 $30.00 $30,000.00 $50.00 $50,000.00

$120.00 $6,480.00 $101.00 $5,454.00 $0.01 $0.54 $120.00 $6,480.00

$2,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,000.00 $12,000.00 $15,000.00 $45,000.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00

$5,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,000.00 $28,000.00 $0.01 $0.04 $4,000.00 $16,000.00

$1.00 $3.00 $200.00 $600.00 $0.01 $0.03 $500.00 $1,500.00

$5,000.00 $10,000.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $7,000.00 $14,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00

$3,750.00 $7,500.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00

$5,500.00 $44,000.00 $9,300.00 $74,400.00 $7,000.00 $56,000.00 $12,000.00 $96,000.00

$1,816,140.23 $1,947,367.00 $2,050,000.00 $2,132,957.00 

Green Construction, Inc. Montana Construction Corp Inc.Union Paving & Construction Co., Inc. Mount Construction Co., Inc.
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