New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaseLine Item Detail

Contract No. A500.591-1

H & S Construction and Mechanical

Shorelands Construction Inc.

Item No. Unit Code

1 104-0002
2 599-N0003
3 2000-N00O6
4 2000-N0OO7
5 2000-N0O0O8
6 2000-N009
7 2000-NO10
8 2000-N011
9 2000-NO12
10 2000-N0O15
11 2000-NO16
12 2000-NO17
13 2000-NO18
14 2000-N025
15 2000-NO53
16 2000-N0O55
17 2000-NO57
18 2000-N026
19 2000-N058
20 2000-N059
21 2000-N060
22 2000-N047
23 2000-N054
24 2000-N056
25 2000-N061
26 2000-N062
27 2000-N063
28 2000-N064
29 2000-N065
30 2000-N030

Qty UuoM

1LS.
100,000.00 USD
25000 USD
25,000.00 USD
5000 USD
1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.

1.00 L.S.
1LS.
50,000.00 USD

Description

Mobilization

Project Allowances (No-Bid)

Lead and Asbestos Survey, Report and Monitoring (NO-BID)
Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID)

Removal of Lead-Based Materials (NO-BID)
Building Electric Work - Location No. 1
Building Electric Work - Location No. 2
Building Electric Work - Location No. 3
Building Electric Work - Location No. 4
Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1
Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 2
Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3
Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 4
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 3
Building Architectural Work - Location No. 4
Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 1
Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 2
Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 3
Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 4
Building Structural Work - Location No. 1
Building Structural Work - Location No. 2
Building Structural Work - Location No. 3
Building Structural Work - Location No. 4
Building Equipment - Location No. 1
Building Equipment - Location No. 2
Building Equipment - Location No. 3
Building Equipment - Location No. 4

NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid)

Unit Price

$50,000.00
$1.00

$1.00

$1.00

$1.00
$425,850.00
$73,378.00
$89,596.00
$209,610.00
$221,669.00
$47,010.00
$65,620.00
$699,647.00
$52,900.00
$17,603.00
$78,710.00
$169,231.00
$32,822.00
$30,226.00
$29,161.00
$27,977.00
$105,065.00
$24,969.00
$38,106.00
$70,794.00
$631,076.00
$252,958.00
$357,018.00
$459,424.00
$1.00

Line Total

$50,000.00
$100,000.00
$25,000.00
$25,000.00
$5,000.00
$425,850.00
$73,378.00
$89,596.00
$209,610.00
$221,669.00
$47,010.00
$65,620.00
$699,647.00
$52,900.00
$17,603.00
$78,710.00
$169,231.00
$32,822.00
$30,226.00
$29,161.00
$27,977.00
$105,065.00
$24,969.00
$38,106.00
$70,794.00
$631,076.00
$252,958.00
$357,018.00
$459,424.00
$50,000.00
$4,465,420.00

Unit Price

$150,000.00
$1.00

$1.00

$1.00

$1.00
$973,000.00
$95,000.00
$113,000.00
$328,000.00
$198,000.00
$40,000.00
$44,000.00
$814,000.00
$153,000.00
$61,000.00
$53,000.00
$65,000.00
$322,000.00
$92,000.00
$133,000.00
$171,000.00
$28,000.00
$129,000.00
$67,000.00
$122,000.00
$213,000.00
$136,000.00
$199,000.00
$257,000.00
$1.00
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Line Total

$150,000.00
$100,000.00
$25,000.00
$25,000.00
$5,000.00
$973,000.00
$95,000.00
$113,000.00
$328,000.00
$198,000.00
$40,000.00
$44,000.00
$814,000.00
$153,000.00
$61,000.00
$53,000.00
$65,000.00
$322,000.00
$92,000.00
$133,000.00
$171,000.00
$28,000.00
$129,000.00
$67,000.00
$122,000.00
$213,000.00
$136,000.00
$199,000.00
$257,000.00
$50,000.00
$5,161,000.00

Letting Date: 4/5/2022
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