
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. A500.611 Letting Date: 7/1/2021

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $155,000.00 $155,000.00

3 108-0001 10,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

4 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $99,000.00 $99,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00

5 202-0002 500.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $53.25 $26,625.00 $38.00 $19,000.00 $125.00 $62,500.00

6 205-0001 120.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $92.00 $11,040.00 $40.00 $4,800.00 $85.00 $10,200.00

7 202-0009 10,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $10,000.00

8 205-0002 142.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $114.00 $16,188.00 $45.00 $6,390.00 $180.00 $25,560.00

9 208-0022 1.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $250.00 $250.00 $650.00 $650.00 $700.00 $700.00

10 208-N0011 1,450.00 L.F. Compost Filter Sock, 12in $11.00 $15,950.00 $25.00 $36,250.00 $12.00 $17,400.00

11 213-0002 400.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $60.00 $24,000.00 $60.00 $24,000.00 $98.00 $39,200.00

12 301-0002 170.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $16.00 $2,720.00 $15.00 $2,550.00 $36.00 $6,120.00

13 301-N0002 993.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 8 in Thick $21.00 $20,853.00 $18.00 $17,874.00 $38.00 $37,734.00

14 302-0004 354.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $168.00 $59,472.00 $170.00 $60,180.00 $139.00 $49,206.00

15 302-0064 561.00 GAL Tack Coat $5.25 $2,945.25 $6.00 $3,366.00 $7.00 $3,927.00

16 302-0073 719.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M64 Surface Course $160.00 $115,040.00 $190.00 $136,610.00 $139.00 $99,941.00

17 305-0006 5,135.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 2in Depth $8.65 $44,417.75 $16.00 $82,160.00 $9.00 $46,215.00

18 503-0005 1.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $750.00 $750.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00

19 503-0293 1.00 Each Reset Frames $375.00 $375.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00

20 510-0001 38.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $85.00 $3,230.00 $85.00 $3,230.00 $105.00 $3,990.00

21 510-0011 2.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $2,250.00 $4,500.00 $1,500.00 $3,000.00 $3,200.00 $6,400.00

22 511-N0025 120.00 L.F. Reset Fence $35.00 $4,200.00 $30.00 $3,600.00 $50.00 $6,000.00

23 516-0009 580.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.75 $1,595.00 $5.00 $2,900.00 $5.60 $3,248.00

24 522-0001 6.00 Each Test Pits $750.00 $4,500.00 $600.00 $3,600.00 $1,800.00 $10,800.00

25 599-N0003 50,000.00 USD Project Allowances (No-Bid) $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $1.00 $50,000.00

26 599-N0139 130.00 Each Precast Concrete Bin Block (2X2X6) $260.00 $33,800.00 $200.00 $26,000.00 $510.00 $66,300.00

27 705-0021 12.00 Each Planting, American Arborvitae (Thuja Occidentalis) $486.00 $5,832.00 $700.00 $8,400.00 $625.00 $7,500.00

28 2000-N009 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 1 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $56,000.00 $56,000.00 $227,887.00 $227,887.00

29 2000-N025 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $156,000.00 $156,000.00 $144,100.00 $144,100.00

30 2000-N047 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1 $135,000.00 $135,000.00 $138,000.00 $138,000.00 $172,110.00 $172,110.00

31 2000-N053 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2 $146,000.00 $146,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00

32 2000-N054 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 2 $49,000.00 $49,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $115,000.00 $115,000.00

33 2000-N011 1.00 L.S. Building Electric Work - Location No. 3 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $24,000.00 $24,000.00

34 2000-N055 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 3 $74,000.00 $74,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $77,000.00 $77,000.00

35 2000-N056 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 3 $63,966.00 $63,966.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $76,000.00 $76,000.00

36 2000-N029 1.00 L.S. Demolition of Buildings (1) $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00

37 2000-N030 30,000.00 USD NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

$1,524,999.00 $1,571,310.00 $1,833,038.00

BaseLine Item Detail CMS CONSTRUCTION INC. Hall Building Corp.McCauley Construction Co., Inc.
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