New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Contract No. P200.546

J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc. &

Letting Date: 3/30/2021

$3,302,913.13

Page 1 of 2

$3,799,199.00

$3,989,264.50

$4,119,880.00

$4,541,831.00

BaseLine Item Detail Earle Asphalt Company JR Cruz Corp. A. P. Construction, Inc. Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. A Joint Venture Mount Construction Co., Inc. Montana Construction Corp Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $209,400.00 $209,400.00 $315,000.00 $315,000.00 $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $450,000.00 $450,000.00 $260,000.00 $260,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $11,800.00 $11,800.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $23,452.00 $23,452.00

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD  Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $71,000.00 $71,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00

6 202-0002 744.00 CY. Roadway Excavation, Earth $20.00 $14,880.00 $45.00 $33,480.00 $36.00 $26,784.00 $75.00 $55,800.00 $100.00 $74,400.00 $20.00 $14,880.00

7 202-0007 212.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $7.00 $1,484.00 $70.00 $14,840.00 $39.00 $8,268.00 $75.00 $15,900.00 $60.00 $12,720.00 $4.00 $848.00

8 202-0009 25,000.00 USD  Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00 $1.00 $25,000.00

9 203-0001 658.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $20.00 $13,160.00 $50.00 $32,900.00 $58.00 $38,164.00 $75.00 $49,350.00 $50.00 $32,900.00 $78.00 $51,324.00
10 203-0004 180.00 C.Y.  Porous Fill $50.00 $9,000.00 $85.00 $15,300.00 $108.00 $19,440.00 $80.00 $14,400.00 $95.00 $17,100.00 $130.00 $23,400.00
11 203-N0002 430.00 C.Y. Controlled Low Strength Material $80.00 $34,400.00 $215.00 $92,450.00 $175.00 $75,250.00 $170.00 $73,100.00 $155.00 $66,650.00 $165.00 $70,950.00
12 205-0001 570.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $60.00 $34,200.00 $100.00 $57,000.00 $32.00 $18,240.00 $70.00 $39,900.00 $75.00 $42,750.00 $76.00 $43,320.00
13 205-0002 20.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $100.00 $2,000.00 $50.00 $1,000.00 $363.00 $7,260.00 $20.00 $400.00 $105.00 $2,100.00 $190.00 $3,800.00
14 207-0003 23.00 Ton  Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in $135.00 $3,105.00 $250.00 $5,750.00 $511.00 $11,753.00 $100.00 $2,300.00 $130.00 $2,990.00 $320.00 $7,360.00
15 207-0006 189 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $135.00 $25,515.00 $250.00 $47,250.00 $147.00 $27,783.00 $100.00 $18,900.00 $135.00 $25,515.00 $300.00 $56,700.00
16 208-0006 145.00 C.Y. Hay Bales $5.00 $725.00 $100.00 $14,500.00 $12.00 $1,740.00 $25.00 $3,625.00 $10.00 $1,450.00 $51.00 $7,395.00
17 208-0008 2,530.00 L.F. Heavy Duty Silt Fence $9.80 $24,794.00 $5.00 $12,650.00 $14.00 $35,420.00 $9.00 $22,770.00 $6.00 $15,180.00 $7.00 $17,710.00
18 208-0022 12 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $100.00 $1,200.00 $150.00 $1,800.00 $440.00 $5,280.00 $125.00 $1,500.00 $250.00 $3,000.00 $255.00 $3,060.00
19 208-0024 871.00 Ton  Construction Driveway $25.00 $21,775.00 $150.00 $130,650.00 $60.00 $52,260.00 $100.00 $87,100.00 $95.00 $82,745.00 $75.00 $65,325.00
20 208-N0001 2 Each Concrete Washout Facility $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $3,410.00 $6,820.00 $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $3,800.00 $7,600.00
21 208-N0002 30 Each Sediment Control Bags $50.00 $1,500.00 $125.00 $3,750.00 $375.00 $11,250.00 $275.00 $8,250.00 $200.00 $6,000.00 $300.00 $9,000.00
22 208-N0008 1LS. Stream Diversion $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $57,400.00 $57,400.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $213,620.00 $213,620.00 $400,000.00 $400,000.00
23 208-N0009 2 Each Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1 $750.00 $1,500.00 $50.00 $100.00 $273.00 $546.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $525.00 $1,050.00
24 210-0001 1LS. Demolition of Existing Structures $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $48,300.00 $48,300.00 $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $19,905.50 $19,905.50 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
25 401-0003 41.00 C.Y. Concrete in Retaining Wall $1,250.00 $51,250.00 $2,300.00 $94,300.00 $1,540.00 $63,140.00 $2,300.00 $94,300.00 $2,400.00 $98,400.00 $1,500.00 $61,500.00
26 401-0004 8,500.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Galvanized $3.40 $28,900.00 $2.00 $17,000.00 $4.50 $38,250.00 $3.00 $25,500.00 $2.00 $17,000.00 $3.00 $25,500.00
27 401-0032 77 CY. Concrete In Footings $250.00 $19,250.00 $1,000.00 $77,000.00 $1,100.00 $84,700.00 $810.00 $62,370.00 $700.00 $53,900.00 $350.00 $26,950.00
28 401-0067 900 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $3.00 $2,700.00 $2.50 $2,250.00 $6.00 $5,400.00 $2.50 $2,250.00 $2.00 $1,800.00 $3.00 $2,700.00
29 410-0001 82 S.Y.  Damp-proofing $34.00 $2,788.00 $100.00 $8,200.00 $135.00 $11,070.00 $75.00 $6,150.00 $25.00 $2,050.00 $50.00 $4,100.00
30 410-0004 2 8SY. Preformed Sheet Membrane Waterproofing $100.00 $200.00 $200.00 $400.00 $2,900.00 $5,800.00 $250.00 $500.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $600.00 $1,200.00
31 415-0001 300 S.F.  Temporary Sheeting $200.00 $60,000.00 $5.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $45,000.00 $125.00 $37,500.00 $72.00 $21,600.00 $260.00 $78,000.00
32 415-0002 1,900.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place $50.00 $95,000.00 $30.00 $57,000.00 $82.00 $155,800.00 $130.00 $247,000.00 $75.00 $142,500.00 $322.00 $611,800.00
33 416-0003 1,220.00 S.F.  Permanent Steel Sheeting, Type NZ28 $83.16 $101,455.20 $55.00 $67,100.00 $135.00 $164,700.00 $100.00 $122,000.00 $78.00 $95,160.00 $80.00 $97,600.00
34 416-0051 1,160.00 S.F. Protective Coating $12.50 $14,500.00 $38.00 $44,080.00 $33.00 $38,280.00 $20.00 $23,200.00 $11.00 $12,760.00 $11.00 $12,760.00
35 499-N0098 400,000.00 USD  Furnish 66 inch Steel Pipe (No-Bid) $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00 $1.00 $400,000.00
36 502-0004 46 L.F. 18 Inch HDPE Pipe $150.00 $6,900.00 $125.00 $5,750.00 $67.00 $3,082.00 $100.00 $4,600.00 $115.00 $5,290.00 $400.00 $18,400.00
37 502-0027 192.00 L.F. 30 Inch HDPE Pipe $83.00 $15,936.00 $150.00 $28,800.00 $72.00 $13,824.00 $125.00 $24,000.00 $135.00 $25,920.00 $140.00 $26,880.00
38 502-0039 54 L.F. 60 inch Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V $550.00 $29,700.00 $950.00 $51,300.00 $330.00 $17,820.00 $700.00 $37,800.00 $500.00 $27,000.00 $950.00 $51,300.00
39 502-N0021 26 L.F. 66 Inch Steel Pipe Open Cut Installation $266.00 $6,916.00 $1,500.00 $39,000.00 $1,720.00 $44,720.00 $500.00 $13,000.00 $390.00 $10,140.00 $900.00 $23,400.00
40 503-0253 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame $4,000.00 $8,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,900.00 $21,800.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,800.00 $5,600.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00
41 503-N0031 1.00 Each Drainage Box $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $29,400.00 $29,400.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $44,000.00 $44,000.00  $40,000.00 $40,000.00
42 504-0011 15 C.v. Incidental Concrete $500.00 $7,500.00 $1,250.00 $18,750.00 $1,100.00 $16,500.00 $1,700.00 $25,500.00 $1,600.00 $24,000.00 $2,000.00 $30,000.00
43 506-0005 146 L.F.  9in x 16in Concrete Vertical Curb $34.40 $5,022.40 $100.00 $14,600.00 $60.00 $8,760.00 $45.00 $6,570.00 $45.00 $6,570.00 $50.00 $7,300.00
44 514-0001 45 SY. Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick $110.23 $4,960.35 $125.00 $5,625.00 $180.00 $8,100.00 $125.00 $5,625.00 $75.00 $3,375.00 $108.00 $4,860.00
45 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $33,100.00 $33,100.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00  $20,000.00 $20,000.00
46 517-0008 13 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $1,900.00 $24,700.00 $850.00 $11,050.00 $1,530.00 $19,890.00 $2,500.00 $32,500.00 $2,500.00 $32,500.00 $3,000.00 $39,000.00
47 517-0013 15,000.00 USD  Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00
48 522-0001 10 Each Test Pits $100.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,100.00 $21,000.00 $100.00 $1,000.00 $350.00 $3,500.00 $1,000.00 $10,000.00
49 532-0001 350,000.00 USD  Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00 $1.00 $350,000.00
50 534-0006 430 L.F. 66 inch Steel Pipe Trenchless Installation $2,653.49 $1,141,000.70 $2,500.00 $1,075,000.00 $2,720.00 $1,169,600.00 $3,000.00 $1,290,000.00 $3,700.00 $1,591,000.00 $2,600.00 $1,118,000.00
51 599-N0047 150,000.00 USD  Polyurethane Grout (No-Bid) $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00 $1.00 $150,000.00
52 703-0001 2,247.00 S.Y. Topsoil $2.65 $5,954.55 $8.00 $17,976.00 $3.00 $6,741.00 $7.00 $15,729.00 $2.50 $5,617.50 $1.00 $2,247.00
53 704-0001 1,372.00 S.Y.  Seeding, Type A $1.00 $1,372.00 $2.25 $3,087.00 $6.00 $8,232.00 $3.00 $4,116.00 $1.50 $2,058.00 $1.00 $1,372.00
54 704-0002 1,093.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type B $1.00 $1,093.00 $2.00 $2,186.00 $6.50 $7,104.50 $4.00 $4,372.00 $1.50 $1,639.50 $1.00 $1,093.00
55 704-0011 876 S.Y.  Seeding, Type TA $1.00 $876.00 $2.50 $2,190.00 $7.50 $6,570.00 $5.00 $4,380.00 $1.50 $1,314.00 $1.00 $876.00
56 706-0001 2,247.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $4.50 $10,111.50 $5.00 $11,235.00 $9.00 $20,223.00 $9.00 $20,223.00 $4.50 $10,111.50 $4.00 $8,988.00
57 801-0001 1LS. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $31,900.00 $31,900.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00  $65,000.00 $65,000.00
58 803-0032 35,000.00 USD  Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00 $1.00 $35,000.00
59 803-N0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $45,589.43 $45,589.43 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $31,000.00 $31,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00

$4,669,000.00



New Jersey Turnpike Authority

BaselLine Item Detail

Contract No. P200.546

Roman E&G Corp.

Item No.  Unit Code

1 104-0001
2 104-0002
3 107-0001
4 108-0001
5 201-0002
6 202-0002
7 202-0007
8 202-0009
9 203-0001
10 203-0004
11 203-N0002
12 205-0001
13 205-0002
14 207-0003
15 207-0006
16 208-0006
17 208-0008
18 208-0022
19 208-0024
20 208-N0001
21 208-N0002
22 208-N0008
23 208-N0009
24 210-0001
25 401-0003
26 401-0004
27 401-0032
28 401-0067
29 410-0001
30 410-0004
31 415-0001
32 415-0002
33 416-0003
34 416-0051
35 499-N0098
36 502-0004
37 502-0027
38 502-0039
39 502-N0021
40 503-0253
41 503-N0031
42 504-0011
43 506-0005
44 514-0001
45 517-0002
46 517-0008
47 517-0013
48 522-0001
49 532-0001
50 534-0006
51 599-N0047
52 703-0001
53 704-0001
54 704-0002
55 704-0011
56 706-0001
57 801-0001
58 803-0032
59 803-N0001

Qty

1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1.00 L.S.
1,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.
744.00 C.Y.
212.00 C.Y.
25,000.00 USD
658.00 C.Y.
180.00 C.v.
430.00 C.Y.
570.00 C.Y.
20.00 C.Y.
23.00 Ton
189 Ton
145.00 C.Y.
2,530.00 L.F.
12 Each
871.00 Ton
2 Each
30 Each
1LS.
2 Each
1LS.
41.00 C.Y.
8,500.00 LB
77 C.Y.
900 LB
82 S.Y.
2 8SY.
300 S.F.
1,900.00 S.F.
1,220.00 S.F.
1,160.00 S.F.
400,000.00 USD
46 L.F.
192.00 L.F.
54 L.F.
26 L.F.
2.00 Each
1.00 Each
15 C.v.
146 L.F.
45 SY.
1.00 L.S.

13 Mnth

15,000.00 USD
10 Each
350,000.00 USD
430 L.F.
150,000.00 USD
2,247.00 S.Y.
1,372.00 S.Y.
1,093.00 S.Y.
876 S.Y.
2,247.00 S.Y.
1L.S.
35,000.00 USD
1.00 L.S.

Uuom

Description

Construction Layout

Mobilization

Progress Schedule

Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

Clearing and Grubbing

Roadway Excavation, Earth

Stripping Topsoil

Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)
Embankment, Common

Porous Fill

Controlled Low Strength Material
Foundation Excavation

Coarse Aggregate Layer

Riprap Stone Slope Protection, 24in Thick, D50=12in
Riprap Stone Aprons, 24in Thick (D50=12in)
Hay Bales

Heavy Duty Silt Fence

Inlet Filter, Type 2

Construction Driveway

Concrete Washout Facility

Sediment Control Bags

Stream Diversion

Oil-Only Emergency Spill Kit, Type 1
Demolition of Existing Structures

Concrete in Retaining Wall

Reinforcement Steel, Galvanized

Concrete In Footings

Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated
Damp-proofing

Preformed Sheet Membrane Waterproofing
Temporary Sheeting

Temporary Sheeting to Remain in Place
Permanent Steel Sheeting, Type NZ28
Protective Coating

Furnish 66 inch Steel Pipe (No-Bid)

18 Inch HDPE Pipe

30 Inch HDPE Pipe

60 inch Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class V
66 Inch Steel Pipe Open Cut Installation
Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using New Grate and Frame
Drainage Box

Incidental Concrete

9in x 16in Concrete Vertical Curb

Concrete Sidewalk, 4in Thick

Furnish Field Office, Type B

Maintain Field Office, Type B

Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

Test Pits

Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)
66 inch Steel Pipe Trenchless Installation
Polyurethane Grout (No-Bid)

Topsoil

Seeding, Type A

Seeding, Type B

Seeding, Type TA

Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting
Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)
Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways

Unit Price
$20,000.00
$270,000.00
$10,000.00
$1.00
$140,000.00
$35.00
$6.00
$1.00
$13.00
$110.00
$240.00
$17.00
$45.00
$110.00
$42.00
$104.00
$8.00
$170.00
$80.00
$2,100.00
$140.00
$60,000.00
$1,200.00
$25,000.00
$1,500.00
$4.00
$500.00
$3.00
$21.00
$435.00
$200.00
$200.00
$50.00
$35.00
$1.00
$220.00
$90.00
$500.00
$500.00
$1,400.00
$28,000.00
$1,200.00
$25.00
$75.00
$20,000.00
$4,200.00
$1.00
$510.00
$1.00
$4,850.00
$1.00
$4.70
$7.60
$7.00
$3.40
$6.30
$20,000.00
$1.00
$30,000.00

Line Total
$20,000.00
$270,000.00
$10,000.00
$1,000.00
$140,000.00
$26,040.00
$1,272.00
$25,000.00
$8,554.00
$19,800.00
$103,200.00
$9,690.00
$900.00
$2,530.00
$7,938.00
$15,080.00
$20,240.00
$2,040.00
$69,680.00
$4,200.00
$4,200.00
$60,000.00
$2,400.00
$25,000.00
$61,500.00
$34,000.00
$38,500.00
$2,700.00
$1,722.00
$870.00
$60,000.00
$380,000.00
$61,000.00
$40,600.00
$400,000.00
$10,120.00
$17,280.00
$27,000.00
$13,000.00
$2,800.00
$28,000.00
$18,000.00
$3,650.00
$3,375.00
$20,000.00
$54,600.00
$15,000.00
$5,100.00
$350,000.00
$2,085,500.00
$150,000.00
$10,560.90
$10,427.20
$7,651.00
$2,978.40
$14,156.10
$20,000.00
$35,000.00
$30,000.00
$4,863,854.60
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Letting Date: 3/30/2021



