
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.555 Letting Date: 7/21/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 104-0001 1.00 L.S. Construction Layout $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $70,000.00 $70,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $53,122.02 $53,122.02 $90,000.00 $90,000.00

2 104-0002 1.00 L.S. Mobilization $737,654.64 $737,654.64 $649,000.00 $649,000.00 $320,000.00 $320,000.00 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $385,000.00 $385,000.00 $425,000.00 $425,000.00

3 107-0001 1.00 L.S. Progress Schedule $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $11,913.75 $11,913.75 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00

4 108-0001 1,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00 $1.00 $1,000.00

5 201-0002 1.00 L.S. Clearing and Grubbing $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $350,000.00 $350,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $235,000.00 $235,000.00 $265,000.00 $265,000.00

6 202-0002 300.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $30.00 $9,000.00 $60.00 $18,000.00 $75.00 $22,500.00 $50.00 $15,000.00 $71.77 $21,531.00 $42.50 $12,750.00

7 202-0007 4,140.00 C.Y. Stripping Topsoil $14.00 $57,960.00 $15.00 $62,100.00 $15.00 $62,100.00 $15.00 $62,100.00 $19.68 $81,475.20 $17.50 $72,450.00

8 202-0009 60,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $60,000.00

9 203-0001 80.00 C.Y. Embankment, Common $0.01 $0.80 $60.00 $4,800.00 $75.00 $6,000.00 $35.00 $2,800.00 $60.78 $4,862.40 $72.50 $5,800.00

10 203-0002 35.00 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $55.00 $1,925.00 $65.00 $2,275.00 $75.00 $2,625.00 $90.00 $3,150.00 $131.79 $4,612.65 $150.00 $5,250.00

11 206-0003 6,980.00 C.Y. Trench Excavation, Earth $10.00 $69,800.00 $25.00 $174,500.00 $15.00 $104,700.00 $40.00 $279,200.00 $1.00 $6,980.00 $1.00 $6,980.00

12 207-0004 75.00 Ton RipRap Stone Aprons, 12in Thick(D50=6in) $58.00 $4,350.00 $100.00 $7,500.00 $140.00 $10,500.00 $200.00 $15,000.00 $203.65 $15,273.75 $295.00 $22,125.00

13 207-0005 320.00 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 24in Thick (D50=12in) $70.00 $22,400.00 $105.00 $33,600.00 $100.00 $32,000.00 $100.00 $32,000.00 $207.15 $66,288.00 $270.00 $86,400.00

14 207-0010 1,530.00 Ton Riprap Stone Aprons, 36 in Thick, (D50=18 in) $75.00 $114,750.00 $110.00 $168,300.00 $80.00 $122,400.00 $100.00 $153,000.00 $177.00 $270,810.00 $325.00 $497,250.00

15 208-0007 9,965.00 L.F. Silt Fence $5.00 $49,825.00 $6.00 $59,790.00 $7.00 $69,755.00 $6.00 $59,790.00 $4.63 $46,137.95 $12.50 $124,562.50

16 208-0022 80.00 Each Inlet Filter, Type 2 $150.00 $12,000.00 $150.00 $12,000.00 $150.00 $12,000.00 $50.00 $4,000.00 $162.33 $12,986.40 $200.00 $16,000.00

17 208-0024 2,480.00 Ton Construction Driveway $25.00 $62,000.00 $75.00 $186,000.00 $75.00 $186,000.00 $85.00 $210,800.00 $35.00 $86,800.00 $70.00 $173,600.00

18 208-N0001 1.00 Each Concrete Washout Facility $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,750.00 $1,750.00

19 208-N0002 6.00 Each Sediment Control Bags $0.01 $0.06 $900.00 $5,400.00 $799.00 $4,794.00 $200.00 $1,200.00 $2,634.00 $15,804.00 $500.00 $3,000.00

20 211-0001 2,720.00 L.F. Temporary Orange Plastic Fence $5.00 $13,600.00 $7.50 $20,400.00 $8.00 $21,760.00 $6.00 $16,320.00 $3.98 $10,825.60 $6.40 $17,408.00

21 213-0002 505.00 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $35.00 $17,675.00 $40.00 $20,200.00 $75.00 $37,875.00 $60.00 $30,300.00 $59.87 $30,234.35 $60.00 $30,300.00

22 301-0006 170.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 5 In Thick $13.00 $2,210.00 $50.00 $8,500.00 $20.00 $3,400.00 $35.00 $5,950.00 $24.64 $4,188.80 $25.00 $4,250.00

23 302-0002 275.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $125.00 $34,375.00 $105.00 $28,875.00 $146.00 $40,150.00 $125.00 $34,375.00 $143.81 $39,547.75 $150.00 $41,250.00

24 302-0004 40.00 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $125.00 $5,000.00 $230.00 $9,200.00 $132.00 $5,280.00 $225.00 $9,000.00 $223.12 $8,924.80 $125.00 $5,000.00

25 302-0064 180.00 GAL Tack Coat $5.00 $900.00 $4.00 $720.00 $10.00 $1,800.00 $4.00 $720.00 $4.04 $727.20 $3.00 $540.00

26 302-0071 660.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $1.00 $660.00 $4.00 $2,640.00 $1.00 $660.00 $3.50 $2,310.00 $0.97 $640.20 $0.10 $66.00

27 305-0013 1,940.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, 1 Inch Depth $18.00 $34,920.00 $10.00 $19,400.00 $9.00 $17,460.00 $10.00 $19,400.00 $10.90 $21,146.00 $7.50 $14,550.00

28 401-0066 210.00 LB Reinforcement Steel $5.50 $1,155.00 $60.00 $12,600.00 $2.00 $420.00 $1.00 $210.00 $20.20 $4,242.00 $9.00 $1,890.00

29 501-0001 750.00 L.F. 8-Inch Pipe Underdrain $0.01 $7.50 $35.00 $26,250.00 $55.00 $41,250.00 $35.00 $26,250.00 $57.29 $42,967.50 $37.00 $27,750.00

30 502-0004 325.00 L.F. 18 Inch HDPE Pipe $88.00 $28,600.00 $115.00 $37,375.00 $175.00 $56,875.00 $75.00 $24,375.00 $112.95 $36,708.75 $217.50 $70,687.50

31 502-0005 1,535.00 L.F. 15 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $120.00 $184,200.00 $100.00 $153,500.00 $225.00 $345,375.00 $125.00 $191,875.00 $192.36 $295,272.60 $133.00 $204,155.00

32 502-0006 225.00 L.F. 18 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $130.00 $29,250.00 $120.00 $27,000.00 $218.00 $49,050.00 $125.00 $28,125.00 $227.75 $51,243.75 $133.00 $29,925.00

33 502-0009 2,110.00 L.F. 15 Inch HDPE Pipe $70.00 $147,700.00 $82.00 $173,020.00 $172.00 $362,920.00 $75.00 $158,250.00 $150.83 $318,251.30 $107.50 $226,825.00

34 502-0010 630.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $118.00 $74,340.00 $110.00 $69,300.00 $181.00 $114,030.00 $125.00 $78,750.00 $179.46 $113,059.80 $136.00 $85,680.00

35 502-0011 185.00 L.F. 30 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $250.00 $46,250.00 $170.00 $31,450.00 $506.00 $93,610.00 $200.00 $37,000.00 $337.32 $62,404.20 $350.00 $64,750.00

36 502-0018 5.00 Each 15 Inch HDPE Flared End Section $550.00 $2,750.00 $2,800.00 $14,000.00 $855.00 $4,275.00 $200.00 $1,000.00 $2,273.08 $11,365.40 $2,550.00 $12,750.00

37 502-0025 4.00 Each 15-inch Reinforced Concrete Flared End Section $1,300.00 $5,200.00 $3,000.00 $12,000.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 $1,500.00 $6,000.00 $2,278.81 $9,115.24 $2,200.00 $8,800.00

38 502-0026 465.00 L.F. 24 Inch HDPE Pipe $95.00 $44,175.00 $93.00 $43,245.00 $79.00 $36,735.00 $75.00 $34,875.00 $162.95 $75,771.75 $83.50 $38,827.50

39 502-0027 60.00 L.F. 30 Inch HDPE Pipe $125.00 $7,500.00 $145.00 $8,700.00 $196.00 $11,760.00 $125.00 $7,500.00 $194.40 $11,664.00 $141.00 $8,460.00

40 502-0028 1,075.00 L.F. 42 In Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class III $130.00 $139,750.00 $125.00 $134,375.00 $228.00 $245,100.00 $250.00 $268,750.00 $269.93 $290,174.75 $375.00 $403,125.00

41 502-0029 2.00 Each 18 Inch HDPE Flared End Section $800.00 $1,600.00 $2,600.00 $5,200.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $2,257.36 $4,514.72 $1,735.00 $3,470.00

42 502-0030 105.00 L.F. 15 Inch HDPE Pipe, Type C $40.00 $4,200.00 $115.00 $12,075.00 $208.00 $21,840.00 $65.00 $6,825.00 $141.74 $14,882.70 $130.00 $13,650.00

43 502-N0007 80.00 C.Y. Fill Abandoned Pipe $250.00 $20,000.00 $500.00 $40,000.00 $250.00 $20,000.00 $300.00 $24,000.00 $647.30 $51,784.00 $421.00 $33,680.00

44 502-N0010 400.00 L.F. 24 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner $215.00 $86,000.00 $500.00 $200,000.00 $243.00 $97,200.00 $200.00 $80,000.00 $207.05 $82,820.00 $277.00 $110,800.00

45 502-N0011 270.00 L.F. 30 Inch Cured In Place Pipe Liner $360.00 $97,200.00 $500.00 $135,000.00 $300.00 $81,000.00 $340.00 $91,800.00 $227.25 $61,357.50 $477.00 $128,790.00

46 503-0001 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D3 $8,500.00 $8,500.00 $4,200.00 $4,200.00 $5,500.00 $5,500.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $9,860.11 $9,860.11 $4,600.00 $4,600.00

47 503-0003 10.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 $0.01 $0.10 $4,500.00 $45,000.00 $6,000.00 $60,000.00 $5,000.00 $50,000.00 $7,996.53 $79,965.30 $5,815.00 $58,150.00

48 503-0005 50.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D2, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,800.00 $90,000.00 $1,600.00 $80,000.00 $1,500.00 $75,000.00 $2,000.00 $100,000.00 $2,294.28 $114,714.00 $3,080.00 $154,000.00

49 503-0006 3.00 Each Manhole, Type P-2 $12,000.00 $36,000.00 $7,300.00 $21,900.00 $8,500.00 $25,500.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $19,938.17 $59,814.51 $14,000.00 $42,000.00

50 503-0009 1.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $2,300.00 $2,300.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,251.80 $2,251.80 $17,235.00 $17,235.00

51 503-0011 4.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 $8,000.00 $32,000.00 $5,000.00 $20,000.00 $5,800.00 $23,200.00 $10,000.00 $40,000.00 $14,543.15 $58,172.60 $10,400.00 $41,600.00

52 503-0023 1.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type D3, Using Existing Grate And Frame $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,378.05 $2,378.05 $2,350.00 $2,350.00

53 503-0032 3.00 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type P-1, Using Existing Cover And Frame $1,600.00 $4,800.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $1,500.00 $4,500.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,251.80 $6,755.40 $2,050.00 $6,150.00

54 503-0033 1.00 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type F, Using Existing Cover And Frame $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,503.53 $4,503.53 $2,050.00 $2,050.00

55 503-0034 1.00 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type G, Using Existing Cover And Frame $1,600.00 $1,600.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,200.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,503.53 $4,503.53 $4,445.00 $4,445.00

56 503-0035 2.00 Each Reconstructed Manhole, Type H, Using Existing Cover And Frame $1,600.00 $3,200.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,200.00 $4,400.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $4,503.53 $9,007.06 $17,100.00 $34,200.00

57 503-0036 1.00 Each Manhole, Type P-1 Doghouse $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,087.11 $5,087.11 $5,615.00 $5,615.00

58 503-0037 1.00 Each Inlet, Type D2 Modified $11,000.00 $11,000.00 $6,500.00 $6,500.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,919.96 $15,919.96 $15,300.00 $15,300.00

59 503-0293 3.00 Each Reset Frames $750.00 $2,250.00 $1,600.00 $4,800.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $800.00 $2,400.00 $1,492.76 $4,478.28 $430.00 $1,290.00

BaseLine Item Detail C. J. Hesse Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Earle Asphalt CompanyGreen Construction, Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc.D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.555 Letting Date: 7/21/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

BaseLine Item Detail C. J. Hesse Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc. Earle Asphalt CompanyGreen Construction, Inc. Crisdel Group, Inc.D'Annunzio & Sons, Inc.

60 503-N0028 1.00 L.S. Sand Filter System $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $175,000.00 $175,000.00

61 504-0011 11.00 C.Y. Incidental Concrete $2,400.00 $26,400.00 $5,000.00 $55,000.00 $1,800.00 $19,800.00 $1,000.00 $11,000.00 $2,312.18 $25,433.98 $2,520.00 $27,720.00

62 505-0001 460.00 L.F. Asphalt Concrete Lip Curb $20.00 $9,200.00 $40.00 $18,400.00 $20.00 $9,200.00 $20.00 $9,200.00 $25.65 $11,799.00 $15.00 $6,900.00

63 506-0003 225.00 L.F. 9in X 18in Concrete Vertical Curb $35.00 $7,875.00 $80.00 $18,000.00 $75.00 $16,875.00 $75.00 $16,875.00 $84.34 $18,976.50 $55.00 $12,375.00

64 510-0005 100.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $50.00 $5,000.00 $49.00 $4,900.00 $14.00 $1,400.00 $60.00 $6,000.00 $12.12 $1,212.00 $44.00 $4,400.00

65 510-0010 24.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $40.00 $960.00 $41.00 $984.00 $14.00 $336.00 $125.00 $3,000.00 $12.12 $290.88 $36.75 $882.00

66 510-0019 24.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $125.00 $3,000.00 $156.00 $3,744.00 $90.00 $2,160.00 $125.00 $3,000.00 $76.76 $1,842.24 $141.75 $3,402.00

67 516-0008 80.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $6.99 $559.20 $7.00 $560.00 $6.00 $480.00 $7.00 $560.00 $6.06 $484.80 $19.50 $1,560.00

68 516-0009 955.00 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $2.33 $2,225.15 $2.30 $2,196.50 $2.00 $1,910.00 $3.00 $2,865.00 $2.02 $1,929.10 $2.35 $2,244.25

69 516-0012 15.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Epoxy Resin $23.31 $349.65 $23.00 $345.00 $20.00 $300.00 $25.00 $375.00 $20.20 $303.00 $26.25 $393.75

70 516-0013 75.00 S.F. Traffic Markings, Symbols, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $7.92 $594.00 $8.00 $600.00 $7.00 $525.00 $8.00 $600.00 $6.87 $515.25 $10.50 $787.50

71 517-0002 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type B $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $17,500.00 $17,500.00

72 517-0008 7.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type B $1,250.00 $8,750.00 $2,000.00 $14,000.00 $3,000.00 $21,000.00 $3,200.00 $22,400.00 $8,500.00 $59,500.00 $3,500.00 $24,500.00

73 517-0013 30,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00 $1.00 $30,000.00

74 522-0001 35.00 Each Test Pits $400.00 $14,000.00 $500.00 $17,500.00 $1,000.00 $35,000.00 $1,000.00 $35,000.00 $500.00 $17,500.00 $875.00 $30,625.00

75 523-0002 13,610.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 24 in. to 48 in. Diameter $4.20 $57,162.00 $8.00 $108,880.00 $21.00 $285,810.00 $9.50 $129,295.00 $13.19 $179,515.90 $4.70 $63,967.00

76 523-0003 61,530.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter $3.00 $184,590.00 $6.00 $369,180.00 $17.00 $1,046,010.00 $6.50 $399,945.00 $10.63 $654,063.90 $3.10 $190,743.00

77 523-0006 670.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 48 In. To 60 In. Diameter $33.00 $22,110.00 $22.00 $14,740.00 $55.00 $36,850.00 $215.00 $144,050.00 $26.98 $18,076.60 $35.60 $23,852.00

78 523-0021 170.00 L.F. Clean Existing Ditch $185.00 $31,450.00 $36.00 $6,120.00 $20.00 $3,400.00 $50.00 $8,500.00 $44.70 $7,599.00 $14.25 $2,422.50

79 523-N0001 75,755.00 L.F. Video Inspection of Pipes $7.00 $530,285.00 $2.50 $189,387.50 $2.00 $151,510.00 $6.25 $473,468.75 $2.22 $168,176.10 $7.50 $568,162.50

80 524-0008 1.00 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators (Cartridge) $0.01 $0.01 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $2,500.00 $2,500.00 $4,195.12 $4,195.12 $3,000.00 $3,000.00

81 528-0001 2.00 Each Reset Junction Box $4,500.00 $9,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $2,000.00 $4,000.00 $1,922.48 $3,844.96 $1,200.00 $2,400.00

82 531-0001 15,000.00 USD Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00

83 532-0001 250,000.00 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid) $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00

84 703-0001 32,300.00 S.Y. Topsoil $3.00 $96,900.00 $4.00 $129,200.00 $2.00 $64,600.00 $4.50 $145,350.00 $2.00 $64,600.00 $2.20 $71,060.00

85 704-0002 1,545.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type B $1.75 $2,703.75 $2.00 $3,090.00 $2.00 $3,090.00 $2.00 $3,090.00 $1.57 $2,425.65 $1.60 $2,472.00

86 704-0007 24,710.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type Wildflower $2.45 $60,539.50 $2.85 $70,423.50 $3.00 $74,130.00 $2.50 $61,775.00 $2.47 $61,033.70 $2.55 $63,010.50

87 704-0010 6,045.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type Wildflower for Steep Slopes $1.30 $7,858.50 $1.45 $8,765.25 $1.00 $6,045.00 $1.50 $9,067.50 $1.26 $7,616.70 $1.30 $7,858.50

88 706-0001 6,045.00 S.Y. Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting $3.90 $23,575.50 $4.50 $27,202.50 $4.00 $24,180.00 $4.00 $24,180.00 $3.89 $23,515.05 $4.00 $24,180.00

89 706-0002 70.00 S.Y. Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting $7.50 $525.00 $7.50 $525.00 $7.00 $490.00 $7.00 $490.00 $6.57 $459.90 $6.85 $479.50

90 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $190,000.00 $190,000.00 $593,328.87 $593,328.87 $325,000.00 $325,000.00 $880,000.00 $880,000.00 $1,720,486.60 $1,720,486.60 $2,000,000.00 $2,000,000.00

91 801-0007 715.00 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time $136.16 $97,354.40 $130.00 $92,950.00 $75.00 $53,625.00 $100.00 $71,500.00 $1.00 $715.00 $0.01 $7.15

92 801-0009 8.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $8,500.00 $68,000.00 $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $5,000.00 $40,000.00 $7,665.90 $61,327.20 $7,500.00 $60,000.00

93 801-0013 8.00 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $15,000.00 $120,000.00 $25,000.00 $200,000.00 $2,500.00 $20,000.00 $10,000.00 $80,000.00 $1,000.00 $8,000.00 $22,500.00 $180,000.00

94 801-0014 80.00 M.H. Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use $150.00 $12,000.00 $200.00 $16,000.00 $100.00 $8,000.00 $100.00 $8,000.00 $149.89 $11,991.20 $150.00 $12,000.00

95 801-0015 6.00 Each Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators $0.01 $0.06 $10,000.00 $60,000.00 $1.00 $6.00 $4,200.00 $25,200.00 $1,515.00 $9,090.00 $3,000.00 $18,000.00

96 801-0017 18.00 Barr Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators $0.01 $0.18 $2,000.00 $36,000.00 $1.00 $18.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $1,010.80 $18,194.40 $500.00 $9,000.00

97 803-0032 20,000.00 USD Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00

98 803-N0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $240,000.00 $240,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $186,427.48 $186,427.48

$5,774,000.00 $5,858,012.12 $5,875,000.00 $6,277,000.00 $7,118,643.00 $7,972,613.13
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