New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. P200.522 Letting Date: 5/27/2020

BaseLine Item Detail Crisdel Group, Inc. Kyle Conti Construction, LLC PKF-Mark I, Inc. C.J. Hesse
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
1 104-0001 1 LS. Construction Layout $259,755.84 $259,755.84 $357,000.00 $357,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $260,000.00 $260,000.00
2 104-0002 1 LS. Mobilization $1,140,000.00 $1,140,000.00 $2,661,056.00 $2,661,056.00 $2,400,000.00 $2,400,000.00 $970,295.15 $970,295.15
3 107-0001 1.00 LS. Progress Schedule $19,474.00 $19,474.00 $15,000.50 $15,000.50 $7,000.00 $7,000.00 $18,000.00 $18,000.00
4 108-0001 67500 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $67,500.00 $1.00 $67,500.00 $1.00 $67,500.00 $1.00 $67,500.00
5 202-0002 3,500.00 C.Y. Roadway Excavation, Earth $97.63 $341,705.00 $125.00 $437,500.00 $74.00 $259,000.00 $115.00 $402,500.00
6 203-0002 55 C.Y. Embankment, Grade A $157.71 $8,674.05 $50.00 $2,750.00 $140.00 $7,700.00 $160.00 $8,800.00
7 205-0001 4,000.00 C.Y. Foundation Excavation $103.83 $415,320.00 $75.00 $300,000.00 $105.00 $420,000.00 $60.00 $240,000.00
8 205-0002 1,600.00 C.Y. Coarse Aggregate Layer $68.95 $110,320.00 $150.00 $240,000.00 $104.00 $166,400.00 $65.00 $104,000.00
9 208-0007 9,900.00 L.F. Silt Fence $6.44 $63,756.00 $6.00 $59,400.00 $9.00 $89,100.00 $5.00 $49,500.00
10 208-0021 1,950.00 S.F. |Inlet Filter, Type 1 $5.18 $10,101.00 $3.00 $5,850.00 $28.00 $54,600.00 $4.00 $7,800.00
11 299-N0002 105.00 C.Y. Controlled Low Strength Fill Material $275.35 $28,911.75 $175.00 $18,375.00 $205.00 $21,525.00 $260.00 $27,300.00
12 301-0002 7,700.00 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 6in Thick $25.54 $196,658.00 $30.00 $231,000.00 $20.00 $154,000.00 $12.00 $92,400.00
13 301-0003 3500 S.Y. Aggregate Base Course, 12 in Thick $55.22 $193,270.00 $65.00 $227,500.00 $46.00 $161,000.00 $27.00 $94,500.00
14 302-0002 140 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 12.5M76 Surface Course $246.20 $34,468.00 $110.00 $15,400.00 $220.00 $30,800.00 $220.00 $30,800.00
15 302-0004 3200 Ton Hot Mix Asphalt 25M64 Base Course $143.48 $459,136.00 $220.00 $704,000.00 $140.00 $448,000.00 $109.00 $348,800.00
16 302-0063 250,000.00 USD Asphalt Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00 $1.00 $250,000.00
17 302-0064 27000 GAL Tack Coat $4.28 $115,560.00 $4.00 $108,000.00 $4.00 $108,000.00 $3.00 $81,000.00
18 302-0065 27,000.00 L.F. Cleaning Inside Shoulders $0.30 $8,100.00 $2.00 $54,000.00 $0.85 $22,950.00 $1.00 $27,000.00
19 302-0066 27000 L.F. Cleaning Outside Shoulders $0.30 $8,100.00 $2.00 $54,000.00 $0.31 $8,370.00 $1.00 $27,000.00
20 302-0071 1,050.00 L.F. Polymerized Joint Adhesive $0.69 $724.50 $1.00 $1,050.00 $1.70 $1,785.00 $3.00 $3,150.00
21 303-0001 1000 S.Y. Berm Surfacing, 3 Inches Thick $64.20 $64,200.00 $35.00 $35,000.00 $50.00 $50,000.00 $58.00 $58,000.00
22 305-0005 213000 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Fine, 2 Inch Depth $5.24  $1,116,120.00 $5.00  $1,065,000.00 $5.00  $1,065,000.00 $4.75  $1,011,750.00
23 305-0008 5,250.00 S.Y. Pavement Removal, Variable Depth $6.35 $33,337.50 $4.75 $24,937.50 $7.00 $36,750.00 $8.15 $42,787.50
24 306-0001 32000 L.F. Milled Rumble Strip $0.29 $9,280.00 $2.50 $80,000.00 $2.50 $80,000.00 $0.80 $25,600.00
25 309-N0001 26,000.00 Ton Asphalt Rubber Open-Graded Friction Course $155.10 $4,032,600.00 $145.00 $3,770,000.00 $160.00 $4,160,000.00 $144.00 $3,744,000.00
26 401-0032 2100 C.Y. Concrete In Footings $986.01  $2,070,621.00 $950.00  $1,995,000.00 $921.00  $1,934,100.00 $1,165.00  $2,446,500.00
27 401-0069 71,000.00 S.F. Water Repellent Treatment $1.12 $79,520.00 $2.50 $177,500.00 $1.00 $71,000.00 $1.25 $88,750.00
28 401-0070 107,000.00 S.F. Concrete Penetrating Sealer Treatment S1.44 $154,080.00 $2.50 $267,500.00 $1.15 $123,050.00 $2.24 $239,680.00
29 415-0001 9,200.00 S.F. Temporary Sheeting $21.18 $194,856.00 $35.00 $322,000.00 $0.01 $92.00 $35.50 $326,600.00
30 417-0044 340.00 L.F. Joint Replacement, Type 1P $203.07 $69,043.80 $500.00 $170,000.00 $170.00 $57,800.00 $470.00 $159,800.00
31 417-0066 55.00 C.F. Additional 1P Deck Joint Material $754.35 $41,489.25 $200.00 $11,000.00 $155.00 $8,525.00 $210.00 $11,550.00
32 499-N0072 1.00 Each Parapet Extension, Type B $15,622.00 $15,622.00 $32,000.00 $32,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00
33 502-0005 350 L.F. 15in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $163.77 $57,319.50 $210.00 $73,500.00 $175.00 $61,250.00 $100.00 $35,000.00
34 502-0006 85 L.F. 18in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $163.53 $13,900.05 $210.00 $17,850.00 $60.00 $5,100.00 $100.00 $8,500.00
35 502-0007 60 L.F. 12 In Reinforced Concrete Pipe $166.21 $9,972.60 $210.00 $12,600.00 $60.00 $3,600.00 $100.00 $6,000.00
36 502-0010 25.00 L.F. 24 in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Ill $168.19 $4,204.75 $210.00 $5,250.00 $60.00 $1,500.00 $106.68 $2,667.00
37 502-0011 35 L.F. 30in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class Ill $206.25 $7,218.75 $210.00 $7,350.00 $175.00 $6,125.00 $130.00 $4,550.00
38 502-0012 15.00 L.F. 36in Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class llI $271.25 $4,068.75 $210.00 $3,150.00 $200.00 $3,000.00 $140.00 $2,100.00
39 502-N0003 30 L.F. 21 Inch Reinforced Concrete Pipe, Class IlI $182.46 $5,473.80 $210.00 $6,300.00 $60.00 $1,800.00 $100.00 $3,000.00
40 502-N0006 15.00 L.F. 24in Ductile Iron Pipe $300.99 $4,514.85 $210.00 $3,150.00 $175.00 $2,625.00 $214.69 $3,220.35
41 503-0004 30 Each Inlet, Type D4 $5,710.39 $171,311.70 $8,500.00 $255,000.00 $18,000.00 $540,000.00 $5,800.00 $174,000.00
42 503-0293 4 Each Reset Frames $1,442.19 $5,768.76 $1,300.00 $5,200.00 $1,750.00 $7,000.00 $1,000.00 $4,000.00
43 503-N0003 2.00 Each Cleaning Existing Drainage Structures $535.00 $1,070.00 $450.00 $900.00 $500.00 $1,000.00 $300.00 $600.00
44 503-N0014 13 Each Inlet, Type SP-5 $7,758.16 $100,856.08 $8,000.00 $104,000.00 $17,500.00 $227,500.00 $11,500.00 $149,500.00
45 503-N0015 7.00 Each Inlet, Type SP-6 $5,928.78 $41,501.46 $7,500.00 $52,500.00 $17,500.00 $122,500.00 $9,000.00 $63,000.00
46 503-N0016 21 Each Set Inlet Using New GX Casting $2,604.24 $54,689.04 $1,300.00 $27,300.00 $1,750.00 $36,750.00 $5,000.00 $105,000.00
47 503-N0017 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Using New GX Casting $3,086.19 $6,172.38 $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $3,000.00 $6,000.00 $2,300.00 $4,600.00
48 503-N0018 5.00 Each Concrete Collar $3,066.68 $15,333.40 $5,000.00 $25,000.00 $6,500.00 $32,500.00 $1,300.00 $6,500.00
49 503-0028 2.00 Each Reconstructed Inlet, Type G-1, Using Existing Grate and Frame $2,016.19 $4,032.38 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $2,750.00 $5,500.00 $2,050.00 $4,100.00
50 506-0006 525.00 L.F. Concrete Curb, Type C $70.14 $36,823.50 $80.00 $42,000.00 $58.00 $30,450.00 $92.00 $48,300.00
51 508-0007 10,300.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier Removal, Roadway $50.02 $515,206.00 $95.00 $978,500.00 $95.00 $978,500.00 $107.00 $1,102,100.00
52 508-N0005 1,250.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type A $261.62 $327,025.00 $254.00 $317,500.00 $230.00 $287,500.00 $414.00 $517,500.00
53 508-N0006 770 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type B $464.11 $357,364.70 $492.00 $378,840.00 $590.00 $454,300.00 $555.00 $427,350.00
54 508-N0007 110 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type C $531.26 $58,438.60 $680.00 $74,800.00 $550.00 $60,500.00 $745.00 $81,950.00
55 508-N0008 540 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type D $800.60 $432,324.00 $774.00 $417,960.00 $850.00 $459,000.00 $1,004.00 $542,160.00
56 508-N0009 7,200.00 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type E $592.07  $4,262,904.00 $467.00  $3,362,400.00 $430.00  $3,096,000.00 $597.00  $4,298,400.00
57 508-N0010 440 L.F. Concrete Median Barrier, Type F $885.36 $389,558.40 $816.00 $359,040.00 $720.00 $316,800.00 $862.00 $379,280.00
58 510-0001 2,250.00 L.F. Beam Guide Rail $33.17 $74,632.50 $30.00 $67,500.00 $35.00 $78,750.00 $39.00 $87,750.00
59 510-0005 55 L.F. Beam Guide Rail Element $21.40 $1,177.00 $17.00 $935.00 $30.00 $1,650.00 $31.00 $1,705.00
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BaseLine Item Detail Crisdel Group, Inc. Kyle Conti Construction, LLC PKF-Mark I, Inc. C.J. Hesse
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
60 510-0006 420.00 L.F. Raise Beam Guide Rail $10.70 $4,494.00 $17.00 $7,140.00 $15.00 $6,300.00 $15.00 $6,300.00
61 510-0010 32 Each Beam Guide Rail Blockout $32.10 $1,027.20 $22.00 $704.00 $32.00 $1,024.00 $30.00 $960.00
62 510-0011 5 Each Beam Guide Rail Anchorage $1,840.40 $9,202.00 $1,000.00 $5,000.00 $2,700.00 $13,500.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00
63 510-0014 2.00 Each Parapet Connection, Type A $5,660.30 $11,320.60 $2,700.00 $5,400.00 $3,500.00 $7,000.00 $4,000.00 $8,000.00
64 510-0015 3 Each Parapet Connection, Type B $1,165.23 $3,495.69 $550.00 $1,650.00 $3,000.00 $9,000.00 $3,300.00 $9,900.00
65 510-0016 5.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Buried End Terminal $2,642.90 $13,214.50 $2,100.00 $10,500.00 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $3,300.00 $16,500.00
66 510-0017 10 Each Flared Guide Rail Terminal $3,659.40 $36,594.00 $2,600.00 $26,000.00 $3,200.00 $32,000.00 $3,780.00 $37,800.00
67 510-0018 12.00 Each Tangent Guide Rail Terminal $5,050.40 $60,604.80 $3,800.00 $45,600.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00 $4,000.00 $48,000.00
68 510-0019 30.00 Each Beam Guide Rail Post $128.40 $3,852.00 $75.00 $2,250.00 $95.00 $2,850.00 $105.00 $3,150.00
69 510-0031 3,200.00 L.F. Removal of Beam Guide Rail $5.35 $17,120.00 $4.00 $12,800.00 $3.75 $12,000.00 $4.00 $12,800.00
70 515-0002 75.00 Each Delineator, Type CA-Y $107.00 $8,025.00 $70.00 $5,250.00 $80.00 $6,000.00 $94.00 $7,050.00
71 515-0003 5.00 Each Delineator, Type PA-W $107.00 $535.00 $70.00 $350.00 $80.00 $400.00 $94.00 $470.00
72 515-0006 5.00 Each Delineator, Type PA-Y $107.00 $535.00 $70.00 $350.00 $80.00 $400.00 $94.00 $470.00
73 516-0005 220000 L.F. Striping and Marking Removal, Hydromilling $0.64 $140,800.00 $0.65 $143,000.00 $0.80 $176,000.00 $1.40 $308,000.00
74 516-0007 220000 L.F. Temporary Pavement Striping $0.57 $125,400.00 $0.55 $121,000.00 $1.18 $259,600.00 $0.40 $88,000.00
75 516-0009 110000 L.F. Traffic Stripes, Long-Life, Thermoplastic $0.73 $80,300.00 $0.75 $82,500.00 $0.85 $93,500.00 $1.25 $137,500.00
76 517-0003 1.00 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $21,693.15 $21,693.15 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $28,000.00 $28,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
77 517-0009 18 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $2,053.69 $36,966.42 $2,500.00 $45,000.00 $6,500.00 $117,000.00 $1,800.00 $32,400.00
78 517-0013 15,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00
79 522-0001 27 Each Test Pits $1,626.26 $43,909.02 $1,500.00 $40,500.00 $500.00 $13,500.00 $600.00 $16,200.00
80 523-0003 4,600.00 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 12 in. to 24 in. Diameter $6.42 $29,532.00 $3.00 $13,800.00 $8.50 $39,100.00 $6.00 $27,600.00
81 523-0005 1500 L.F. Clean Existing Storm Drain, 27in to 48in Diameter $11.07 $16,605.00 $5.00 $7,500.00 $15.00 $22,500.00 $12.00 $18,000.00
82 524-0008 3 Each Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators (Cartridge) $2,852.35 $8,557.05 $5,000.00 $15,000.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00 $5,800.00 $17,400.00
83 524-0043 3.00 Each Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge), 8 Bays, 24in Wide $30,709.00 $92,127.00 $40,000.00 $120,000.00 $8,500.00 $25,500.00 $13,500.00 $40,500.00
84 524-0044 3 Each Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator (Cartridge) $17,476.67 $52,430.01 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,200.00 $21,600.00 $7,500.00 $22,500.00
85 525-0001 25.00 Each Mile Marker, Type MC $160.50 $4,012.50 $70.00 $1,750.00 $80.00 $2,000.00 $94.00 $2,350.00
86 525-0005 10 Each Mile Marker, Type RP $160.50 $1,605.00 $20.00 $200.00 $80.00 $800.00 $94.00 $940.00
87 525-0006 10.00 Each Mile Marker, Type MP $160.50 $1,605.00 $70.00 $700.00 $80.00 $800.00 $94.00 $940.00
88 530-0001 2,300.00 Each Raised Pavement Markers $29.10 $66,930.00 $30.00 $69,000.00 $26.00 $59,800.00 $33.00 $75,900.00
89 605-0023 36.00 Each In-pavement Wireless Sensor $1,495.86 $53,850.96 $750.00 $27,000.00 $1,125.00 $40,500.00 $1,650.00 $59,400.00
90 703-0001 13,400.00 S.Y. Topsoil $6.15 $82,410.00 $5.00 $67,000.00 $16.00 $214,400.00 $20.00 $268,000.00
91 704-0001 13,400.00 S.Y. Seeding, Type A $1.87 $25,058.00 $1.00 $13,400.00 $11.00 $147,400.00 $2.00 $26,800.00
92 801-0001 1.00 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $879,269.52 $879,269.52 $750,000.00 $750,000.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00 $800,000.00 $800,000.00
93 801-0002 13300 L.F. Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $49.66 $660,478.00 $55.00 $731,500.00 $25.00 $332,500.00 $57.00 $758,100.00
94 801-0003 22000 L.F. Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier $11.81 $259,820.00 $35.00 $770,000.00 $14.00 $308,000.00 $62.00  $1,364,000.00
95 801-0006 1900 M.H. Traffic Protection Patrol, Full-Time $1.00 $1,900.00 $115.00 $218,500.00 $1.00 $1,900.00 $156.00 $296,400.00
96 801-0009 6.00 Each Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign $19,491.12 $116,946.72 $15,000.00 $90,000.00 $6,850.00 $41,100.00 $23,000.00 $138,000.00
97 801-0013 6 Each Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator $1,000.00 $6,000.00 $5,200.00 $31,200.00 $18,000.00 $108,000.00 $50,000.00 $300,000.00
98 803-N0001 1.00 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $2,497,000.00  $2,497,000.00 $270,000.00 $270,000.00
99 500000 USD Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)
532-0001 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00 $1.00 $500,000.00
100 201-0001 1.00 Acre Clearing and Grubbing $282,387.22 $282,387.22 $7,500.00 $7,500.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00
101 213-0002 400 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $73.80 $29,520.00 $35.00 $14,000.00 $108.00 $43,200.00 $30.00 $12,000.00
$22,385,298.00 $24,488,888.00 $24,593,921.00 $25,275,525.00
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