

BaseLine Item Detail				Driscoll Construction Co., Inc.		Kyle Conti Construction, LLC		Conti Enterprises, Inc.		Joseph M. Sanzari, Inc.		Agate Construction Co., Inc.		C. J. Hesse		
Item No	Unit Code	Qty	UOM	Description	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total
119	527-0001		75 Each	Utility Support Hangers	\$500.00	\$37,500.00	\$950.00	\$71,250.00	\$290.00	\$21,750.00	\$1,000.00	\$75,000.00	\$50.00	\$3,750.00	\$1,500.00	\$112,500.00
120	531-0001	30,000.00	USD	Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00
121	532-0001	75,000.00	USD	Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00
122	599-N0001	1	L.S.	Ride Quality Testing for Micro-Milled Deck Surfaces	\$6,200.00	\$6,200.00	\$7,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$5,250.00	\$5,250.00	\$4,500.00	\$4,500.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$12,000.00
123	599-N0002	1,080.00	S.Y.	Micro-Milling Deck Surface	\$21.00	\$22,680.00	\$28.00	\$30,240.00	\$40.00	\$43,200.00	\$24.00	\$25,920.00	\$25.00	\$27,000.00	\$20.00	\$21,600.00
124	599-N0103	1,400.00	L.F.	Transite Duct Removal	\$170.00	\$238,000.00	\$25.00	\$35,000.00	\$110.00	\$154,000.00	\$12.00	\$16,800.00	\$20.00	\$28,000.00	\$45.00	\$63,000.00
125	599-N0116	1.00	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Water (New Jersey American Water)	\$240,000.00	\$240,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$155,000.00	\$155,000.00	\$226,000.00	\$226,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$230,000.00	\$230,000.00
126	599-N0117	1.00	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Gas (Public Service Electric and Gas)	\$230,000.00	\$230,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$344,000.00	\$344,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$260,000.00	\$145,000.00	\$145,000.00
127	599-N0118	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Electric (Public Service Electric and Gas)	\$467,000.00	\$467,000.00	\$490,000.00	\$490,000.00	\$680,000.00	\$680,000.00	\$405,000.00	\$405,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$390,000.00	\$390,000.00
128	599-N0119	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Telecommunications (Verizon)	\$120,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$285,000.00	\$285,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$130,000.00	\$130,000.00	\$410,000.00	\$410,000.00
129	599-N0120	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Fiber Optic (Crown Castle)	\$13,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$60,000.00
130	599-N0121	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Telecommunications (Comcast)	\$13,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$40,000.00
131	599-N0122	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Sanitary Sewer (Cherry Hill Township)	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$160,000.00	\$215,000.00	\$215,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$190,000.00	\$190,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00
132	699-N0010	2.00	Each	Image Detector (Camera)	\$11,800.00	\$23,600.00	\$20,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$6,500.00	\$13,000.00	\$11,000.00	\$22,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$5,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$26,000.00
133	703-0001	6,500.00	S.Y.	Topsoil	\$2.00	\$13,000.00	\$10.00	\$65,000.00	\$8.50	\$55,250.00	\$8.00	\$52,000.00	\$8.00	\$52,000.00	\$4.00	\$26,000.00
134	704-0001	3,150.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type A	\$1.00	\$3,150.00	\$2.00	\$6,300.00	\$1.65	\$5,197.50	\$4.00	\$12,600.00	\$2.00	\$6,300.00	\$0.75	\$2,362.50
135	704-0002	1,490.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type B	\$1.00	\$1,490.00	\$2.00	\$2,980.00	\$1.90	\$2,831.00	\$4.00	\$5,960.00	\$2.50	\$3,725.00	\$0.85	\$1,266.50
136	704-0004	1,850.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type L	\$1.00	\$1,850.00	\$2.00	\$3,700.00	\$2.10	\$3,885.00	\$4.00	\$7,400.00	\$2.50	\$4,625.00	\$1.80	\$3,330.00
137	705-0001	7	Each	Planting, White Pine (Pinus Strobus)	\$821.00	\$5,747.00	\$500.00	\$3,500.00	\$550.00	\$3,850.00	\$1,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$700.00	\$4,900.00	\$360.00	\$2,520.00
138	705-0002	11	Each	Planting, Eastern Red Cedar (Juniperus Virginiana)	\$821.00	\$9,031.00	\$500.00	\$5,500.00	\$550.00	\$6,050.00	\$1,000.00	\$11,000.00	\$700.00	\$7,700.00	\$360.00	\$3,960.00
139	705-0306	3	M.G.	Watering for Planting	\$1,540.00	\$4,620.00	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$550.00	\$1,650.00	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$1,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$1,700.00	\$5,100.00
140	706-0001	1,590.00	S.Y.	Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting	\$6.15	\$9,778.50	\$5.00	\$7,950.00	\$3.85	\$6,121.50	\$7.00	\$11,130.00	\$4.00	\$6,360.00	\$5.00	\$7,950.00
141	706-0002	890	S.Y.	Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting	\$4.10	\$3,649.00	\$5.00	\$4,450.00	\$3.00	\$2,670.00	\$6.00	\$5,340.00	\$4.00	\$3,560.00	\$3.00	\$2,670.00
142	801-0001	1	L.S.	Furnishing Traffic Control Devices	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$155,000.00	\$155,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$25,000.00	\$25,000.00
143	801-0002	3,040.00	L.F.	Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$40.00	\$121,600.00	\$55.00	\$167,200.00	\$48.00	\$145,920.00	\$10.00	\$30,400.00	\$32.00	\$97,280.00	\$65.00	\$197,600.00
144	801-0003	3,040.00	L.F.	Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$40.00	\$121,600.00	\$40.00	\$121,600.00	\$26.00	\$79,040.00	\$85.00	\$258,400.00	\$13.00	\$39,520.00	\$60.00	\$182,400.00
145	801-0004	3,760.00	L.F.	Resetting Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$15.00	\$56,400.00	\$20.00	\$75,200.00	\$8.00	\$30,080.00	\$10.00	\$37,600.00	\$5.00	\$18,800.00	\$50.00	\$188,000.00
146	801-0007	3,125.00	M.H.	Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time	\$25.00	\$78,125.00	\$80.00	\$250,000.00	\$90.00	\$281,250.00	\$95.00	\$296,875.00	\$100.00	\$312,500.00	\$140.00	\$437,500.00
147	801-0009	2	Each	Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign	\$16,000.00	\$32,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$90,000.00	\$12,200.00	\$24,400.00	\$1,500.00	\$3,000.00	\$6,500.00	\$13,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$80,000.00
148	801-0010	3.00	Each	Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$12,000.00	\$36,000.00	\$6,700.00	\$20,100.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$6,500.00	\$19,500.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00
149	801-0011	3	Each	Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator	\$10,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,100.00	\$18,300.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$7,000.00	\$21,000.00
150	801-0013	4	Each	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator	\$45,000.00	\$180,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$60,000.00	\$37,000.00	\$148,000.00	\$14,000.00	\$56,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$120,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$400,000.00
151	801-0014	100	M.H.	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use	\$100.00	\$10,000.00	\$25.00	\$2,500.00	\$105.00	\$10,500.00	\$120.00	\$12,000.00	\$150.00	\$15,000.00	\$200.00	\$20,000.00
152	801-0015	3	Each	Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators	\$16,500.00	\$49,500.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$9,000.00	\$1.00	\$3.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$6,000.00
153	801-0016	1	L.S.	Picking Up and Returning Authority's Traffic Protection Devices	\$1,500.00	\$1,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$2,200.00	\$2,200.00	\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00
154	801-0017	24	Barr	Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators	\$600.00	\$14,400.00	\$425.00	\$10,200.00	\$460.00	\$11,040.00	\$1.00	\$24.00	\$500.00	\$12,000.00	\$500.00	\$12,000.00
155	801-N0001	110	Each	Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing	\$3,000.00	\$330,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$110,000.00	\$2,300.00	\$253,000.00	\$100.00	\$11,000.00	\$2,000.00	\$220,000.00	\$3,000.00	\$330,000.00
156	803-0032	65,000.00	USD	Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00
157	803-N0001	1	L.S.	Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways	\$555,000.00	\$555,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$650,000.00	\$490,000.00	\$490,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$500,000.00	\$210,000.00	\$210,000.00
						\$17,363,209.35		\$17,367,315.00		\$17,968,757.00		\$18,240,000.00		\$19,294,702.45		\$19,569,962.25

BaseLine Item Detail				Carbro Constructors Corp.		South State, Inc.		Ferreira Construction Co. Inc.		IEW Construction Group Inc.		JPC Group, Inc.		
Item No	Unit Code	Qty	UOM	Description	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total	Unit Price	Line Total
119	527-0001		75 Each	Utility Support Hangers	\$500.00	\$37,500.00	\$300.00	\$22,500.00	\$475.00	\$35,625.00	\$771.62	\$57,871.50	\$1,925.00	\$144,375.00
120	531-0001	30,000.00	USD	Force Account for Snow Removal (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00	\$1.00	\$30,000.00
121	532-0001	75,000.00	USD	Force Account for Emergency and Routine Roadway and Bridge Repairs (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00	\$1.00	\$75,000.00
122	599-N0001	1	L.S.	Ride Quality Testing for Micro-Milled Deck Surfaces	\$3,500.00	\$3,500.00	\$6,000.00	\$6,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$30,249.07	\$30,249.07	\$5,750.00	\$5,750.00
123	599-N0002	1,080.00	S.Y.	Micro-Milling Deck Surface	\$28.00	\$30,240.00	\$12.00	\$12,960.00	\$50.00	\$54,000.00	\$41.05	\$44,334.00	\$54.00	\$58,320.00
124	599-N0103	1,400.00	L.F.	Transite Duct Removal	\$27.50	\$38,500.00	\$45.00	\$63,000.00	\$10.00	\$14,000.00	\$155.74	\$218,036.00	\$55.00	\$77,000.00
125	599-N0116	1.00	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Water (New Jersey American Water)	\$301,054.00	\$301,054.00	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$269,455.68	\$269,455.68	\$275,000.00	\$275,000.00
126	599-N0117	1.00	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Gas (Public Service Electric and Gas)	\$245,000.00	\$245,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$450,000.00	\$382,950.84	\$382,950.84	\$375,000.00	\$375,000.00
127	599-N0118	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Electric (Public Service Electric and Gas)	\$460,000.00	\$460,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$400,000.00	\$400,000.00	\$777,749.75	\$777,749.75	\$750,000.00	\$750,000.00
128	599-N0119	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Telecommunications (Verizon)	\$127,000.00	\$127,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$303,826.82	\$303,826.82	\$300,000.00	\$300,000.00
129	599-N0120	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Fiber Optic (Crown Castle)	\$13,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$144,288.41	\$144,288.41	\$140,000.00	\$140,000.00
130	599-N0121	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Telecommunications (Comcast)	\$13,000.00	\$13,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$100,000.00	\$144,288.41	\$144,288.41	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00
131	599-N0122	1	L.S.	Utility Relocation, Sanitary Sewer (Cherry Hill Township)	\$320,000.00	\$320,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$175,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$350,000.00	\$343,322.53	\$343,322.53	\$125,000.00	\$125,000.00
132	699-N0010	2.00	Each	Image Detector (Camera)	\$6,300.00	\$12,600.00	\$20,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$20,364.61	\$40,729.22	\$18,500.00	\$37,000.00
133	703-0001	6,500.00	S.Y.	Topsoil	\$5.00	\$32,500.00	\$3.50	\$22,750.00	\$8.00	\$52,000.00	\$12.32	\$80,080.00	\$10.50	\$68,250.00
134	704-0001	3,150.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type A	\$3.00	\$9,450.00	\$0.75	\$2,362.50	\$1.70	\$5,355.00	\$0.76	\$2,394.00	\$1.00	\$3,150.00
135	704-0002	1,490.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type B	\$3.00	\$4,470.00	\$0.75	\$1,117.50	\$2.00	\$2,980.00	\$0.88	\$1,311.20	\$1.00	\$1,490.00
136	704-0004	1,850.00	S.Y.	Seeding, Type L	\$3.00	\$5,550.00	\$1.50	\$2,775.00	\$2.25	\$4,162.50	\$1.88	\$3,478.00	\$2.00	\$3,700.00
137	705-0001	7	Each	Planting, White Pine (Pinus Strobus)	\$1,040.00	\$7,280.00	\$350.00	\$2,450.00	\$560.00	\$3,920.00	\$381.25	\$2,668.75	\$500.00	\$3,500.00
138	705-0002	11	Each	Planting, Eastern Red Cedar (Juniperus Virginiana)	\$1,040.00	\$11,440.00	\$350.00	\$3,850.00	\$560.00	\$6,160.00	\$381.25	\$4,193.75	\$500.00	\$5,500.00
139	705-0306	3	M.G.	Watering for Planting	\$750.00	\$2,250.00	\$3,500.00	\$10,500.00	\$560.00	\$1,680.00	\$1,759.61	\$5,278.83	\$1,750.00	\$5,250.00
140	706-0001	1,590.00	S.Y.	Permanent Soil Stabilization Matting	\$6.00	\$9,540.00	\$5.00	\$7,950.00	\$4.00	\$6,360.00	\$5.28	\$8,395.20	\$5.00	\$7,950.00
141	706-0002	890	S.Y.	Temporary Soil Stabilization Matting	\$4.00	\$3,560.00	\$3.00	\$2,670.00	\$4.00	\$3,560.00	\$3.23	\$2,874.70	\$3.50	\$3,115.00
142	801-0001	1	L.S.	Furnishing Traffic Control Devices	\$123,000.00	\$123,000.00	\$900,000.00	\$900,000.00	\$220,000.00	\$220,000.00	\$675,000.00	\$675,000.00	\$45,000.00	\$45,000.00
143	801-0002	3,040.00	L.F.	Furnishing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$44.00	\$133,760.00	\$15.00	\$45,600.00	\$10.00	\$30,400.00	\$32.13	\$97,675.20	\$26.50	\$80,560.00
144	801-0003	3,040.00	L.F.	Placing and Removing Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$38.00	\$115,520.00	\$100.00	\$304,000.00	\$35.00	\$106,400.00	\$51.84	\$157,593.60	\$50.00	\$152,000.00
145	801-0004	3,760.00	L.F.	Resetting Precast Concrete Construction Barrier	\$2.00	\$7,520.00	\$20.00	\$75,200.00	\$5.00	\$18,800.00	\$43.21	\$162,469.60	\$35.00	\$131,600.00
146	801-0007	3,125.00	M.H.	Traffic Protection Patrol, Part-Time	\$1.00	\$3,125.00	\$65.00	\$203,125.00	\$0.01	\$31.25	\$86.00	\$268,750.00	\$500.00	\$1,562,500.00
147	801-0009	2	Each	Furnishing Portable Variable Message Sign	\$10,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$10,000.00	\$7,607.64	\$15,215.28	\$9,000.00	\$18,000.00
148	801-0010	3.00	Each	Furnishing Temporary Impact Attenuator	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$15,000.00	\$2,500.00	\$7,500.00	\$11,266.46	\$33,799.38	\$3,650.00	\$10,950.00
149	801-0011	3	Each	Placing and Removing Temporary Impact Attenuator	\$6,500.00	\$19,500.00	\$0.01	\$0.03	\$3,500.00	\$10,500.00	\$3,900.27	\$11,700.81	\$6,000.00	\$18,000.00
150	801-0013	4	Each	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator	\$10,000.00	\$40,000.00	\$5,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$80,000.00	\$18,827.88	\$75,311.52	\$30,000.00	\$120,000.00
151	801-0014	100	M.H.	Furnishing Truck with Mounted Attenuator for Engineer's Use	\$150.00	\$15,000.00	\$150.00	\$15,000.00	\$100.00	\$10,000.00	\$122.07	\$12,207.00	\$165.00	\$16,500.00
152	801-0015	3	Each	Repair Truck Mounted Impact Attenuators	\$10,000.00	\$30,000.00	\$0.01	\$0.03	\$600.00	\$1,800.00	\$0.01	\$0.03	\$3,800.00	\$11,400.00
153	801-0016	1	L.S.	Picking Up and Returning Authority's Traffic Protection Devices	\$2,500.00	\$2,500.00	\$1.00	\$1.00	\$1,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$4,484.15	\$4,484.15	\$15,000.00	\$15,000.00
154	801-0017	24	Barr	Repair Temporary Impact Attenuators	\$250.00	\$6,000.00	\$0.01	\$0.24	\$500.00	\$12,000.00	\$941.64	\$22,599.36	\$225.00	\$5,400.00
155	801-N0001	110	Each	Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing	\$3,900.00	\$429,000.00	\$1.00	\$110.00	\$3,000.00	\$330,000.00	\$2,072.15	\$227,936.50	\$2,615.00	\$287,650.00
156	803-0032	65,000.00	USD	Police Traffic Directors (No-Bid)	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00	\$1.00	\$65,000.00
157	803-N0001	1	L.S.	Maintenance and Protection of Traffic on State, County, and Local Roadways	\$438,000.00	\$438,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$700,000.00	\$700,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$1,000,000.00	\$200,000.00	\$200,000.00
						\$19,917,827.85		\$20,300,121.14		\$20,757,757.00		\$21,185,392.22		\$21,318,949.85