
New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T100.510 Letting Date: 2/25/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $46,000.00

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization $400,000.00 $400,000.00 $860,000.00 $860,000.00 $1,492,084.00 $1,492,084.00 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $570,000.00 $570,000.00 $634,000.00

3 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $18,000.00

4 108-0001 20,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00

5 210-0001 1 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures $439,162.67 $439,162.67 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $167,000.00

6 213-0002 312 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material $80.00 $24,960.00 $75.00 $23,400.00 $180.00 $56,160.00 $100.00 $31,200.00 $0.01 $3.12 $225.00

7 401-0011 390 C.Y. Concrete In Substructure Above Footings $3,000.00 $1,170,000.00 $1,500.00 $585,000.00 $1,100.00 $429,000.00 $2,980.00 $1,162,200.00 $1,155.00 $450,450.00 $1,600.00

8 401-0035 3,940.00 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars $55.00 $216,700.00 $105.00 $413,700.00 $80.00 $315,200.00 $200.00 $788,000.00 $65.00 $256,100.00 $30.00

9 401-0067 43,950.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated $1.00 $43,950.00 $3.00 $131,850.00 $1.50 $65,925.00 $2.50 $109,875.00 $1.75 $76,912.50 $2.00

10 404-0001 1,400.00 LB New Hardware $60.00 $84,000.00 $9.00 $12,600.00 $18.00 $25,200.00 $0.80 $1,120.00 $25.00 $35,000.00 $10.00

11 404-0002 660 LB New Hardware Below MLW $130.00 $85,800.00 $11.00 $7,260.00 $18.00 $11,880.00 $10.00 $6,600.00 $60.00 $39,600.00 $12.00

12 404-0010 7 MFBM Furnish and Place New Plastic Lumber Above MLW $15,000.00 $105,000.00 $30,000.00 $210,000.00 $27,000.00 $189,000.00 $43,000.00 $301,000.00 $13,000.00 $91,000.00 $23,200.00

13 404-0011 2 MFBM Furnish and Place New Plastic Lumber Below MLW $45,000.00 $90,000.00 $42,000.00 $84,000.00 $27,000.00 $54,000.00 $45,000.00 $90,000.00 $56,250.00 $112,500.00 $73,750.00

14 404-N0015 5 Each Type 1 - Typical Pile Top Heart Rot Decay Repair $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $4,000.00 $20,000.00 $2,015.00 $10,075.00 $7,000.00 $35,000.00 $710.00

15 404-N0020 62 L.F. Polymer Structural Wale $450.00 $27,900.00 $250.00 $15,500.00 $750.00 $46,500.00 $520.00 $32,240.00 $715.00 $44,330.00 $110.00

16 404-N0021 215 L.F. Polymer Structural Bracing Member $120.00 $25,800.00 $310.00 $66,650.00 $480.00 $103,200.00 $210.00 $45,150.00 $445.00 $95,675.00 $120.00

17 404-N0024 75,000.00 USD Force Account for Miscellaneous Repairs (No Bid) $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00

18 404-N0025 8 Each Type 8 - Typical Vertical Post Advanced Decay Repair $2,000.00 $16,000.00 $1,500.00 $12,000.00 $6,000.00 $48,000.00 $4,000.00 $32,000.00 $6,300.00 $50,400.00 $2,000.00

19 404-N0026 7 Each Type 9 - Typical Missing Shear Block And Detached Batter Pile Repair $2,000.00 $14,000.00 $1,100.00 $7,700.00 $4,000.00 $28,000.00 $1,700.00 $11,900.00 $4,000.00 $28,000.00 $1,350.00

20 404-N0027 17 Each Type 10 - Typical Detached Battered Pile Repair $575.00 $9,775.00 $1,100.00 $18,700.00 $2,600.00 $44,200.00 $1,800.00 $30,600.00 $13,500.00 $229,500.00 $2,475.00

21 404-N0028 1 Each Type 11 - Timber Ledge Repair $3,500.00 $3,500.00 $700.00 $700.00 $12,300.00 $12,300.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $16,000.00 $16,000.00 $4,000.00

22 404-N0029 110 S.F. FRP Walkway Planks $45.00 $4,950.00 $34.00 $3,740.00 $90.00 $9,900.00 $185.00 $20,350.00 $205.00 $22,550.00 $85.00

23 404-N0031 30 L.F. Reattach Walkway Rail $115.00 $3,450.00 $28.00 $840.00 $235.00 $7,050.00 $90.00 $2,700.00 $460.00 $13,800.00 $100.00

24 418-0024 830 S.F. Substructure Waterproofing $15.00 $12,450.00 $32.00 $26,560.00 $8.00 $6,640.00 $30.00 $24,900.00 $25.00 $20,750.00 $50.00

25 419-N0029 750 L.F. Type 7 - Clustered Pile Tie Repair $15.00 $11,250.00 $45.00 $33,750.00 $68.00 $51,000.00 $35.00 $26,250.00 $115.00 $86,250.00 $26.00

26 499-N0013 2 Each Aluminum Ladder $7,500.00 $15,000.00 $8,000.00 $16,000.00 $11,000.00 $22,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $30,500.00 $61,000.00 $16,000.00

27 499-N0068 4,700.00 S.F. Remove, Store And Reinstall Existing Granite Stone Masonry $262.00 $1,231,400.00 $215.00 $1,010,500.00 $155.00 $728,500.00 $240.00 $1,128,000.00 $250.00 $1,175,000.00 $210.00

28 499-N0069 3,570.00 S.F. Install New Granite Stone Masonry $396.00 $1,413,720.00 $294.00 $1,049,580.00 $355.00 $1,267,350.00 $275.00 $981,750.00 $475.00 $1,695,750.00 $225.00

29 499-N0070 3 Each Cofferdams $550,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $1,160,500.00 $3,481,500.00 $1,175,000.00 $3,525,000.00 $1,290,000.00 $3,870,000.00 $1,436,615.00 $4,309,845.00 $2,098,000.00

30 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $21,000.00 $21,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00

31 517-0009 22 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C $1,200.00 $26,400.00 $3,500.00 $77,000.00 $1,800.00 $39,600.00 $5,000.00 $110,000.00 $2,700.00 $59,400.00 $2,500.00

32 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices $5,000.00 $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $12,000.00 $26,000.00 $26,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $12,000.00

33 801-N0001 18 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing $3,000.00 $54,000.00 $5,200.00 $93,600.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $1,800.00 $32,400.00 $4,885.00 $87,930.00 $5,000.00

34 805-0002 1 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No. 1 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $120,000.00 $120,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00

35 202-0009 20,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid) $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00

36 418-0003 130 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier $400.00 $52,000.00 $160.00 $20,800.00 $55.00 $7,150.00 $500.00 $65,000.00 $335.00 $43,550.00 $450.00

37 418-0011 1,300.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier $300.00 $390,000.00 $68.00 $88,400.00 $35.00 $45,500.00 $455.00 $591,500.00 $325.00 $422,500.00 $340.00

38 517-0013 15,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid) $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00

39 805-0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Marine Traffic $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $1.00 $1.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $910,000.00

40 499-N0076 1 L.S. Identification of Obstructions $55,000.00 $55,000.00 $22,000.00 $22,000.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $12,000.00

41 499-N0077 100,000.00 USD Force Account for Removal of Obstructions (No-Bid) $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00

$7,999,667.67 $8,698,832.00 $9,333,339.00 $10,677,810.00 $10,816,795.62

BaseLine Item Detail Mount Construction Co., Inc. Kyle Conti Construction, LLC Schiavone Construction Co. LLCPKF-Mark III, Inc. Agate Construction Co., Inc.Weeks Marine, Inc.
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New Jersey Turnpike Authority Contract No. T100.510 Letting Date: 2/25/2020

Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description

1 104-0001 1 L.S. Construction Layout

2 104-0002 1 L.S. Mobilization

3 107-0001 1 L.S. Progress Schedule

4 108-0001 20,000.00 USD Fuel Price Adjustment (No-Bid)

5 210-0001 1 L.S. Demolition of Existing Structures

6 213-0002 312 Ton Disposal of Regulated Material

7 401-0011 390 C.Y. Concrete In Substructure Above Footings

8 401-0035 3,940.00 Each Drill and Grout Reinforcement Bars

9 401-0067 43,950.00 LB Reinforcement Steel, Epoxy Coated

10 404-0001 1,400.00 LB New Hardware

11 404-0002 660 LB New Hardware Below MLW

12 404-0010 7 MFBM Furnish and Place New Plastic Lumber Above MLW

13 404-0011 2 MFBM Furnish and Place New Plastic Lumber Below MLW

14 404-N0015 5 Each Type 1 - Typical Pile Top Heart Rot Decay Repair

15 404-N0020 62 L.F. Polymer Structural Wale

16 404-N0021 215 L.F. Polymer Structural Bracing Member

17 404-N0024 75,000.00 USD Force Account for Miscellaneous Repairs (No Bid)

18 404-N0025 8 Each Type 8 - Typical Vertical Post Advanced Decay Repair

19 404-N0026 7 Each Type 9 - Typical Missing Shear Block And Detached Batter Pile Repair

20 404-N0027 17 Each Type 10 - Typical Detached Battered Pile Repair

21 404-N0028 1 Each Type 11 - Timber Ledge Repair

22 404-N0029 110 S.F. FRP Walkway Planks

23 404-N0031 30 L.F. Reattach Walkway Rail

24 418-0024 830 S.F. Substructure Waterproofing

25 419-N0029 750 L.F. Type 7 - Clustered Pile Tie Repair

26 499-N0013 2 Each Aluminum Ladder

27 499-N0068 4,700.00 S.F. Remove, Store And Reinstall Existing Granite Stone Masonry

28 499-N0069 3,570.00 S.F. Install New Granite Stone Masonry

29 499-N0070 3 Each Cofferdams

30 517-0003 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type C

31 517-0009 22 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type C

32 801-0001 1 L.S. Furnishing Traffic Control Devices

33 801-N0001 18 Each Installation, Maintenance, and Removal of Lane Closing

34 805-0002 1 L.S. Marine Transport Engineer to Work Site, No. 1

35 202-0009 20,000.00 USD Environmental Testing for Unsuitable and Excess Materials (No-Bid)

36 418-0003 130 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 2 - Pier

37 418-0011 1,300.00 S.F. Repair Spalled Concrete, Type 1 - Pier

38 517-0013 15,000.00 USD Furnish Office Supplies (No-Bid)

39 805-0001 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Marine Traffic

40 499-N0076 1 L.S. Identification of Obstructions

41 499-N0077 100,000.00 USD Force Account for Removal of Obstructions (No-Bid)

BaseLine Item Detail

Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

$46,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $66,000.00 $66,000.00 $54,160.43 $54,160.43 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $255,000.00 $255,000.00 

$634,000.00 $730,000.00 $730,000.00 $570,000.00 $570,000.00 $1,736,550.00 $1,736,550.00 $770,000.00 $770,000.00 $1,729,700.00 $1,729,700.00 

$18,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $27,500.00 $27,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 

$20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 

$167,000.00 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $93,000.00 $93,000.00 $692,000.00 $692,000.00 $1,900,100.00 $1,900,100.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 

$70,200.00 $200.00 $62,400.00 $610.00 $190,320.00 $30.00 $9,360.00 $450.00 $140,400.00 $160.00 $49,920.00 

$624,000.00 $3,800.00 $1,482,000.00 $6,146.00 $2,396,940.00 $2,509.00 $978,510.00 $2,000.00 $780,000.00 $6,500.00 $2,535,000.00 

$118,200.00 $135.00 $531,900.00 $96.00 $378,240.00 $85.00 $334,900.00 $40.00 $157,600.00 $70.00 $275,800.00 

$87,900.00 $2.50 $109,875.00 $5.00 $219,750.00 $5.00 $219,750.00 $2.50 $109,875.00 $3.20 $140,640.00 

$14,000.00 $70.00 $98,000.00 $17.00 $23,800.00 $5.00 $7,000.00 $175.00 $245,000.00 $225.00 $315,000.00 

$7,920.00 $175.00 $115,500.00 $60.00 $39,600.00 $5.00 $3,300.00 $350.00 $231,000.00 $430.00 $283,800.00 
$162,400.00 $37,500.00 $262,500.00 $23,200.00 $162,400.00 $5,800.00 $40,600.00 $20,000.00 $140,000.00 $11,500.00 $80,500.00 
$147,500.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $16,000.00 $32,000.00 $5,800.00 $11,600.00 $25,000.00 $50,000.00 $45,000.00 $90,000.00 

$3,550.00 $4,400.00 $22,000.00 $2,100.00 $10,500.00 $150.00 $750.00 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $1,700.00 $8,500.00 

$6,820.00 $1,600.00 $99,200.00 $1,100.00 $68,200.00 $250.00 $15,500.00 $350.00 $21,700.00 $1,200.00 $74,400.00 

$25,800.00 $1,000.00 $215,000.00 $260.00 $55,900.00 $25.00 $5,375.00 $350.00 $75,250.00 $460.00 $98,900.00 

$75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 $1.00 $75,000.00 

$16,000.00 $7,000.00 $56,000.00 $4,500.00 $36,000.00 $250.00 $2,000.00 $2,500.00 $20,000.00 $4,750.00 $38,000.00 

$9,450.00 $7,000.00 $49,000.00 $4,700.00 $32,900.00 $375.00 $2,625.00 $2,500.00 $17,500.00 $2,500.00 $17,500.00 

$42,075.00 $7,000.00 $119,000.00 $3,823.00 $64,991.00 $155.00 $2,635.00 $5,000.00 $85,000.00 $4,400.00 $74,800.00 

$4,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $9,600.00 $9,600.00 $17,000.00 $17,000.00 $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00 

$9,350.00 $250.00 $27,500.00 $90.00 $9,900.00 $50.00 $5,500.00 $1,000.00 $110,000.00 $85.00 $9,350.00 

$3,000.00 $150.00 $4,500.00 $216.00 $6,480.00 $50.00 $1,500.00 $600.00 $18,000.00 $115.00 $3,450.00 

$41,500.00 $30.00 $24,900.00 $24.00 $19,920.00 $25.00 $20,750.00 $75.00 $62,250.00 $35.00 $29,050.00 

$19,500.00 $225.00 $168,750.00 $48.00 $36,000.00 $10.00 $7,500.00 $50.00 $37,500.00 $68.00 $51,000.00 

$32,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 $4,200.00 $8,400.00 $47,000.00 $94,000.00 $5,000.00 $10,000.00 $20,000.00 $40,000.00 

$987,000.00 $335.00 $1,574,500.00 $519.00 $2,439,300.00 $384.00 $1,804,800.00 $240.00 $1,128,000.00 $400.00 $1,880,000.00 

$803,250.00 $560.00 $1,999,200.00 $630.00 $2,249,100.00 $630.00 $2,249,100.00 $325.00 $1,160,250.00 $500.00 $1,785,000.00 

$6,294,000.00 $1,645,000.00 $4,935,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $3,600,000.00 $1,727,000.00 $5,181,000.00 $2,100,000.00 $6,300,000.00 $1,920,000.00 $5,760,000.00 

$50,000.00 $35,000.00 $35,000.00 $126,000.00 $126,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 

$55,000.00 $1,600.00 $35,200.00 $2,600.00 $57,200.00 $3,750.00 $82,500.00 $3,400.00 $74,800.00 $9,700.00 $213,400.00 

$12,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 $200,000.00 $200,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 

$90,000.00 $7,500.00 $135,000.00 $50.00 $900.00 $500.00 $9,000.00 $1,000.00 $18,000.00 $5,875.00 $105,750.00 

$50,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $160,000.00 $160,000.00 

$20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 $1.00 $20,000.00 

$58,500.00 $370.00 $48,100.00 $1,200.00 $156,000.00 $300.00 $39,000.00 $500.00 $65,000.00 $515.00 $66,950.00 

$442,000.00 $275.00 $357,500.00 $480.00 $624,000.00 $235.00 $305,500.00 $250.00 $325,000.00 $325.00 $422,500.00 

$15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 $1.00 $15,000.00 

$910,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 

$12,000.00 $65,000.00 $65,000.00 $90,000.00 $90,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 

$100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 $1.00 $100,000.00 

$12,303,915.00 $13,987,525.00 $14,354,341.00 $14,598,765.43 $14,882,225.00 $17,298,910.00

ANSELMI DECICCO, INC. George Harms Construction Co., Inc.Schiavone Construction Co. LLC Railroad Construction Co., Inc. Northeast Remsco Construction, Inc. J. Fletcher Creamer & Son, Inc.
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