New Jersey Turnpike Authority

Contract No. T500.358

Base Line Item Detail Dobco Inc. A. P. Construction, Inc.
Item No. Unit Code Qty UOM Description Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

1 1DO1LAY 1 L.S. Construction Layout $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $140,000.00 $140,000.00
2 1D10MOB 1 L.S. Mobilization $2,500,000.00 $2,500,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00
3 1F00002 1 L.S. NJDCA Construction Permit Allowance (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
4 1GSCHOB 1 L.S. Progress Schedule (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
5 4E00063 9,000.00 L.F. Driving HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $1.00 $9,000.00 $10.00 $90,000.00
6 4E00064 9,000.00 L.F. Furnishing HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $31.00 $279,000.00 $30.00 $270,000.00
7 4E00065 200 L.F. HP 10 X 57 Test Piles $150.00 $30,000.00 $140.00 $28,000.00
8 4E00066 40 Each Point Reinforcement for HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $2,500.00 $100,000.00 $120.00 $4,800.00
9 4E01EDP 1 L.S. Furnishing Equipment for Driving Piles $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $60,000.00 $60,000.00
10 4EQ1PLT 2 Each Dynamic Pile Load Tests $2,500.00 $5,000.00 $12,000.00 $24,000.00
11 4E00113 40.00 Each Splices for HP 10 X 57 Steel Piles $1.00 $40.00 $240.00 $9,600.00
12 5Q00006 1 L.S. Modular Trailer and Accessories - Location No. 1 $150,000.00 $150,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00
13 5Q00007 1 L.S. Modular Trailer and Accessories - Location No. 3 $275,000.00 $275,000.00 $95,000.00 $95,000.00
14 5Q01FOE 1 Unit Furnish Field Office, Type E $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $85,000.00 $85,000.00
15 5Q02MFD 12 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type D $500.00 $6,000.00 $3,500.00 $42,000.00
16 5Q02MFE 50.00 Mnth Maintain Field Office, Type E $500.00 $25,000.00 $1,500.00 $75,000.00
18 9A00210 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Contractor Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 2 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $166,000.00 $166,000.00
19 9A00324 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Contractor Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 3 $165,000.00 $165,000.00 $259,000.00 $259,000.00
20 9A00211 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 1 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $173,000.00 $173,000.00
21 9A00212 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 2 $436,088.00 $436,088.00 $165,000.00 $165,000.00
22 9A00322 1 L.S. Building Equipment - Owner Furnished Contractor Installed - Location No. 3 $162,636.00 $162,636.00 $440,000.00 $440,000.00
23 9A00190 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,380,000.00 $1,380,000.00 $375,000.00 $375,000.00
24 9A00191 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 1, Building A $1,296,300.00 $1,296,300.00 $2,068,000.00 $2,068,000.00
25 9A00192 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $30,000.00 $30,000.00 $30,235.00 $30,235.00
26 9A00193 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 1, Building A $85,000.00 $85,000.00 $117,000.00 $117,000.00
27 9A00202 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2, Building A $5,700,000.00 $5,700,000.00 $5,564,000.00 $5,564,000.00
28 9A00223 1.00 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 2, Building A $3,565,000.00 $3,565,000.00 $3,149,000.00 $3,149,000.00
29 9A00214 1 L.S. Building Mechanicall Work - Location No. 2, Building A $2,350,000.00 $2,350,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $2,700,000.00
30 9A00206 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 2, Building A $2,400,000.00 $2,400,000.00 $3,200,000.00 $3,200,000.00
31 9A00217 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 2, Building A $1,300,000.00 $1,300,000.00 $1,117,000.00 $1,117,000.00
32 9A00203 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2, Building B $225,000.00 $225,000.00 $600,000.00 $600,000.00
33 9A00215 1 L.S. Building Mechanicall Work - Location No. 2, Building B $115,000.00 $115,000.00 $5,850.00 $5,850.00
34 9A00207 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 2, Building B $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $27,172.00 $27,172.00
35 9A00326 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 2, Building B $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $14,054.00 $14,054.00
36 9A00204 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 2, Building C $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $11,712.00 $11,712.00
37 9A00208 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 2, Building C $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $12,500.00 $12,500.00
38 9A00327 1.00 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 3, Building A $3,300,000.00 $3,300,000.00 $3,250,000.00 $3,250,000.00
39 9A00328 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 3, Building A $2,519,318.00 $2,519,318.00 $2,045,000.00 $2,045,000.00
40 9A00329 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3, Building A $1,650,000.00 $1,650,000.00 $2,700,000.00 $2,700,000.00
41 9A00330 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 3, Building A $1,795,000.00 $1,795,000.00 $2,325,000.00 $2,325,000.00
42 9A00331 1 L.S. Building Plumbing Work - Location No. 3, Building A $950,000.00 $950,000.00 $817,000.00 $817,000.00
43 9A00332 1 L.S. Building Architectural Work - Location No. 3, Building B $1,800,000.00 $1,800,000.00 $517,980.00 $517,980.00
44 9A00333 1 L.S. Building Structural Work - Location No. 3, Building B $1,625,000.00 $1,625,000.00 $2,625,000.00 $2,625,000.00
45 9A00334 1 L.S. Building Mechanical Work - Location No. 3, Building B $45,000.00 $45,000.00 $30,235.00 $30,235.00
46 9A00335 1 L.S. Building Electrical Work - Location No. 3, Building B $125,000.00 $125,000.00 $102,705.00 $102,705.00
47 9A00266 1 C.P. Force Account For Building Work Allowances (NO-BID) $2,300,000.00 $2,300,000.00 $2,300,000.00 $2,300,000.00
48 9A00336 1 L.S. SITE WORK - Location No. 1 $1,250,000.00 $1,250,000.00 $3,126,000.00 $3,126,000.00
49 9A00337 1 L.S. SITE WORK - Location No. 2 $4,650,000.00 $4,650,000.00 $4,329,864.00 $4,329,864.00
50 9A00338 1 L.S. SITE WORK - Location No. 3 $6,450,000.00 $6,450,000.00 $4,950,892.00 $4,950,892.00
51 2MTSWO0B 50 Each Testing of Soils for Waste Classification (NO-BID) $500.00 $25,000.00 $500.00 $25,000.00
52 5200018 12,000.00 Ton Off-Site Disposal of ID-27 Waste $70.00 $840,000.00 $50.00 $600,000.00
53 5Z0OFAHOB 1 C.P. Force Account for Hazardous Regulated Material Handling (NO-BID) $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00 $100,000.00
54 5Z0OROA0B 1 L.S. Removal of Asbestos (NO-BID) $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00 $75,000.00
55 5200186 1 L.S. Universal Waste Removal (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00
56 5Z1.0388 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work - Location No. 1 $500,000.00 $500,000.00 $720,000.00 $720,000.00
57 5Z1.0389 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work - Location No. 2 $845,000.00 $845,000.00 $1,000,000.00 $1,000,000.00
58 5ZL.0399 1 L.S. Site Electrical Work - Location No. 3 $1,200,000.00 $1,200,000.00 $1,500,000.00 $1,500,000.00
59 5Z1.0294 3,750.00 L.F. 3" PVC Sanitary Force Main $150.00 $562,500.00 $70.00 $262,500.00
60 5200043 400 L.F. Horizontal Directional Drilling $250.00 $100,000.00 $200.00 $80,000.00
61 5Z1.0400 1 L.S. GROUND IMPROVEMENTS, UNCLASSIFIED - Location No. 1 $210,000.00 $210,000.00 $250,000.00 $250,000.00
62 5710401 1 L.S. GROUND IMPROVEMENTS, UNCLASSIFIED - Location No. 3 $250,000.00 $250,000.00 $305,000.00 $305,000.00
63 8B31MPT 1 L.S. Maintenance and Protection of Traffic $47,500.00 $47,500.00 $30,000.00 $30,000.00
64 1HFPOB 1 L.S. Fuel Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $50,000.00
65 3BAPAOB 1 L.S. Asphalt Price Adjustment (NO-BID) $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $20,000.00
66 5Q01FOD 1 L.S. Furnish Field Office, Type D $20,000.00 $20,000.00 $87,000.00 $87,000.00
67 8CPTDOB 1 L.S. Police Traffic Directors (NO-BID) $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00 $25,000.00

Base Total $56,893,382.00 $57,437,099.00
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Bid Date: November 17, 2015




